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~ Lehman Jackson 
‘School at 7:30 a.m. and return 
approximately 9 p.m. Dinner will be 
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“Trips 
  

LEHMAN CADETTE TROOP 706 
“will hold a trip to Vanity Fair on 
August 6. The bus will leave the 

Elementary 

at Lieby’s at your own cost. Cost is 
$15.00, no refunds. Reservations 
must be made by July 26 and check 
must accompany reservation. 
Please send check and reservations 
‘to Charlene Cook, Box 22, Lehman 
Center, Lehman, Pa. 18627. For 
"information call 675-5700. 

The proceeds of this trip will go 
towards the troops’ future trip to 
Georgia. 

COLLEGE MISERICORDIA is 
sponsoring a trip to England and 
Scotland from Sunday, July 21 
through Sunday, August 3. 

While visiting the two countries, 
the travelers will have the opportun- 
ity to see the Changing of the Guard 
at Buckingham Palace, visit West- 
minster Abbey, Big Ben, Edin- 
burgh, Scotland and travel to the 
Loch Ness, in addition to other 
planned tours. Participants will also 
have free time in which to view the 
sights at their own pace. 

. The travel guide is Dr. Donald 
Fries, associate professor of 
English history at College Miseri- 
cordia. He was awarded his docto- 
rate in English history with a spe- 
cialization in the Tudor period from 
Michigan State University. Fries, 

the college’s 1985 Teacher of the 
Year, has lived and studied in 
London. He has also traveled exten- 
sively throughout both England and 
Scotland. 

The cost of the 14 day trip 
includes round trip ground and air 
transportation throughout Britain, 
cost and entry fees, accommoda- 
tions and breakfasts. 

For additional information con- 
tact the College Misericordia Office 
of Special Programs t 675-2181. 

  

Clinics 
  

NESBITT MEMORIAL HOSPI- 
TAL is sponsoring an Arthritis 
Clinic on Wednesday, July 10 from 
11 a.m. to 2 p.m. in the hospital's 
Medical Arts Building. 

Dr. John Carey, a specialist in 
arthritis and rheumatology, con- 
ducts the program which provides 
arthritis patients with a complete 
physical examination and treatment 
plan. The results are forwarded to 
the patient’s physician for consulta- 
tion input and followup care. 

Patients requiring orthopedic or 
corrective surgery or extensive 
physical therapy are tested with a 
multidisciplinary approach known 
as CORE (Combined Orthopedic 
and Rheumatologic Evaluation). 

Patients, referred by their physi- 
cian, must make an appointment 
with the Arthritis Clinic by calling 
Nesbitt’s Outpatient Registration 
office at 288-1411, extension 4130, 
Monday through Friday, from 1 to 4 
p.m. 

  

Courses 
  

THOMAS F. FEENEY, Principal, 
West Side Area Vocational-Techni- 
cal School announces there are still 
shop openings available for students 
who have completed eighth, ninth, 
tenth or eleventh grade in the send- 
ing districts of Northwest, Lake- 
Lehman, Dallas, Wyoming Area, 
and Wyoming Valley West. 
Any student interested in enroll- 

ing in one of these courses at West 
~ Side Tech should come to West Side 

  Tech with a copy of their most 
recent report card, and one of their 

arents or guardians in order to 
~ enroll. Students are advised that 
they will be enrolled on a first come 
first served basis. 

he courses in which there are 
: openings are as follows: Distribu- 

tive Education, Electronics, Food 
i Service, Machine Shop, Fashions, 

Sheetmetal, Upholstery and Plumb- 
ing. 

Interested parents and students 
may obtain further informatin by 
either reporting to the school, or 
calling the school between the hours 
of 7:45 a.m. and 2:45 p.m. 

PARENTS - Do your children 
know how to swim? The American 

~ Red Cross, Wyoming Valley Chap- 
ter will be offering Learn to Swim 
Classes at Warden Place at Harveys 
Lake during Aug. 19-23. 

~ Children ages 6-16 are eligible. 
There is a $10 fee per students. 

To pre-register call Safety Serv- 
ices at 823-7161. 

* JACUZZI PUMP & FILTER 
1! *LADDER/BFT.FIBERGLASS BOARD 
| “CONCRETE FOOTER°HARD BOTTOM 
*VINYL LINER°MUCH,MUCH MORE! 

YAN ANF MTEC « 
DISCOUNT POOL STORE 

Community Calendar 
COLLEGE MISERICORDIA will 

offer a non-credit course in creativ 
dramatics for children, age 7 to 12, 
on Tuesday, July 16 and Tuesday, 
July 23, from 6:30 to 8:30 p.m. 

Instructor Diane Polachek, Kings- 
ton, has worked at the Kingston 
Recreation Department as a crea- 
tive dramatics instructor. She will 
also be teaching creative dramatics 
at College Misericordia’s upcoming 
program for gifted children, ‘‘Crea- 
tive Competitions.”” Polachek holds 
masters’ degrees in both education 
and French. She is employed at 
Wyoming Seminary Lower School, 
Forty Fort, as a French teacher. 

For information or a free bro- 
chure detailing non-credit classes 
for adults and children contact the 
College Misericordia Office'of Spe- 
cial Programs, at 675-2181, exten- 
sion 331. 

  

Screenings 
  

FREE HEARING SCREENINGS 
for the general public will be 
offered on Thursday, July 11, from 9 
a.m. to 4:30 p.m. at the following 
Geisinger sites: Geisinger Medical 
Group in Wilkes-Barre, 1010 East 

Mountain Drive; Geisinger Family 
Health Center- Dallas, Dallas Shop- 
ping Center, Rte. 309; Geisinger 
Family Health Center in Mountain- 
top, Weis Plaza; and the Geisinger 
Family Practice - Pocono, Rte. 940, 

White Haven. 
This simple, five-minute proce- 

dure will indicate whether or not the 
individual requires further testing, 
No appointments are necessary for 
this free hearing screening, which is 
being offered as a public service by 
the above Geisinger affiliates. 

  

Meetings 
  

THE LAKE-LEHMAN BAND 
SPONSORS will meet Monday, July 
15, at 7 p.m. in the Lake-Lehman 
High School. 

THE WILKES-BARRE PRON- 
AOS, AMORC will not be having its 
regularly scheduled meeting on 
Thursday, July 4. Instead, the meet- 
ing will be moved back one week to 
Thursday, July 11. Meeting time 
and place will remain the same 
however. If there are any problems 
with re-scheduling, please contct the 
Pronaos Secretary, at P.O. Box 
2535, Wilkes-Barre, Pa. 18703-2535. 

SHARE (Source of Help in Airing 
and Resolving Experiences) of 
Mercy Hospital in Wilkes-Barre, 
will meet Monday, July 15 at 11 
a.m. and Tuesday, July 16 at 7 p.m. 
at the Melan House, 195 Hanover 
St., Wilkes-Barre. SHARE is a self- 
help support group for parents who 
have lost a child through miscar- 
riage, ectopic pregnancy, stillbirth, 
or early infant death (babies who 
never came home). The service is 
free to anyone in the community 
who has lost a child these means, 
regardless of marital status, race, 
creed, or hospital affiliation. 

Baby sitting service will be avail- 
able for both meetings. Reserva- 
tions are requested, to ensure ade- 
quate preparations for parents 
needs, but are not required for 
attendance. 

Interested parents may call 
Judith Nowak, R.N., Facilitator at 
735-4693 or Mercy Hospital Office of 
Volunteers-Auxiliary at 826-3682. 

VETERANS OF THE VIETNAM 
WAR, Post 2, will meet Thursday, 
July 11 at 8 p.m. at the Coral 
Lounge, 245 Owen St., Swoyersville. 
There will be a film and refresh- 
ments served. 

The Veterans of the Vietnam War, 
Inc. is a full service organization 
open to all veterans. 

  

Lectures 
  

THE WILKES-BARRE PRON- 
AOS, AMORC would like to remind 
all members that Regional Monitor 
Terry Unger, F.R.C., of Allentown, 
will be visiting the Wilkes-Barre 
Pronaos on Thursday, July 11 to 
deliver a special discource to the 
Pronaos. All members are urged to 
attend this special meeting to meet 
the Regional Monitor and to hear 
the special discource. It is unusual 
for Regional Monitors to address 
affiliated bodies in this fashion. 
Convocation will begin promptly at 
7:30 in the Crest Room of Gus 
Genetti’s Best Western Motor Inn, 
Wilkes-Barre, Pa. Please bring 
active membership credentials. 

vy Dick Mackey 
THIS AREA'S HIGHEST QUALITY INSTALLED 

“IN GROUND” POOL DEAL 

[SUPER STEEL WALL/25YR.WARR. 

16X32 OPEN 7 DAYS 

  
Houle 8 11 (Next to Raies) 

In Chinchilla 

  

  

Church 

THE SHAVERTOWN UNITED 
METHODIST CHURCH, 163 N. 
Pioneer Ave., Shavertown, 
announces the following schedule: 

  

Wednesday, July 10, 10:00 Lec- 
tionary; Thursday, July 11, 7:30, 
Pastor-Parish Relations; Sunday, 
July 14, 10 a.m. Worship; Monday, 
July 15, 5:00, District Ministers 
(Picnic at Frances Slocum Park); 
Tuesday, July 16, 7:30, Adult Forum 
Planning Committee. 

  

Theater 
  

WINNER OF THREE TONY 
AWARDS in 1980, the colorful circus 
musical “Barnum,” will roar into 
Mountainthome at the Pocono Play- 
house July 9 through July 14. 

With ingenuity that rarely flags, 
the show treats the episodes in P.T. 
Barnum’s life as though they were 
circus acts, even though most of 
them deal with the: relationship 
between the impressario and his 
wife, Chairy. A ringmaster grandi- 
loquently announces each chapter in 
Barnum’s story-from his early 
assembling of fraudulent sideshow 
attractions to his partnership with 
circus man James A. Bailey. 

All tickets at Pocono Playhouse 
range from just $10 to $14. There 
are 9 performances per week. Tues- 
day, Wednesday, Thursday and 
Friday at 8:30 p.m. Saturday at 5 & 
9 p.m. Sunday at 6 p.m. Matinees 
Wednesday and Thursday at 2 p.m. 
Call the box office in Mountain- 
thome, PA for further information 
and convenient ticket reservations 
(717) 595-7456. 

ON JULY 12, The Music Box 
opens a three week run of the 
Broadway musical, ‘Man of La 
Mancha” starring T. Doyle Leverett 
in the dual role of Miguel Cervantes 
and his literary creation, Don Quix- 
ote. Leverett effectively brings to 
life the character of Quixote - the ill 
and aged knight who in the midst of 
ugliness and cruelty maintains the 
capacity to dream of good. No 
where is this more poignantly 
expressed than in Leverett’s rendi- 
tion of the stirring hit song from the 
musical, “The Impossible Dream.” 
Performances are July 12-14, July 

18-21 and July 25-28. For reserva- 
tions call 283-2195. 

  

Classes 
  

NESBITT MEMORIAL HOSPI- 
TAL is offering babysitting classes 
for teenagers ages 12 to 16, on 
consecutive Wednesdays beginning 
Aug. 7 and continuing Aug. 14, 21, 
and 28 from 10 a.m. to 11 a.m. in the 
classroom of the Nesbitt Medical 
Arts Building, 534 Wyoming Ave., 
Kingston. 

Teens participating in the course 
will be taught the qualifications 
necessary for good babysitting 
which include the responsibilities of 
the babysitter and the parents. Stu- 
.dents will learn the proper tech- 
niques for the care of infants and 
small children. 

The classes also include the teach- 
ing of basic life measures used in 
emergency situations such as chok- 
ing or breathing difficulty. The 
babysitting course includes a signif- 
icant amount of basic first aid 
instruction that will prove useful 
during minor mishaps. 

Class members who attend all 
four sessions will be awarded a 
certificate of attendance. The free 
program is provided as a commu- 
nity service to area teens. To regis- 
ter or for more information, contact 
the Hospital Education Department 
at 288-1411, ext. 4035. 
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GRADE SCHOOL KARATE 
CLASSES are now being offered at 
the Wilkes-Barre YMCA on Mon- 
days from 4:30 to 5:30 p.m. Classes 
begin July 8 and end August 26. 
Class is limited to 12 so enroll now. 
For further information call the 
“Y”’ at 823-2191. 

  

Programs 
  

THE “LITTLE BEAVERS,” a 
pre-school program for children 
between the ages of three to five, 
are now forming classes at the W-B 
YMCA for July 16, 23, Aug. 6, 13 and 
20th. 

Classesswill be held on Tuesdays, 
Wednesdays and Thursdays from 10 
a.m. until 2 p.m. 

Activities include swimming les- 
sons, gym activities, learning and 
lunch time. 

For information, call W-B YMCA 
at 823-2191. 

THE GREATER WILKES- 
BARRE FAMILY YMCA is now 
accepting registration for summer 
camp programs held at Camp 
Kresge, Wilkes-Barre YMCA'’s Resi- 
dent Camp in the Poconos. 
Camp Kresge is a 1000 acre camp- 

site located just 17 miles from 
downtown Wilkes-Barre. The camp 
has a 30 acre lake, baseball field, 
volleyball court, canoes, sailboats 
and playacks along with various 
other recreational equipment. 

The Resident Camp program a 
four week session will run weekly 
from mid July to Aug. 23rd. This 
program is designed for children 
grades second to eighth. 

The Resident Camp along with the 
Day Camp will be offered for boys 
and girls. 

For more information on these 
camping programs call 823-2191. 

AREA RESIDENTS INTER- 
ESTED in careers in dietetics will 
benefit by two new programs which 
will be offered by Luzerne County 
Community College this fall. 
The Dietetic Assistant-Dietary 

Manager Program, a one-year cer- 
tificate program, is approved by the 
Dietary Managers Association and 
designed to prepare individuals to 
assist professionals and manage- 
ment personnel in the delivery of 
nutritional care and food service. 
Graduates of the Dietetic Assist- 

ant-Dietary Manager curriculum 
will have a choice of career oppor- 
tunities in hospitals, in nursing 
homes where many serve as dietary 
managers under the direction of a 
Registered Dietitian and in school 
lunch programs. 

The two year Dietetic Technician 
Program leading to an Associate in 
Applied Science Degree is approved 
by the American Dietetic Associa- 
tion and designed to prepare gradu- 
ates for either Nutritional Care of 
Food Systems Management. 

Careers are available in health 
fields where graduates serve as 
members of dietetic teams under 
the supervision of a Registered Die- 
titian. 

Students enrolled in the dietetic 
programs will have the opportunity 
to apply classroom instruction to a 
clinical situation through supervised 
field experience at area hospitals 
and long-term care facilities. 
Upon successful completion of 

either program, graduates are eligi- 
ble to take the certification test, 
which is administered by the Die- 
tary Managers Association for the 
assistant and manager program, 
and the American Dietetic Associa- 
tion for the Dietetic Technician Pro- 
gram. 

For more information on the Die- 
tetic Programs at LCCC, contact 
the Director of Dietary Programs, 
829-7317. 

MERCY HOSPITAL, Wilkes- 
Barre, will present a free Commu- 
nity Health Education Program on 
Wednesday, July 17, 7 p.m., at 
Pomeroy’s Community Room, Wyo- 
ming Valley Mall. 

The topic, ‘Newer Methods of 
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Detection, Diagnosis and Treatment 
of Hearing Impairment in Children 
and Adults”, will be presented by 
William A. Rusin, M.D., Otalaryn- 
gologist and Robert S. Asby, M.S., 
Audiologist. 

registration is required. Contact 
the Mercy Wellness Center at 826- 
3553, Monday-Friday, 8:30 a.m.-4 
p.m. 

  

Events 
  

THE HOLY NAME SOCIETY of 
St. Ignatius Church, Kingston plan 
“Recycle Day” for Saturday, July 
20 at St. Ann’s Chapel parking lot, 
N. Goodwin and Hoyt Sts. from 8:30 
a.m. to noon. 

All paper and aluminum products 
will be accepted. Proceeds will ben- 
efit youth activities of the parish. 
Sorry no pick-ups. 

THE MAPLE GROVE UNITED 
METHODIST CHURCH will hold an 
old-fashioned Ice Cream Social on 
Saturday, July 20, at 4 p.m. featur- 
ing Bar-B-Ques, homemade ice 
cream and homemade pies. 

The Church is located near the 
intersection of Routes 118 and 29, on 
the Main Road in Sweet Valley. 

DICK WILLIAMS, SR., chairman 
of Daniel C. Roberts Volunteer Fire 
Company, Harveys Lake, 
announced that the fire company’s 
annual bazaar will be held July 12, 
13, and 14 at Hanson’s Park, Har- 
veys Lake. 

The bazaar will open Friday, July 
12, from 5 to midnight; Saturday, 
July 13; 2 p.m. to midnight and 
Sunday, July 14, 2 to midnight. The 
parade will be Saturday, 7 p.m., 
starting at Hanson’s and going 
round the lake via Sandy Beach and 
back to Hanson’s. 

In addition to the regular games, 
foods and stands, featured this year 
will be homemade cabbage and 
noodles, pierogies and potato pan- 
cakes. There also will be a home- 
baked goods sale and games for the 
children. 
Music by “Response” will be pro- 

vided Friday and Sunday from 9 
p.m. to midnight, and by ‘‘Golden 
Fire’, Saturday, from 9 p.m. to 
midnight. 

THIS WEEKEND FRANCES 
SLOCUM STATE PARK, Mount 
Olivet Road, Wyoming, wiil present 
free guided walks and programs. 
These nature programs are free of 
charge, and open to the general 
public. 

Saturday, July 13, 2 p.m. “All My 
Relatives-Wildlife and the American 
Indian Hunter,” a guided walk will 
be presented. This walk along the 
Frances Slocum trail will look at 
how the Indians used the park land 
as hunting grounds, along with their 
religious beliefs of animals. The 
walk will begin at the entrance of 
the Boat Rental Parking Lot. 
Sunday, July 14, 1 p.m.-4 p.m. will 

be a free fishing seminar presented 
by the Bass Masters Association. 
The seminar will focus on casting 
techniques, lure presentations and 
fish habits which should be of inter- 
est to all fishermen. The séminar 
will take place at the Boat Rental 
Lake Front. 

At 2 p.m. the guided walk “All My 
Relatives-Wildlife and the American 
Indian Hunter’’ will be presented by 
Park Naturalist Jeff Smith. This 
guided walk wil lbegin at the 
entrance of the Boat Rental Parking 
Lot. For more information, call the 
park office at 696-3525. 

THE FRANKLIN TOWNSHIP 
VOLUNTEER FIRE COMPANY 
will hold its annual bazaar on July 
18, 19 and 20 at the Fire Company 
Grounds in Orange. : 
Featured will be plenty of good 

foods, lots of games and prizes. 
Entertainment includes ‘‘Great 

Rock Scare” on Thursday, “Country 
Kings” on Friday and ‘‘Chenaniah” 
on Saturday. A firemen’s parade 
will be held on Saturday at 6:45 
p.m. 

THE ANNUAL HIRAM WILSON 
FAMILY REUNION will be held on 
Saturday, July 20 at Knobels Grove 
Pavillion R. 
Dinner will be served at 12 noon 

with the business meeting scheduled 
for 1 p.m. 

For information, call secretary 
Pat Hoover at 675- 1388. 

  

  

The Rocky Glen Summer Wunder- 
bar Oktoberfest committee is proud 
to announce that Thursday, July 11, 
has been designated as Miss Penn- 
sylvania Day. 

The new Miss Pennsylvania who 
was crowned in June will be making 
one of her first appearances at the 
Summer Wunderbar Oktoberfest. 
The new Miss Pennsylvania will be 
on hand to preside over the days 
activities, sign autographs and meet 
her, fellow Pennsylvanians. 

Note, all roads lead to Rocky Glen 
Park. For more information on col- 
orful brochures, group rates, Senior 
Citizen groups and bus rates contact 
Rocky Glen Oktoberfest, P.O. Box 
37, Avoca, Pa. 18641-0037 or call 717- 
457-7401 or 717-655-5500. 

-0- 

A travel and study tour of Russia 
and the Caucasus is planned by the 
Wilkes College Division of Continu- 
ing Education and the Department 
of Language and Literature. For 17 
days from August 12 through 28, 
members of the fully escorted tour 

Coming events   
will have the chance to visit some of 
the most significant historical sights 
in Moscow, Kiev, Thilisi, Yerevan 
and Leningrad. 

The tour will depart from New 
York, stop in Zurich, then travel on 
to Moscow via: Swissair. The itiner- 
ary includes the Kremlin, symbolic 
heart of Russia; the Pechersky 
caves of Kiev in the Ukraine; Mt. 
Ararat in Armenia; the Livadia 
Palace, sight of the Yalta confer- 
ence in 1945; the Hermitage 
Museum, which houses works of Da 
Vinci, Rembrandt, Raphael, Michal- 
angelo and Picasso. 

Prior to departure, three orienta- 
tion sessions will be given at Wilkes 
by Dr. Walter Karpinich, who 
teaches Russian and German lan- 
guage and literature at the College. 
According to Dr. Karpinich, the 
orientation sessions will “familiar- 
ize the participants with the geogra- 
phy, history, and cultrual variations 
of the host countries.” The sessions 
are scheduled for Wednesday even- 
ings, July 24, 31 and August 7. 

College Misericordia 

SPORTS CAMPS 
BASKETBALL - JULY 29 to AUGUST 2, 9:30 A.M. to 3 P.M. 

Grades: 5 to 8, co-ed 

Fee: $55 

$50, if paid by July 15 

FEATURING: Derrick Murphy, 
Harlem Globetrotters 

Dave Whalen, 

former NBA player 

Dave Evans, 

NBA referee 

Charlie Middleton, 

St. Mary's Middle School Coach 
Al Clocker and Bill Dick, 

College Misericordia Coaches 
DEADLINE: July 25 

FIELD HOCKEY - AUGUST 5 to 9, 9:30 A.M. to 3 P.M. 

Grades: 5 to 12, girls 

Fee: $65 

$60, if paid by July 15 
$60, team registration 

FEATURING: Marge Garinger, 
USA Olympic Team Manager 

Maureen Horan, 

Drew University Coach 

DEADLINE: August 1 

SOCCER - AUGUST 12 to 16, 

Grades: 1 to 8, co-ed 

Fee: $60 

9:30 A.M. to 3 P.M. 

$55, if paid by July 15 
FEATURING: Laning J. Harvey, 

Wyoming Seminary Assistant Coach 
DEADLINE: August 8 

* Special discount of $5 if more than one child from « a 
family registers for the same camp. 

* TO REGISTER CALL ‘COLLEGE MISERICORDIA OFFICE OF 
SPECIAL PROGRAMS AT 675-2181, EXTENSION 311. 
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