
  

  

  

24) STEAMER TRAGEDY 
Mrs. J. W. Waters, Insans, 

Drowns Children and Self. 

ece ia] LEAPED FROM PLYMOUTH AT NIGHT 

mined anthra- 
sell Bituminous and 
and all kinds 

Valley 
ve also 

Sg Plowit service 

Left New York For Fall River to 

Yislt Father — Beoked as Mra 

Allen on Liner—Heecently 

in a Sanitarium. 

of| FALL RIVER, Mass, Feb. 21 With 
the fear of insanity preying upon Ler 
mind, Mrs John W. Waters of Brook- 

Iyh threw ber (uree children overboard 
frou the Fall River liner Plymouth 

and then, alter writiog a note in which 
she begged forgiveuess from ber bhus- 

band, she too, plunged to death iu the 

waters of Narragansett bay. 

This letter, which she wrote ou wrap- 
. | plug paper ln pencil, was addressed to 

Ler husband, John W. Waters, and was 

as folluws: 

“Dear Husband-—-Forgive this trou. 

ble. 1 have pearly broken my heart, 

Dear John, forgive me for causing yol 
this sorrow, but [ could not live, and 

{ conld not jeave our children. I bave 

worried so much I fear insanity, and 

I could not leave the chilliren.” 

The staterooin was engaged in New 

York nuder the upawme of Mrs. BT. 
Allen. 
The tragedy was discovered just be 

fore the steamer reached Newport, 

when attaches of the boat found the 

door of the stateroom open and its oc 

cupants missing. Scattered about the 

rood were articles of the woman's and 

children's wearing apparel. Pinned on 

the door was the note which she bad 
written. 
Besides the letter for Mr Waters 

Another was found in the nature of a 

will, In which the writer disposed of 
her personal property. The will was as 

follows 
“Dear Joun—-Give Essie my pear! 

sud the medallion to Abble; to Lillie 

M. D. bex containiug ull my silk and 

‘| taney stockings; to Jessie Dyer, small 

: E. E. . Reynolds, 

Sayre and Waverly, 
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round cut glass dish; to Carrie, all eut 

glass; to Gladys my watch; to Maud, 
ttle black clock; to Mabel, royal Wor 

cester vase; 10 Mildred, the rings 1 now 

wear, except, of course, wy precious 
wedding ring: to Mame, all dishes; to 

L M.D. all underwear sud my white 
apreus 
“Dear John, don't think that [ dom't 

care. Ob, If you only knew!” 3 

After the discovery of the letters a 
thorough Iavestigation was made and 

the ship was searched, with resulls 

which would indicate that the tragedy 

took place some time between midnight 
snd 3:30 &. w., when the discovery 

was made, Just before the Plywouth 

made the Newport landing. 
Persons occupying sthterooms near 

by heard one of the children crying 

about midnight. After that uo sound 

was heard. The steamboat officials be. 
lieve that the tragedy occurred when 
the boat was near Point Judal 

Minels Miners Prepared For Strike, 

SPRINGFIELD, 11, Feb, 21.—At the 
annual convention of the lilimols dis- 

trict of the United Mine Workers of 

America State Secretary - Treasures 

Ryan io his anuual report dwelt al 

most entirely ou the iikellhood of a 

strike. He sald lilinols miders were 

well prepared and that on Jan. 31, 1908, 

the miners had $830,000 in thelr treas- 
ary. Mr. Ryan said his advice to the 
miners in case of a strike this year 

was to refuse to ask or accept Inter 

vention by President Roosevelt or any 
other person. * 

Throw Out Hooker Heselution. 

ALBANY, N. Y, Feb. 21.--The a» 
sembly judiciary committee has rufus. 

od to report favorably to the assembly 
the resolution of Assemblyman Tomp- 
kins providing for a repetition of the 
(vestigation made by the judiclary 
committee of the charges against Su- 

prewue Court Justice Warren B. Hooker 
of Fredonls, who was alleged to Lave 

been improperly concerned lu appelnt- 

wents and rental transactions in coun- 

nection with the postofiees at Fredo 

ala aud Dunkirk. 

Rehearing For James T. Metealf. 

WASHINGTON, Feb, 21.- Yielding 
to representations that a careful laves- 

tigation will disclose the fact that he 
was lunoesnt of wrongdoing, Postmas- 
ter General Cortelyon has ordered the 

of the case of James T. Met- 

calf the chief of the money order diy 
son, who was dismissed from 
service, later ludicted by the grand 
Jury of the District of Columbia and 
the case finally nolle prossed. 

Uurder Results Prom Labor Troubles 

BIRMINGHAM, Ala. Feb, 21 Fol 
lowing labor treubles at the plant of 
the Central Foundry company at Bes. 

semer, Lee Morrison and Raleigh 
dones, employees, Bad a fight, which 

resulted in Jones shooting and fustaut- 

ly killing Morrison. A stray bullet 
from: Joues' pistol also struck and fa- 
taliy wounded James Lowery, a by- 

stander. Jones was Durriedly locked 

up in the Birmingbam jail 

@ A. NN Escawmpment at Burlington. 

BURLINGTON, Vt, Feb, 21 ~Cor- 
poral Jawes Tapper, commander In 
chief of the Grand Army of the Repub 

He, and Colonel John ‘I'weedle, adju- 

tant general, both of Washington, were 

present sod made brief addresses at 

the frst business session of the thirty: 
pluth annoal encampment of the Ver 
mont departinent of the G. A, R. 

%. Janek Tars in Eteraal ak 
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JEROME AFTER GRAFTERS. 

Criminal Prosecution Agelust Mutual 
Reserve Life, 

NEW YORK, Feb. 21. -The grand 
jury here have begun investigating the 

evidence brought out by the Armstroug 
comunittee. District Attorney Jeroine 
selected as the first insurance company 
to be considered for criminal prosecu- 
tions the Mutual Heserve Life, against 

which charges were made before the 
Armstrong commitiee by J. G. Wells, 
who alleged that President James K. 
Burnham, Vice President Eldridge and 
Counse] George Burnham Jr. brother 

of the president, had paid from funds 
of the company certain judgments 

which bad Leen secured against them 
personally. 

A question of law is involved, nas 
much as the defense claims that the 

paymeuts all were wade In November, 

1900, which brings them within the 

statue of limitations. 

Mr. Jerome cobtends that the statute 
of limitations does uot apply because 
one of the payments WAS not actusily 

wade uatil April, 1901, snd that the 
officers therefore are amenable to the 

law, 

Former Assistant District Attorney 
Hand, for the defeuse, claims that the 
check claimed to have been paid In 

1901 was In reality drawn In Novem- 
ber, 1800, aud held in trust antil April 

of the year followiug. when It was 

cashed. 
The grand jury began by summoning 

the Mutual Reserve's comptroller and | 

auditor of accounts, as well as several 

hookkeepers and clerks, who brought 
with them = wagon load of books and 

documents 
When Mr. Jerome was asked 

news he sald: 

“1 have not talked In the past about 

insurance. nor will | do so now or In 

the future.” 
Asked If it were true that he bad 

begun an investigation of the Equl- 

table Title aud Guarantes company, be 
refused to auswer. 

for 

GIRLS FOUGHT NEGRO. 

fwe Elisabeth Nurses Battled With 
Assallant te a Finish. 

ELIZABETH. N. J, Feb. 21. Amelia 

Nelson, twenty-two years old, and 

Kathryn Anderson, twenty, nurses etn- 

ployed In the Elizabeth General bos- 

pital, while ou thelr way home were 

attacked Dy a negro who jumped out 

from behind a pile of dirt when. they 

were within a block of their Lome on 

Spring street, 

The girls fought until almost ex- 

bausted, when Edward H. Feller, a 
pressman on one of the newspapers 

bere, bearing their cries, ran to thelr 
assistance aud grabbed the negro be 

fore he could get away 

He gave the fellow a terrible beat: 

ing and was about to take bliin to the 

police when the negro bruke away and 

meaped, 

Coureel’s Offer to the Kalsor, 

COPENHAGEN, Feb. 21.-Barou de 

Courcel, who represented the French 

goverument at the funerm! of King 
Cliristian, in au loterview with Em- 

peror Wilkelm tried to obtain au agree- 
ment with Germany on the Moroccan 

question Ly using French fisancial in- 

fluence. He offered on Lebalf of the 
French government to open the Parle 
bourse to dealings lu German indus- 
trial shares, thus reversing the recent 
refusal of France to accede to the re 

quest of the great German electrical 

companies to get their abares quoted In 
Paris. It is stated that Emperor Wil. 
telm at first was taken aback, but lat- 

or seemed luclined to consider the of- 

fer. 

Ex-Sherif Murdered In Bed. 

ROANOKE, Va. Feb 21.—The coro- 

user's jury Iu the case of former Bberiff 

Jobu B. Trayuham, who was found 
murdered ln his bed here, has returned 
a verdict that Traynham's death was 

caused by blows on the head and peck 

made by a sharp instrument in the 

bands of party or parties unknown 

to the jury. Trayilham's skull was 
crushed and the bead almost severed. 
The police have made no arrests 

Posse Became Kieccutioners. 

ANDALUSIA, Ala, Feb. 31.—A ne 

fo named Pedigrees was shot to death 
by a posse here. Pedigrees forced an 

sutrance to the home of a prominent 
white citizen iu the outskirts of the 
lown and assaulted & young woman. 
A posse soon located him, and he was 

identified by his victim. The posse 

started to jall with the negro when the 

prisoner Lroke away and began to run, 

ind be was shot, 

Himpkias and Adams to Be Extradited 

BALEM, Ore, Feb. 217 Governor 
Chamberialo has granted requisition 

papers for the arrest and return to 
Idabo of J. L Simpkins and Steve 
Adams, wanted as accomplices ln the 
murder of former Governor Frank 

Steuneuberg of Idaho, Simpkins is be- 

lieved to be ju this state, Adams le 
ander arrest In Baker City, 

Banker Dropped Dead at Boston. 

BOSTON, Feb. 21 -Brigbaw N. Bul 
lock, president of the Fitchburg Na- 
tional bank and treasurer of the Fitch- 
burg Saviogs bank, dropped dead while 
in this city on business. The cause of 
death was heart fallure. Mr, Bullock 
was seventy four years of age 

Will Revise Insarange Laws. 

BOSTON, Feb 21-Governor Gold 
has sigued a LI passed by the seunte 
afl house providing for a cowmnission 
of three men to revise and codify the 
imSurnuce laws of (he state. 

A Cross From Wilhelmina, 

NEW YORK. Feb 21 Her majesty 

: Queen Wilhelmina bas Lestowed upen 
Heury Pluygers, ©onsll of the Nether   

FRANCETO DRAW OUT 
Germany Rejects French Plans 

For Moroocan Police. 

CONCORD AT ALGECIRAS IMPOSSIBLE 

Neutral Powers, Inslading the United 

States, Tried to Bring About Agree- 

ment by Private Negeotia- 

tions, but Failed. 

PARIS Feb. 21. Germany's rejec- 

tion of France's proposal al Algeciras 
that the proposed Moroccan police sys- 
tem shall be French snd Spanish has 

given renewed gravity to the Franco- 
Germau situation. 

It is officially announced that Ger 

many's action leaves France no course 
but to terminate the private Degotia- 

tions aud sppeal to the judgment of 
the world before the open conference. 

This decision suspends the meetings 

between M. Revoll, head of the French 

misslou at Algeciras, and Herr von 

Radowits, chief of the German delegs 
tion, at which they have Leen seeking 

te find an accord 
The neutral powers, Including the 

United States, strongly spproved of 
these private exchanges as belug the 

best means of avoiding an open discus 

sion of the controversy. The fallure to 

agree and France's determination te 

end the private uegotiations bring the 

parties to a deadlock. This promises to 
result In 8 projouged crisis in which 

each side malutains the positions which 
it took up before the open conference. 
The sentiment in official circles is that 

Germany's reply tends to destroy the 
usefulness of the conference hy mak- 

ing su agreement impossible. 

Reports are In circulition to the of- 
fect that France intends to withdraw 
from the conference, but they are pot 
confirmed, and the determination of 
the French delegates to carry the case 
before the open coufergnce shows that 
the withdrawal stage bas not yet been 
reached. It is expected that the strain- 
od situation will have the sffect of re 
pewing the alarmist war reports and of 

arousing public apprehension 

The resuit of the Uerman reply on 
the subject of the policing of Morecco 

has bad 8 bad effect on the peutral del- 
eghtes at Aljeciing, were disposed 
to regabd the Fre proposal as = 
woderate one and who expected sowe 

acknowledgment 1u that regard from 
Germany. They do net, however, con: 

sider the case as desperate as it has 
been Litherto. Their guarded Interfer- 

ence now will be tragsformed Into a 
strong pressure upou Germany, whose 

unyielding attitude is regarded as pos- 

sibly threatening the world's peace 

Kovean Literati a Sulside. 

VICTORIA, B. C, Feb. 21. -Another 
patriotic sujeide. as a protest against 
Japaucse occupancy in Korea is re 

ported. Mr Chong. reputed the most 
promiuvent of Confucian literat! in Ko- 

rea, announced that he would kill him- 

self in protest to the convention with 
Japan, but the Chinese polices prevented 

bim and returned him under guard to 

his native place. His wife refused to 

admit him, stating that he would be 

sternally disgraced If he tamely aban- 

doned bis determination. He then 
went to a temples and swallowed opium. 

Bes on Chisage Bank. 

OHICAGO, Feb. 21.—Following an 
investigation Into the affairs of the 

Jackson Trust and Savings bank by 

State Examiner Jones, depositors start. 

od a run on the institution. The run 

on the bank begau when the doors 

were opened. A great crowd of men 

and women gathered, each holding a 
pass book and clamoring to get inte 

the bank. In two hours the bank had 

paid out £00,000 in deposits. The offi 

cers declare that an unwarranted scare 

has started the run - 

Federation of Laber to Ald Miners. 

CLEVELAND, O., Feb. 21.-The full 
strength of the American Federation of 

Labor has been pledged to the cause of 
the miners of Pennsylvania and other 

states in their impending strike bY 

President Gompera of the federation 
bere. “I should not speak of a coal 

strike,” he sald. “I hope it will not 
rome to that. The whole matter is In 
the hands of the officers of the United 
Mine Workers of America. 

Mise Susan B. Anthony Stricken, 

ROCHESTER, N. Y. "Feb. 21 -— 
While making preparations to come to 

New York to attend a banquet and re- 
ception in Lomor of her eighty-sixth 

birthday Miss Susan B. Anthony; the 

noted suffragist, was sefzed with a 
stroke of paralysis at her home bere 

aud now lies tn a critical condition; al 

though hopes are entertained of hier re 

covery. 

Soldiers Guard Shreveport Jalil. 

BMREVEPORT, La. Feb 21.—The 

city Is quiet now, and it is not belleved 

any further attempt will be made to 

fynch the wmegro, Charles Coleman. In 

jail on the charge of murdering Miss 

Lear. The militia guard the jall and 
will do so until Coleman's trial has 

been completed 

Pat Crowe Fred, 

COUNCIL BLUFFS, Ia, Feb 21 

Pat Crowe has been released ou a bond 

for $1500 signed by his brother, Jobn 
Crowe, and the latter's wife spd Jo 

seph Nansel, a wealthy farmer of this 

rounty, Crowe's trial on a charge of 
holding up street cars Las been put 

over. 

Fatal Collision on lowa Central, 

DES MOINER la, Feb. 21.-Bagt 
ater Willard of Mason Clty and Brake 

man Sheaban of Onkalosas were killed 
and Fireman Rogers wis infored fn a 
bead-on celliston of two lowa Central   

ssa % 

freights near Eiders. The stew nj. 

- 
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Sallewmas, Mard Drives, Was Beate 
on of Falr Greuads Track. 

NEW ORLEANS, Feb. 11 Hallow 
mas, Johnson & Dosen's Derby candid 
date, was pitted aguinst a small but 

select fleld of older horses at the Fair 
grounds. The race was & sixtesuth 
of a mile shorter thao the Derby dis 

tance, and the colt, favorite in the bet- 

ting, could never gel withla striking 

distance of Bt. Valentine, who was 
driven hard at the end te stall off 
Monaco Maid. Hyacluth and Raluland 

| were the other beaten favorites. Bum 
marries: 

First Race.—Al Powell, first; Schroe- 

der's Midway, second; Our Own, third. 

Becond Race. — Hocus Pocus, firet: 

Laucastrian, second; Lady Heurietta, 

third 

Third Race. — Third Alarm, first; 
Stoner Hill, second; Dr. Coffey, third 

Fourth Race --85t. Valentine, first; 

Mouace Mald. second: Hallowmas, 
third. N 

Fifth Race —Kickshaw, first; Hya. 
cinth. second: Csnyon, third 

Sixth Race. —Whorler, first; Rainland, 
second; Dapple Gold, third 

Lawa Teanis Toursameat! Opens. 

NEW YORK, Feb. 21. —The seventh 
annual lawn tennls tournament for the 

indoor natiensl championship bas open- 

ed on the courts iu the Beventh regi. 

ment armory. Twenty-one players of 

the ranking cisss are entered In the 

singles. Hugh Tallant, a former Har 

vard player, wou the feature match by 

defeating W. B. Cragin, Jr, Seventh 

regiment, by a ene sided score. W. C. 

Grant, ex-indoor champion, and H. L. 
—{ Westfall of Brooklyn were alec win- 

ners. The latter defeated A. [. Hos. 
kins of Philadelphia, 

Aceident at Ascol. 

LOS ANGELES, (Cal, Feb. 21.-The 
feature of the day at Ascot was mar- 

red by a pitiful accident to Loyal 
Front, which broke his right foreleg 

Just after leaving the barrier. The 

horse bad to be destroyed lu plain view 

of the crowded grand stand. C. Van 
Dusen, owner of Loyal Front, recently 

refused $5,000 for the uit. He valued 
the bourse at §10000. Three favorites 
wou, the other races golug to long 

shots. Kumiss, the heavily played frst 

choice lo the secund race. was left at 
the post. 

Beston Bench Show Winners. 

BOSTON, Feb. 21.—Iu the Scottish 
terrier class Porter of the Ardsley ken- 

nels of Ardsley, N. Y., took the win- 
ner's prize for dogs with Porridge of 

Ardsley, while George Lauder of 

Greeuwich, Conn., wou lu the class for 

bitches with Sandown Duchess. Both 
the winoers took firsts In the open and 

limit classes. The Wandee keunels of 
New York swept all before them In the 
winners’ glasses for swooth haired fox 

terriers with Wandee Kuight and Wap- 
dee Doris 

Diste Lad at Oakland, 

BAN FRANCISCO, Peb 21 -Dixle 
Lad, at 10 to 1, came fast lu the 

stretch in the fourth race at Oakland 

and caught Jockey Loague napplug nnd 
scored by half a leugth from the fa. 

varite, Orchan As It was, Orchan 

made all the running and was ouly pass 

ed io the last twenty yards Dusty 

Miller also got up and took the show 
woney from Bonar, 

Doped The Huguenot. 

LO8 ANGELES, Cal, Feb. 21.- 
Judge A. W. Hamilton bas granted 

Jeff McCafferty until noon tn which te 
file his answer to the charge made by 

C. BE. Durnell that be doped The Hu- 
guenot, which wea the Afth race at 
Ascot. Durnell BM up The Huguenot 
after the race and bad bim examined 

by veteriuarians, who sald the borse 
was doped. 

A Record Awute Tour. 

BOSTON, Feb. 321 — Mr. and Mrs 

Charles J. Glddeu of this city have 

oompleted the longest automobile tour 
ever made. Un Jan, 17 they arrived in 

Calcutta after a journey of 4.400 miles 

in India. The Gliddens have visited 
twenty-seven countries aud have rid- 
den 29.508 miles in a motor car during 
the trip 

Pittaburg Civie Bleetions, 

PITTSBURG, Feb, 21.—Returns In 
the wunicipal election ludicate a vic 
tory for George W. Guthrie, Civic 

league, Cltigens' and Dewocrate candi 
date for wayor, by a4 majority of about 
8000 aver Alexander M. Jenkinson, 
Republican. In Allegheny the vote Is 
close. Returns would judicate the elec 
tion of Charles F. Kirschler, Republic 
an, over George B. Logau, candidate of 

the Good (Jovernwment partly 

Dimmick Miected Mayer of Scranton. 
SCRANTON, Pa Feb. 21.-J Beuja 

win Diwmick, Republicau, was elected 

mayor of this city by a majority of 

about 3,000 over John Gibbous. Demo 

eral. The present wayor is a Republic 

an. ‘The Republicans carry the school 

beard apd retaiu control of the select 

aud common council. The election was 

the most exciting in years 

Charles PP. Rooney He-olected. 

PHILADELPHIA, Feb. 21 In the 

spring municipal elections held here 

Charles FP. Rooney, the Republican 

votuines and a present member of the 

board of magistrates, was elected to 

succeed himself, and Edwin K. Borie, 

who was pawed by the Democrats, 
City party aud Lincoln party, was alse 

elected. 

Oeunerval Miles to Be Orator. 

LINCOLN, Nel, Feb. 2Il.-UGeneral 

Nelsou A. Miles has accepted an lavita 
tion to be the orator at the annual com. 
mencemient of the Nebraska State unl 
versity on Thursday, June 14,     

PRICE ONE CENT 
  

PATRICK SUMMONED 
New York Recorder Orders 

Oondemned Man to Court. 

TEXANS SAIDTO HAVE NEW EVIDENCE 

Eight Men Brought to New York to 
Testify That Valet Jones Admifted 

He Gave False Evidence 

Against Acoused. 

NEW YORK, Feb. 21 —Hecorder Goll 
has ordered the wardeu of Bing Sing 

prison to bring Albert T. Patrick, con- 
demped for the murder of William M 

Rice, down ou the first train, following 

an announcement that Fred House Lad 
been summoned by District Attorney 

Jerome 10 nppear as a8 witness at the 

beariug of evidence for a uew trial 
House was Patrick's first attoruey, aud 

Valet Jones swore that both he and 

Patrick confessed to House that they 
bad slain aged William Marsh Rice 

Loafing about the door of the court 
where Patrick is making the latest 

fight for his life were eight meu In soft 

hats, squirting tobacco juice at the til 

Ings in the floor of the corridor with 
splendid alm and fugeriug the alinost 

diswond studs Iu the bosoms of their 

flanuel shirts. All had Jewelry lu their 
shirts except one, and he had a leg 

missing. 
They were the Texans brought here 

by the defense to testify that Valet 

Charles F. Jones had admitted to thew 

that be awore falsely when he stuted 

on the witness stand in the last trial 

that Lawyer Patrick killed old man 
Willlam Marsh Rice. the western mil. 

lionaire, by administering chloroform 

to bim. Thelr stories make up the bulk 

of the newly discoversd evidence upon 

which counsel of the condemned mur- 

derer base their hope of saving him 

from the chair. 
The Texas delegation were of a type 

familiar to every man who ever cross 

ed the Panhandle. 
Joseph Jourdan, the lawe veteran of a 

coal car collision. was cuuspicuous in 

the group vulslde the door. Jordan it 

was who explained away a Jot of un 

pleasant things while telling about his 

cousin, having the same name As bim 
and being lame lke bim and exactly 

the sate age. 
This cousin, Jordan stated, was the 

Jordan who had been seut to prison 
and who had been crippled up by a 

bullet from a warden's gun while try 

lng to break jall 

Mikado a Knight of the Garter, 

TOKYO, Fel. 21 — The lmpressive 
ceremony of the investiture of the ew- 

peror of Japau with the British Order 
of the Garter took place here In the 

presence of about eighty high person 
ages, lucludiug Crown Prince Yoshi 

hito, the lmperial princes, Field Mar. 

shals Yamagata and Oyawa, the entire 

membership of the party headed hy 

Prince “Xrthur of Coununught, which 

brought the order, and the British nm 
bassador, Bir Claude MM. Macdonald, 

and the members of the «wmbassy. An 
hour After the ceremony of Investiture 

the emperor visited Prince Arthur of 
Connaught and expressed to him lis 

grateful appreciation of Great Brit 

aln's friendship. 

Dynamite Raplostion at Sturglsson. 

MORGANTOWN, W. Va, Feb 21 - 

Through an accidental explosion of dy- 

namite at the plant of the Deckers 

Creek Stone and Sand company at 

Stufgisson, eight miles south of here, 

one mau was almost Instantly killed, 

agother fatally injured and five seri- 

ousty burt. The men had gathered 

around a fire to eat dioper. Near the 

fire were fiftecu sticks of dynamite, 

which had been placed there to thaw 

out. A blast at a nearby luestone 

quarcy was set off, and it is thought 

to have caused the explosion of the dy 

pamite 

Kilburn Report Next Tuesday. 

ALBANY, N. Y., Feb. 21. Into the 

hands of a subcommittee, consisting of 

Senators Ralnes. Steveus and Grady, 

the senate Suaunce committee has com- 

mitted for considerstion the assembly 

concurrent resolution providing for an 

favestigation of the state baukiug de 

partment, together with the informa 

tien submitted by Goveruor Higgins ln 
connection with the charges agalust 

Superintendent F. D. Kilburn of that 
department. Tluls subcommittee (s In 
structed to report next Tuesday. 

Outlaws Still Hold Celonel Hanalgan 

EL PASO, Tex, Feb. 21 -Tle bau 
dits who kidnaped Colonel Robert Hau 

nigan, the Deming (N. M.) ratnchwan, 

from a stage near Silver City, N. M, 

are alleged to have collected $2000 
rausoin wouey to date, $1,000 frow the 

colonel aud $1000 from Lis sou, yet 
they still hold him. Officers fear to at 
tack thew lu thelr retreat In Mogollou 

mountalu lest they kill the prisouer 

Ba-Senater Green's Trial Opens. 

WASHINGTON, Feb 21 After 

many delays caused by judicial pro 
ceediugs lu New Yourk and in Wash 

lngtou the trial of former State Sena 

tor Qeorge E. Green of Hlughawtouw, 

N. Y. on Inpdictwents charging con 

splracy la connection with the faruish- 

ing of postofice supplies Las opened 
bere 

Rendearson's Death Near. 

DUBUQUE, la, Feb 21 Forwer 
Speaker D. B Heuderson has suffers! 
auother puralytlic stroke, which has 

ailment deprived him of his aight. 1s 
wife Is the only person be recognizes 

His general condition Is worse It Ia 

belleved the end ls near 

Weakley Sapreme Court Justice. 

MONTGOMERY, Ale, Feb. 21. --Goy- 

ernor Jelks Lax appoluted Samuel Db, 
Weakley of Birmingham chief justice 
A es a   

Our Annual Sale 

Houseke
epi ng 

Linens! 
FIRST—We import our own Table 

Linens, saving 20% for you. 
SECOND —If we say all linen we 

mean pure flax, 

THIRD—We advertise what we 
lave and give you what we ad* 
vertise, 

Regular $1 Bleached Damask 
72 in. pure flax, sale price... § 

Regular 75¢ 

* bbe 

75¢ silver bleached 72 in. 
65¢c ‘ 

iE ae... ...84m, | 
Napkins, Towels and Sets reduced 

in proportion 

Towelings 
14c bleached 18 in. all linen. 
121¢ 

fic, 

124c unbleac hed, 

llc 

10¢ 

Qc. . 

8¢ 

ic 

linen 

White Quilts 
$1.35 quality, 

from starch 

ready for use 

$195. .\ 
1.00 

Gorset Covers 
20c¢ kind, lace trimmed and 

made of good, firm muslin, 
very special while they last... 124 

25¢ and 37}c kinds, better than 
last season, beautifully trim- 

med with lace, beading and 
TODON...... ..cocnvesdenevnnng 23 

Gowns and Skirts - 
Cambric and muslin gowns and 

all kinds specially priced for this sale 

Black Mercerized 
Skirts 

You know the kind of values we 
are famous for and we have marked 
them still lower for this sale. 

$1.06 value, specially priced... 
1.25 

1.50. 

“ 

A8 
088 
48 
68 
58 
48 

.. 12% 
Al 
00 
11 
10 
08 
08 
or 

full size, frees 
and hemmed 

Full line of “Peters” Brotherhood: 

overalls now Jens 

Globe Words 
Talmadge Block, RBlmer Ave. 

VALLYY PHONE. 

LOOMIS OPERAHOUSE 
ORCHESTRA 

Btriotly Tatobete Muaslo furnished 
for Balls, Parties and all manner of Boo- 
ial Functions, either public of private 

number plecea desired will be fun 
Ang eu Call Valley Record for terms, 
eto. 

LEHIGH - AND SCRANTON 

COAL 
At the Lowest t Possible Prices. 

Orders can be left at West » 
Store, both phones; or at the a 
yards at Sayre, Valley Phone 37m. 

(COLEMAN WASSLER, 

DR. A. 0. REES, M.D. 
[100 Lake St. West Sayre, 

OFFICE HOURS: 

8 to 11:00 a. m,, 3 to 4:30, 7:00 to 

Genite urlmary and chronle disrasess 
specialty. Both phones, 

Cards For Sale. 
Valley Record has in Sook he S 

card signs: 

RX A Cet  


