

NORTHEASTERN PENNSYLVANIA

MURDER AT WAVERLY.

Fred A. Kirst Shoots Miss Tobin, His Sweetheart.

Townsend, April 9.—A murder created a great sensation over the state on Saturday evening, when it was reported that Fred A. Kirst had shot and killed his sweetheart, Miss Katherine Tobin, while intoxicated.

SMALL-POX AT AUBURN.

Twenty-eight cases reported—The town quarantined.

Nicholson, April 9.—It is reported that at Auburn Center, about fifteen miles from here, there are twenty-eight cases of small-pox and over 100 others are exposed to it.

HONESDALE.

Special to the Scranton Tribune. Honesdale, April 9.—Mrs. Coe Durland left on Saturday to join other members of her family at Atlantic City.

HOPBOTTOM.

Special to the Tribune. Hopbottom, April 9.—The death of Mr. Truman Bell, one of the oldest residents of the place, occurred on Thursday, April 5th.

FACTORYVILLE.

Special to the Scranton Tribune. Factoryville, Pa., April 9.—Mrs. Moon, of Riverside, California, is here visiting friends and relatives.

BEECHAM'S PILLS. Purify the Blood. For Biliousness, Constipation, etc.

Spring Time Is Here

And with it one of the finest lines of Men's and Children's Clothing shown in the history of the city—manufactured by the best makers in the world.



We name but one price, and "that's it."

BOYLE & CROW. 416 Lackawanna Avenue.

will serve a 10-cent Easter supper at the church Wednesday evening, April 11. All are invited to attend.

TUNKHANNOCK.

Special to the Scranton Tribune. Tunkhannock, April 9.—The regular term of April court convened here this afternoon, with President Judge E. M. Dunham presiding and with Hon. Justice J. M. Laughlin as associate.

NICHOLSON.

Special to the Scranton Tribune. Nicholson, April 9.—Mrs. A. O. Thompson has just returned from an extended visit among friends in Scranton and Nanticoke, Pa.

SEELEYVILLE.

Special to the Scranton Tribune. Seeleyville, Wayne County, Pa., April 9.—The contractors working on the railroad between Pottsville and Portonia are making rapid progress in removing the bank to make room for the double track.

SUSQUEHANNA.

Special to the Scranton Tribune. Susquehanna, April 9.—The Susquehanna County Sunday School association will hold its annual convention in Montrose, May 1 and 2.

GET RELIEF FROM COLIC, SUFFER. Mason's Health Defenders Yellow Tablets.

Your life will be different. You will work with a will. Your sleep will refresh you.

Mason's Health Defenders Yellow Tablets. Your life will be different. You will work with a will.

Mason's Health Defenders Yellow Tablets. (Don't know you have a stomach?)

Mason's Health Defenders Yellow Tablets. (Sure of a night's rest.)

Mason's Health Defenders Yellow Tablets. (Safe and sure remedy for Piles—25c a box.)

Mason's Health Defenders Yellow Tablets. (Mason's Remedies are put up in 10, 25 and 50-cent boxes.)

Mason's Health Defenders Yellow Tablets. (Mason's Remedies are put up in 10, 25 and 50-cent boxes.)

Mason's Health Defenders Yellow Tablets. (Mason's Remedies are put up in 10, 25 and 50-cent boxes.)

Mason's Health Defenders Yellow Tablets. (Mason's Remedies are put up in 10, 25 and 50-cent boxes.)

Mason's Health Defenders Yellow Tablets. (Mason's Remedies are put up in 10, 25 and 50-cent boxes.)

Mason's Health Defenders Yellow Tablets. (Mason's Remedies are put up in 10, 25 and 50-cent boxes.)

Mason's Health Defenders Yellow Tablets. (Mason's Remedies are put up in 10, 25 and 50-cent boxes.)

Mason's Health Defenders Yellow Tablets. (Mason's Remedies are put up in 10, 25 and 50-cent boxes.)

Mason's Health Defenders Yellow Tablets. (Mason's Remedies are put up in 10, 25 and 50-cent boxes.)

Mason's Health Defenders Yellow Tablets. (Mason's Remedies are put up in 10, 25 and 50-cent boxes.)

Mason's Health Defenders Yellow Tablets. (Mason's Remedies are put up in 10, 25 and 50-cent boxes.)

Mason's Health Defenders Yellow Tablets. (Mason's Remedies are put up in 10, 25 and 50-cent boxes.)

Mason's Health Defenders Yellow Tablets. (Mason's Remedies are put up in 10, 25 and 50-cent boxes.)

Mason's Health Defenders Yellow Tablets. (Mason's Remedies are put up in 10, 25 and 50-cent boxes.)

Mason's Health Defenders Yellow Tablets. (Mason's Remedies are put up in 10, 25 and 50-cent boxes.)

Mason's Health Defenders Yellow Tablets. (Mason's Remedies are put up in 10, 25 and 50-cent boxes.)

Mason's Health Defenders Yellow Tablets. (Mason's Remedies are put up in 10, 25 and 50-cent boxes.)

Mason's Health Defenders Yellow Tablets. (Mason's Remedies are put up in 10, 25 and 50-cent boxes.)

Mason's Health Defenders Yellow Tablets. (Mason's Remedies are put up in 10, 25 and 50-cent boxes.)

Mason's Health Defenders Yellow Tablets. (Mason's Remedies are put up in 10, 25 and 50-cent boxes.)

Mason's Health Defenders Yellow Tablets. (Mason's Remedies are put up in 10, 25 and 50-cent boxes.)

Mason's Health Defenders Yellow Tablets. (Mason's Remedies are put up in 10, 25 and 50-cent boxes.)

Mason's Health Defenders Yellow Tablets. (Mason's Remedies are put up in 10, 25 and 50-cent boxes.)

Mason's Health Defenders Yellow Tablets. (Mason's Remedies are put up in 10, 25 and 50-cent boxes.)

Table with 4 columns: People's Gas, Southern Pacific, Northern Pacific, etc. with various numerical values.

Table with 4 columns: WHEAT, May, July, etc. with numerical values.

Table with 4 columns: COIN, May, July, etc. with numerical values.

Table with 4 columns: STOCKS, Bid, Asked, etc. with numerical values.

Table with 4 columns: BOND, Bid, Asked, etc. with numerical values.

Table with 4 columns: Philadelphia Grain and Produce, etc. with numerical values.

Table with 4 columns: New York Grain and Produce, etc. with numerical values.

Table with 4 columns: Wall Street Review, etc. with numerical values.

Table with 4 columns: Chicago Live Stock Market, etc. with numerical values.

Table with 4 columns: East Liberty Cattle, etc. with numerical values.

Table with 4 columns: Oil Market, etc. with numerical values.

Table with 4 columns: New York Live Stock Market, etc. with numerical values.

GRAND TWIN SALE ONE WEEK. BURNHAM'S CREAM, BURNHAM'S HASTY, CUSTARD, JELLYCON.

CONTAINS NO CORN STARCH, requires no eggs, no cooking. Prepared in a moment by simply adding one quart of boiling milk.

TWIN SALE EXPLAINED. Beginning April 9th, All Scranton Grocers Will Sell 2 packages Burnham's Hasty Jellycon and...

1 package Burnham's Hasty Jellycon and... 1 package Burnham's Cream Custard... for 15c

The manufacturers wish to extend the high reputation of these goods and bring the knowledge of their superior qualities to more families in this vicinity.

Send Your Order to Your Grocer At Once.

Hayes & Varley Easter Greeting. We shall be glad to greet you during the coming week and show you new, fresh merchandise in every department at money-saving prices.

Silk and Washable Shirt Waists, Gloves, Hosiery, Underwear, Corsets, Neckwear, Handkerchiefs, Ribbons, Laces, Etc., Etc.

424 and 426 Spruce St., bet. Washington and Wyoming

Chicago Live Stock Market. Chicago, April 9.—Cattle—Receipts, 17,000; generally higher, active; beef on sale today.

East Liberty Cattle. East Liberty, April 9.—Cattle—Active and higher; extra, \$5.00; prime, \$4.50; common, \$3.50.

Oil Market. Oil City, April 9.—Credit balances, \$1.90; certificates, no bid; shipments, 128,000 barrels; average, 87.00.

New York Live Stock Market. New York, April 9.—Beef—Steady and bulk; steady fat cows; strong; other steady; steady.

THE MARKETS.

Wall Street Review. New York, April 9.—The stock market made the expected recovery to Saturday's unfavorable bank statement by gain drawing in of speculation.

Chicago Live Stock Market. Chicago, April 9.—Cattle—Receipts, 17,000; generally higher, active; beef on sale today.

East Liberty Cattle. East Liberty, April 9.—Cattle—Active and higher; extra, \$5.00; prime, \$4.50; common, \$3.50.

Oil Market. Oil City, April 9.—Credit balances, \$1.90; certificates, no bid; shipments, 128,000 barrels; average, 87.00.

New York Live Stock Market. New York, April 9.—Beef—Steady and bulk; steady fat cows; strong; other steady; steady.

Chicago Live Stock Market. Chicago, April 9.—Cattle—Receipts, 17,000; generally higher, active; beef on sale today.

East Liberty Cattle. East Liberty, April 9.—Cattle—Active and higher; extra, \$5.00; prime, \$4.50; common, \$3.50.

Oil Market. Oil City, April 9.—Credit balances, \$1.90; certificates, no bid; shipments, 128,000 barrels; average, 87.00.

New York Live Stock Market. New York, April 9.—Beef—Steady and bulk; steady fat cows; strong; other steady; steady.

Chicago Live Stock Market. Chicago, April 9.—Cattle—Receipts, 17,000; generally higher, active; beef on sale today.

East Liberty Cattle. East Liberty, April 9.—Cattle—Active and higher; extra, \$5.00; prime, \$4.50; common, \$3.50.

Oil Market. Oil City, April 9.—Credit balances, \$1.90; certificates, no bid; shipments, 128,000 barrels; average, 87.00.

New York Live Stock Market. New York, April 9.—Beef—Steady and bulk; steady fat cows; strong; other steady; steady.

Chicago Live Stock Market. Chicago, April 9.—Cattle—Receipts, 17,000; generally higher, active; beef on sale today.

East Liberty Cattle. East Liberty, April 9.—Cattle—Active and higher; extra, \$5.00; prime, \$4.50; common, \$3.50.

Oil Market. Oil City, April 9.—Credit balances, \$1.90; certificates, no bid; shipments, 128,000 barrels; average, 87.00.

New York Live Stock Market. New York, April 9.—Beef—Steady and bulk; steady fat cows; strong; other steady; steady.

Chicago Live Stock Market. Chicago, April 9.—Cattle—Receipts, 17,000; generally higher, active; beef on sale today.

SPRING

The world is waking from its long winter sleep. The sun has crossed the line. The robins are beginning to sing and bright skies and bright eyes are everywhere.

This is a glorious Spring for us. It does a man's heart good to have his customers return, grasp his hand with warm congratulations, and declare you have saved him from \$10.00 to \$20.00 on his Spring suit.

Millionaires have been our customers here. Men who have always paid from two to three times the price we charge, but when they see our stylish fitting, see our perfect tailoring, examine our pure beautiful woolsens, they are flocking to us by hundreds.

Only one price, remember, the five hundred kinds of goods to select from. Beautifully made to your measure—made just like a \$30 suit. You'll be proud of it. Come and get some samples.

None Higher \$15 None Lower

SEPARATE TROUSERS, \$4, ALL MADE TO ORDER.

Scotch Woolen Mills Co.

Scranton Branch, Lackawanna Avenue, Opposite Jonas Long's.