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The Centre Baporter $1.00 a year 

  

Flint, Michigan 

Check Chevrolet 
Delivered Prices 

They include the Thomas Delane; 

Mr. and Mrs 

sons James and Ea: 

Edith and Loise, 

Benjamin Gentzel, Mr 

Delaney 

of Centre Hall 
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DECKER CHEVROLET CO., Bellefonte 

HOMAN MOTOR CO., Centre Hall 
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TELEPHONE COMMUNICATION 

  

THE NEW ERA IN 

  
  

N seven years, the time con- 

sued in making an out-of 

town call has been cut to 

less than nalf. 

Nearby points are now reached 

just as on local calls. That spells 

CONVENIENCE. 

fn 1920 it required about fifteen 

minutes to reach a city two hun- 

dred wiles away. Today, the 

nation-wide average time is five 

minutes, and few calls require as 

emch as ten. That spells SPEED. 

Last year alone the amount of 

telephone “trouble” was reduced 

"17%. Storm- and trouble-defying 

THE BELL TELEPHONE COMPANY 

OF PENNSYLVANIA 

J. H. CAUM, Manager 

cables are fast replacing 

open wire lines. That spells 

DEPENRABILITY. 

Canada, Cuba, and now parte of 

Europe and Mexico are within 

talking distance. That spells 
GREATER SCOPE. 

A more convenient, a faster, a 

more dependable service, and a 

service which reaches almost the 

And it did not «just happen.” 

Fifty years of research, study, 

development, experiment, and ex- 

perience are responsible for this 

new-era teleplsne service, 
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lowest handling 
and financing 
charges available 
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\Y ASHINGTON 
16-Day Excursion 

FRIDAY, OCTOBER 14 

$11.82 
Round Trip from CENTRE HALL 
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We will hatch 

the Interest 
When You 

Deposit 

the Contents 

SAYEINA 

“GOLDEN EGG” BANK 

FIRST NATIONAL 
BANK 

CENTRE HALL, PA. 

  

  

All Nash cars now have 

Special Springs 
RS of secret process alloy steel 

@ The © 

Easiest Ridin 
you have ever enjoyed 
This new riding EASE—a notable 
feature of the Advanced Six 4-Door 
Sedan—is exclusive to Nash by 
reason of springs built of special 
secret process alloy-steel. 

These springs are engineered ex- 
actly to the weight and size of each 
Nash model. And shock-absorbers 
are provided, too. 

So the road comfort of this car is 
absolutely amazing. DRIVE itand 
experience it yourself, 

This is the SPEEDIEST car in the 
whole Nash line and the FASTEST 
car of its field in getaway. And its 
great, newly.perfected 7-bearing 

{THE NEW NASH IS A 

ng 
motor has EXTRA POWER for 

every emergency. 

Low to the road, with small wheels, 

it is a picture of motor car smart. 

ness and grace. 

Silver-finished fittings, vanity case, 

smoking set, tufted genuine mohair 

greater quality despite the LOWER 
' price. 

SPECIAL TERMS are now avail 
able on the car you own. Drive 
down today and examine this Ad. 
vanced Six 4-Door Sedan—the 
leader of the whole Nash line. 

GREAT AUTOMOBILE} 

Hosterman’s Garage centre Ha, pa.  


