
Ee

a
Bellefonte, Pa., December 7, 1923.
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GRAY MEEK,
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Te Correspondents.—No communications

published unless accompanied by the real

mame of the writer.
  

Terms of Subscription.—Until further

motice this paper will be furnished to sub-

‘seribers at the following rates:

Paid strictly in advance

Paid before expiration of year 1.75

Paid after expiration of year 2.00

Published weekly, every Friday morn-

img. Entered at the postoffice, Bellefonte,

Pa., as second class mail matter.

In ordering change of address always

give the old as well as the new address.

It is important that the publisher be no-

tified when a subscriber wishes the pa-
per discontinued. In all such cases the
subscription must be paid up to date of

eancellation.

A sample copy of the “Watchman” will

be sent without cost to applicants.

$1.50

 

The Message of

the Christmas

Seal.
 

Five years ago
the secretary of
the State Tuber-
culosis so ciety
came to Belle-
fonte to enlist co-
workers in the

fight against the “white plague” and
was doing his best to win a small
group of listeners to his cause when
one member was called away and, in
departing remarked, “I am glad to
have met you, Mr. D—, and wish you
success in your mission, but think it
an unnecessary work as I do not know
of a single case of tuberculosis.”

“That may be true of Bellefonte,
Mr. M—,” replied the secretary, “but
there are 10,000 deaths annually in
Pennsylvania from this cause and it
is no doubt in your midst but you do
not realize it.”

Five years have passed and that
same group have seen three fine young
men and a charming young woman,
graduates of our High school, loving
to live but, after a desperate fight,
laid in their graves, victims of tuber-
culosis. Four children, ranging in
age from six to twelve years, taken
from the schools to Cresson for treat-
ment; eleven suspect cases in (the
High school that needed and received
medical attention until discharged;
seven advanced cases among adults,
not to mention the patients who have
been attending the State clinic for a
year and are under Dr. David Dale’s
care.
How does the Christmas seal figure

in our story?
Christmas seal funds are used in

combating tuberculosis, through the
employing of nurses and educational
workers; educational efforts as to the
nature, treatment and prevention of
tuberculosis; efforts for the establish-
ment and aiding of nursing, clinic,
hospital and sanitorium service, sum-
mer camps and open air schools;
building up of healthy children; con-
ducting of health surveys; medical
service, and sending patients to san-
atoria.

In this community, the money has
been used the past year in paying one
hundred dollars for the use of the
room in which the tuberculosis clinic
is held Tuesday afternoons, and, in
financing the work of a dental hygien-
ist for four months in our schools.
The seals are now on sale at Lyon

& Co., Hazels, and Cohen’s dry goods
stores, Motts’ and Runkle’s drug
stores, the Bush house and Bickett’s
pool room in the Brant house, and
from volunteer workers who are mak-
ing a house-to-house sale. The seal
is only a tiny bit of paper but it is a
wonderful messenger of health and
hope as it flies through the mails.
Use it on your letters and parcels and
help “wipe tuberculosis out of Penn-
sylvania!”

  

Monthly Report of Red Cross Nurse.

The report of the Red Cross nurse,
Mrs. Merrill Hagan, for October is:

 

Nursing care visits - - - 99

Instruction or demonstration - 20
Investigation visits - - - 43
Miscellaneous visits - - - 51

Visits to schools - - 14
Number of individual pupils inspected 129

. Total number visits - - - 227
 

2
10

Patients accompanied to doctor  -
Patients accompanied to clinic

Attendance at Well-baby clinic 43

Office interviews - - 3 15
Approximate number of hours in office 34

 

Expenses:

Nurses salary - - - $100.00

Garage rent, auto repairs, gas,

scrubbing and drugs - 11.90

Fees collected - - - - 7.50

 

This is a New One.

When renewing her subscription to
the “Watchman” a day or so ago, a
lady told us that she didn’t like to be
bothered with pennies in her purse
so as she gets them in marketing she
drops them in a box and at the end of
the year counts them and usually |
finds enough to pay for her reading .
matter.

Quite an idea, isn’t it? But it is
needless to say the lady hasn’t any
youngster’s between the ages of eight

 
and fourteen, “snoopin’” around her |
house and “snitchin’”
lolly pops.

 

——Genuine Tennessee
chests, the lasting X-mas gift, $15.00
to $45.00.—W. R. Brachbill’s Furni-
ture Store. 48-1t

 

——*“Diamonds of Malopo,” a won-
derful serial story begins in this issue,

pennies for

 

Brothers Die a Week Apart.

On Thursday, November 22nd, Wil-

liam Longwell died at his home in

Gassaway, W. Va., and his brether

Thad, who came east from Iowa to at-

tend the funeral, died just one week

later at the home of his sister, Miss

Elizabeth Longwell, in Bellefonte.

Both were sons of William Hamilton

and Anna Marshall Longwell, omne-

time well known residents of Belle-

fonte.

William H. Longwell, the first to

pass away, was born in Bellefonte on

July 26th, 1864, hence was in his six-

tieth year. His boyhood days were
spent here but at the age of twenty

years he went to Manassas, Va., where

he accepted a position in a large hard-
ware store. That place was his home
until about thirteen years ago when
he moved to Gassaway, W. Va., where
he was in the employment of a rail-
road company. His death was the
result of stomach trouble with which

he had been ailing for two years or
more.
While living in Manassas he mar-

ried Miss Elizabeth Alexander Sin-
clair who survives with six children,
namely: Mrs. O. D. Waters, of Ma-
nassas; W. H. Longwell, of Clarks-
burg, W. Va.; Mrs. Omer Frame, Mrs.
Asa Carr, Mrs. C. L. Lehnis and Ar-
thur L., all of Gassaway. The re-
mains were taken to Manassas, Va.
where funeral services were held and
burial made on Sunday, November

25th.
 

Thaddeus Mitchell Longwell, who
came east for the funeral of his
brother, came to Bellefonte on Wed-
nesday afternoon of last week for a
brief visit before returning home. The
day before he left home his family
physician told him he was afflicted
with valvular heart trouble, but if he
avoided strenuous exercise of all kinds
there was no reason why he shouldn’t
make the trip. On Wednesday even-
ing he attended prayer meeting in the
Presbyterian chapel and when he re-
tired that night felt as well as ever.
At five o’clock Thursday morning he
called his sister and said he was very
sick. A physician was called as
quickly as possible but his condition
was such that he was beyond help and
he passed away at 3:25 o’clock the
same afternoon,
Deceased was born in Bellefonte on

July 8th, 1862, hence was 61 years, 4
months and 21 days old. His boyhood
life was also spent in Bellefonte and
as a young man he learned telegra-
phy under the late W. L. Malin, who
had charge of the Western Union tel-
egraph office. Having mastered the
key he was given a job in the railroad
office at Milesburg, being later trans-
ferred to Snow Shoe. From the latter
place he went to Steelton where he
spent twelve years in the credit de-
partment of the Steelton Store com-
pany. Returning to Bellefonte he was
with the Central Railroad of Pennsyl-
vania company five years then went
to Belington, W. Va., where he was
identified with a coal company for
eighteen months after which he mov-
ed to DesMoines, Iowa, where he has
since been in the employ of the Rock
Island Railroad company.
While living in Snow Shoe he mar-

ried Miss Mary Curtis Byers, of Lew-
isburg, who survives with four chil-
dren, Mrs. Claude Casebeer, Joseph
and Anna, all of Des Moines, and Mrs.
Daniel Stearns, of Ottumwa, Iowa.
The brothers are also survived by one
sister, Miss Elizabeth Longwell, of
Bellefonte, and one brother, S. Linn,
whose present whereabouts are un-
known. Both men were members of
the Presbyterian church.

Notified of his father’s sudden
death Joseph Longwell came east from
DesMoines and made arrangements
for the shipment of the body to its
late home. Consequently brief funer-
al services were held at the Longwell
home at 1:30 o’clock on Sunday after-
noon by Rev. Dr. Schmidt, and the re-
mains were taken west on the 3:08 p.
m. train. Burial was made in Des-
Moines on Tuesday afternoon.

4040 Il If
ARD.—Mrs. Mary C. Ard, widow of

the late Joseph B. Ard, during his life
one of the best known residents of Pine
Grove Mills, and mother of Rev. Wil-
son Potter Ard, pastor of the Luth-
eran church of Bellefonte, passed
away on Tuesday night at the home
of her niece, Mrs. Homer Decker, of
Spring township, following a critical
illness of less than a week, although

| she had not enjoyed the best of health
for some time past.
She was a daughter of Piersol and

Lydia Lytle and was born on the old
Lytle homestead near State College
seventy-three years ago. In 1885 she
married Mr. Ard and all their married
life was spent at Pine Grove Mills.
She was a life-long member of the
Presbyterian church and a woman
whose every day christian life left its
impress upon all who came in contact
with her. Her husband died a number
of years ago and her only survivors
are one son, Rev. Ard, of Bellefonte,
and two brothers, Andrew J. Lytle, of
State College, and’ Moses, living in
Nebraska.
Funeral services will be held at two

o’clock this (Friday) afternoon at the
Lutheran parsonage in Bellefonte,
after which the remains will be taken
to Pine Grove Mills for burial.

| fi
DECKER.—Seward C. Decker died

at his home in Georges Valley, last
Saturday, following a lingering illness
with dropsy and other complications.
Though born in Centre county the

| greater part of his life was spent in
cedar ' Altoona. Ten years ago he moved to

Georges Valley where he has lived!
ever since. He is survived by his wife
and two sons, Chester, at hime, and
Byron, a student at State College.
Burial was made in the Georges Val-
ley cemetery on Tuesday.

 
|

 

 

PARSONS.—Mrs. Frances A. Par-

sons, wife of William B. Parsons, ! 3
| died at her home in that city, on Sun-postmaster at Julian, died at one

o'clock last Saturday morning at the
home of her brother, V. G. Henderson,
at Woodland, Pa. She had not been
in good health for some time and sev-
eral weeks ago underwent an opera-
tion at the Clearfield hospital.
recovered sufficiently to be taken to
the home of her brother, but suffered
a relapse and her death was the re-
sult.
She was the daughter of John C.

and Elizabeth Henderson and was
born in Patton township on October
28th, 1857, hence was 66 years, 1
month and 4 days old. Most of her
life had been spent in Huston town-
ship and at Julian. She was a mem-
ber of the Baptist church for forty
years and a woman who had the re-
spect and esteem of all who knew her.
She had no children but is survived

by her husband, four sisters and one
brother, namely: Mrs. Elizabeth Tay-
lor, of Altoona; Mrs. Emma Fleck, of
Tyrone; Mrs. George B. Stevenson, of
Waddle; Mrs. Ollie Gaup, of Tyrone,
and V. G. Henderson, station master
at Woodland. Her father, John C.
Henderson, served two terms as coun-
ty commissioner.

Funeral services were held in the
United Brethren church at Julian at
10:30 o’clock on Wednesday morning
by Rev. Parsons, of the Baptist
church, after which burial was made
in the Dix Run cemetery.

I! : i
JACOBS.—William Jacobs, a vet-

eran of the Civil war and for many
years a resident of Pine Grove Mills,
died at noon on Wednesday of last
week at the home of his daughter,
Mrs. John Thomas, at Osceola Mills,
following an illness of nine weeks as
the result of general debility.
He was eighty-one years old and

was a native of Huntingdon county.
During the Civil war he served as a
member of Company F, 19th regi-
ment Pennsylvania cavalry. He was
with General Sherman’s army on its
famous march to the sea, was captur-
ed by the Confederates and spent five
months in Andersonville prison. The
suffering and starvation he underwent
at that time brought him to the verge
of a physical wreck so that he never
entirely recovered therefrom. Some
years after his return from the war
he located in Pine Grove Mills and
that had been his home until after the
death of his wife, less than a year
ago, when he went to make his home
with his daughter.
His survivors include one son and

two daughters, John H. Jacobs, of Ve-
nango county, Mrs. Thomas and Miss
Elizabeth Jacobs, both of Osceola
Mills. Funeral services were held at
two o’clock on Saturday afternoon,
burial being made in the Umbria cem-
etery, at Osceola Mills.

il fi
.. SEIBERT.—Harry Seibert, a broth-
er of borough manager James D. Sei-
bert, of Bellefonte, died in the Wind-
ber hospital on Tuesday morning fol-
lowing an operation for gall stones.
He was a son of Jacob and Ann

Elizabeth Seibert and was born in
Bellefonte on November 12th, 1863,
hence was a few days over sixty years
old. His early life was spent in Belle-
fonte but about thirty-five years ago
he went to Philipsburg where he
worked in the Edward Tyson meat
market for a number of years, later
going into business for himself. Fif-
teen years ago he sold out and moved
to Barnesboro. During his residence
there he served a number of years as
street commissioner.
While still living in Bellefonte he

married Miss Mary Heinle, who died
many years ago. Later he married
Miss Olive Brown, of Munson, who
survives with six children, namely:
Chester, Harry, George, Max, Jack
and Mary, all at home. He also leaves
three brothers and two sisters, James
D. Seibert, of Bellefonte; Mrs. Etta
Newlin, of Pittsburgh; Mrs. Carrie
Kirk, of Hammond, Ind.; Alfred and
Frank Seibert, of Philipsburg. Burial
was made at Barnesboro yesterday.

Il dl
McLAUGHLIN.—Mrs. Nancy Me-

Cummins McLaughlin died at the
home of her niece, Mrs. Robert
Banks, in Altoona, on Saturday after-
poon, following seven month’s illness
with a complication of diseases. She
was a daughter of William and Mar-
garet McCummins and was born at
Mt. Eagle, Centre county, a little over
sixty years ago. She was a member
of the United Brethren church and the
Powhatan council Degree of Pocahon-
tas. Surviving her are two brothers
and two sisters, Robert and George
McCummins and Mrs. Virginia Kunes,
of Altoona, and Mrs. Mary Irwin, of
Milesburg. Burial was made in the
Oak Ridge cemetery, Altoona, on
Tuesday afternoon.

fl i
HOFFMAN.—Herman F. Hoffman,

a brother of - Mrs. Jonas Stine, of
State College, died at the Mercy hos-
pital, Altoona, last Friday night, as
the result of blood poisoning which
developed from a slight cut on one of
his hands. He was a native of Lan-
caster and was sixty-seven years old.
For almost forty years he was an em-
ployee of the Waltham Watch compa-
ny, at Waltham, Mass. Of late he
had been making his home at Altoo-
na. Among his surviving brothers
and sisters is Squire J. B. Hoffman,
of Philipsburg.

il I
DIVELY.—A. V. Dively, for mere

than fifty years a member of the Blair |
county bar and during the past thir- |
ty or more years prominent in Demo-
cratic political circles, died at his
home in Altoona on Sunday afternoon
following an illness of two years. In
addition to his extensive law practice
he had various business interests in
Altoona and Blair county.

She

WARD.—Mrs. Mary Brett Ward,
wife of G. W. Ward, of Pittsburgh,

day, as the resultof an affection of
the heart and other complications
with which she had suffered the past
two years. '
She was the eldest daughter of the

late Robert G. and Laura C. Brett,
and was born near Perry, Kansas, on
February 8th, 1871, hence was in her
fifty-third year. When a small child
the family came to Centre county and
located on the well known Brett farm
in Ferguson township where she grew
to womanhood. Her father was pro-
thonotary of Centre county during the
eighties and at that time the family
lived in Bellefonte, going from here
to Pine Grove Mills. In August, 1888,
she married G. W. Ward, a Pine Grove
Mills boy, and they took up their res-
idence in Pittsburgh, which had been
her home ever since. She was a mem-
ber of the Methodist church and a
most lovable woman in every way.

In addition to her husband she is
survived by the following brothers
and sisters: J. E. Brett, of Seattle,
Washington; Charles and Anna, of
Perry, Kan.; Thomas P. and Mrs.
Margaret Healy, of Cochranton, Pa.
The funeral was held on Wednesday
afternoon, burial being made in the
Homewood cemetery.

fl I
WOLF.—J. Benner Wolf died at the

day morning, following an illness of
several years with tubercular menin-
gitis. He was a son of George C. and
Mary Wolf and was born in Bellefonte
a little over forty-seven years ago.
The greater part of his life, however,
has been spent in Altoona where for
a number of years he has been a mem-
ber of the city fire department. He is
survived by his wife, his father and
three brothers, W. Harry, George W.
and John R., all of Altoona. Burial
will be made in that city this morn-
ing.

IIl
BRANDON.—Many Bellefonte peo-

ple remember Mr. and Mrs. Roy F.
Brandon, who roomed at the Misses
Benner during their two years’ res-
idence here about ten years ago, and
all will learn with regret of the death
of Mrs. Brandon, at her home in
Youngstown, Ohio. During their stay
in Bellefonte Mr. Brandon was sales-
man for the Oliver typewriter, while
Mrs. Brandon taught music and was
leader of the choir in the Presbyter-
ian church. Her death occurred on
Wednesday of last week following an
operation.

 

BIRTHS.

Martin—On November 2, to Mr. and

a daughter, Betty Ann.

Mrs. George Reed, of Coleville, a
daughter, Sarah Louise.

‘Brooks—On November 1, to. Mr.
and Mrs Elwood Brooks, of ‘Pleasant
Gap, a son, Ray Penrose.
Newman—On November 6, to Mr.

and Mrs. George L. Newman, of Miles-
burg, a son, Marlin Lewis.

Mr. and Mrs. Charles A. Hockenberry,
of Bellefonte, a daughter, Anne Eliza-
beth.
Breon—On November 8, to Mr. and

Mrs. William P. Breon, of Walker
township, a daughter, Emma Pearl.

Gordon—On November 5, to Mr.
and Mrs. Samuel F. Gordon, of Spring
township, a daughter, Mary Ruth.

Spicer—On November 16, to Mr.
and Mrs. Toner A. Spicer, of Belle-
fonte, a son.
Flack—On November 12, to Mr. and

Mrs. Joseph M. Flack, of Port Matil-
da, a son.
Dullen—On November 18, to Mr.

and Mrs. John W. Dullen, of Nittany,
a daughter, Mary Margaret.
Mongan—On November 15, to Mr.

and Mrs. William E. Mongan, of
Bellefonte, a son, William Joseph.

Torsell—On November 12, to Mr.
and Mrs. Michael Torsell, of Belle-
fonte, a daughter, Caroline Virginia.

Stitzer—On November 16, to Mr.
and Mrs. Charles Stitzer, of Pleasant
Gap, a daughter, Phyllis Elizabeth.

Mott—On November 18, to Mr. and
Mrs. Basil J. F. Mott, of Bellefonte,
a son, Basil Justin Fontenoy Jr.
Woomer—On November 21, to Mr.

and Mrs. L. F. Woomer, of State Col-
lege, a son, Robert Eugene.

Spearly—On November 21, to Mr.
and Mrs. Paul R. Spearly, of Belle-
fonte, a daughter, Fae Arlene.

Lowry—On November 23, to Mr.
and Mrs. Sherman E. Lowry, of Belle-
fonte, a daughter.
Emel—On November 23, to Mr. and

Mrs. James E. Emel, of Spring town-
ship, a son, James Robert.
Sagar—On November 25, to Mr.

and Mrs. Harry E. Sagar, of Belle-
fonte, a son, Elwood Jacob.
Bryan—On November 25, to Mr.

and Mrs. M. A. Bryan, of Bellefonte,
a daughter.
Stover—On November 20, to Mr.

and Mrs. Joel Stover, of Zion, a son,
Robert Carl.
Mite—On November 21, to Mr. and

Mrs Frank Mite, of Bellefonte, a son,
Joseph.
Hartsock—On November 23, to Mr.

and Mrs. Paul Hartsock, of Belle-
fonte, a daughter, Mary Grace.

Eckley—On November 19, to Mr.
and Mrs. Paul N. Eckley. of Benner

. township, a son, Wayne Elwood.

| Lucas—On November 26, to Mr.
and Mrs. Clarence Lucas, of Belle-
| fonte, a daughter, Elizabeth Anne.
| Tonalio—On November 24, to Mr.
and Mrs. James Tonalio, of Pleasant
Gap, a daughter, Grace Mary.

 
 

——Don’t fail te start reading

“Diamonds of Malopo” which begins

in this issue. It is a story that will
interest vou very much.

 

——Women’s $8 and $9 pumps and

oxfords reduced to §5.85Yeager5.
-1t

Mercy hospital, Altoona, on Wednes-

Mrs. Harry C. Martin, of Bellefonte, !
|

Reed—On November 5, to Mr. and

Hockenberry—On November 7, to |

A

How to Mail Your

Packages.

Postmaster John L. Knisely, in ask-
ing the co-operation of the public dur-
ing the holiday season rush, offers the
following suggestions about mailing
Christmas packages which, if follow-
ed, will be a great help in handling
your gifts to friends and practically
insure their reaching their destination
on time:

In wrapping any tying packages
use heavy paper and strong cord or
twine.

Fragile articles, easily broken, must
be crated.

Perishable matter will be sent a
reasonable distance, and should be
special delivery.

All packages addressed to points
within one day’s travel should be
mailed not later than December 21st;
two day’s travel December 18th; three
day’s travel December 16th, and more
distant points not later than the 14th.
Parcels may be endorsed “Do not
open before X-mas.”
Do not place stickers or Christmas

seals on the address side of the par-
cel, and do not seal packages with
stickers.
Use ink in addressing packages and

in addition to the name, city and
State be sure to put on the street and
number. Write your return address
in the upper left hand corner of all
packages.
By complying with the above you

will greatly assist in expediting the
mail during the X-mas rush.

Christmas

 

 

 

——Spinet desks, tea wagons, gate-
leg tables, Windsor chairs, cedar
chests, electric floor and table lamps
for X-mas.—W. R. Brachbill. 48-1t

 

——All $7, $8 and $9 shoes reduced
to $5.85, at Yeager’s. 48-1t

 

Expense Accounts of the Candidates

Filed.

The following candidates for county
office at the last election filed their
expense accounts this week.
They are recorded as follows: John

Spearly, Democrat, Commissioner-
elect, $146.80; William H. Brown, de-
feated aspirant for sheriff on Repub-
lican ticket, $210; James W. Swabb,
Democrat, Commissioner-elect, $189.-
54; John G. Love, Republican, defeat-
ed for District Attorney, $100.50; Har-
ry A. Rossman, Republican, for Reg-
ister, $269.66; Roy Wilkinson, Repub-
lican, for Prothonotary, $150; E. R.
Taylor, Democrat, for Sheriff, $300;
Harry P. Austin, Republican, Com-
missioner, $74.

 

 

A Girls’ Minstrel Show.
 

The black and white revue will be
the name under which the next big
amateur theatrical undertaking will
be staged in this place. The date for

. the showing has not been fixed, but
i rehearsals are well along and from
. what we hear a sparkling musical and
, comedy production may be expected.
i It will be a girl show entirely.
i Men are only wanted in the audience
‘and as it is to be in charge of Mrs. R.
| Russell Blair something worth while
is in store for us soon.

 

| ——The story going the rounds of
i the State newspapers to the effect
that hunters in the Seven mountains
recently found, in a secluded ravine,
a wrecked automobile bearing a 1916
. license plate and containing three
| skeletons, is a fake. It originated
i months ago and at that time it was
| reported that the car bore 1901 li-
| cense plates, but as automobiles were
not licensed in 1901 the fellow who
has revamped the wild tale has

| brought it up to 1916.

 

——George B. Mann and his son
| Russell, of Howard, who got into trou-
ble with some foreigners at Viaduct,
Clearfield county, where they were all
working, and were put in jail for ap-
pearance at court, have been released
on bail. It appears that Russell got
into the mix-up first and swung a club
that felled several of his assailants.
Then his father went to his aid with
a gun but did not shoot. The Manns
were arrested afterwards.

 

 Meda Torsell, the west High
street shoemaker, with his young son
Mike, left Bellefonte on Wednesday
for New York city expecting to sail
the latter part of the week for Italy
in responseto a cablegram informing
him of the illness of his wife. While
he made no definite plans for the fu-
ture he confessed that if possible he
will return in the spring.

 

 The J. T. Zeigler home on Rey-
nolds avenue was purchased last Sat-
urday by Roy H. Grove, for $2500.

 

CENTRE HALL.

A daughter was born to Mr. and
‘ Mrs. Claude Dutrow, on the 4th inst.
| Mrs. Ellen Miller and Miss Caro-
line McClaskey, of Potters Mills, spent
the week at the Bartholomew home.

| Prof. Fuhrman motored to his home
on Thanksgiving day. Rev. Bingman
and family ate their Thanksgiving
dinner in West Milton.

  
Rev. and Mrs. Roy Corman, of Sun-,

bury, spent part of the hunting sea-
son in this locality. Hunters are nu-
merous hereabouts at present.

Among those who spent Thanksgiv-
ing at home were, Prof. L. O. Packer,
Miss Elizabeth Royer, J. F. Moore,
H. E. Weaver and Miss Miriam Huy-
ett.

Mr. and Mrs. L. R. Lingle are the
proud grandparents of Lucille Lingle,
who was born in the James Lingle
home, in New York, on Wednesday of
last week. =

 

Get your job work done here.

Church Services Next Sunday.

ST. JOHN'S EPISCOPAL CHURCH.

Services for the week beginning
December 9th: Second Sunday in Ad-
vent, 8 a. m. Holy Eucharist; 9:45 a.
m. church school; 11 a. m. Mattins
and sermon; 7:30 p. m. evensong and
sermon. These services will be in
charge of the Rev. A. M, Judd. The
usual Wednesday evening and Thurs-
day morning services will be omit-
ted this week. Visitors always wel-
come.

 

Rev. M. DeP. Maynard, Rector.

METHODIST EPISCOPAL CHURCH.

The pastor will speak at 10:45 on
“Some things we learn in the school
of experience,” and at 7:30 on “The
outstanding characteristics of the
early Church.” The sacrament of
baptism for children at 10:45.

Monday night, teacher training;
Tuesday night, class; Wednesday
night, church training school.

E. E. McKelvey, Pastor.

ST. JOHN'S REFORMED CHURCH.
Services next Sunday morning at

10:45; sermon, “The Reward of
Faith.” Evening at 7:30, sermon,
“When He Came to Himself.” Sun-
day school at 9:30 a. m., and union C.
E. society at 6:45 p. m.

Ambrose M. Schmidt, D. D., Minister.

ST. JOHN'S LUTHERAN CHURCH.
“The Friendly Church.”

Second Sunday in Advent. Sunday
school 9:30. a. m. Morning worship
with sermon 10:45. Vesper service
7:30, “The Question of the Centuries.”
Second in a series of Advent sermons.
Visitors are always welcome.

Rev Wilson P. Ard, Minister

AARONSBURG REFORMED CHARGE,

Services for Sunday, December 9:
Millheim—Sunday school at 9:30;

regular services at 10:30.
Salem—Sunday school at 1; regular

services at 2.
Subject: “The Coming of Redemp-

tion and the Kingdom.”
Are you a reader of the Messenger?

If not, you ought to be.
Rev. John S. Hollenbach, Pastor.

CHRISTIAN SCIENCE SOCIETY.
Christian Science Society, Furst

building, High street, Sunday service
11 a. m. Wednesday evening meet-
ing at 8 o’clock. To these meetings
all are welcome. An all day free
reading room is open to the public
every day. Here the Bible and Chris-
tian Science literature may be read,
borrowed or purchased.

 

 

 

PINE GROVE MENTIONS.

J. A. Peters is breaking ground for
a new house.
David F. Kapp, of State College,

spent a few hours here on Sunday.

W. Paul Goss is in Philadelphia,
under treatment of an eye specialist.

Mrs. Susan Peters is quite ill, suf-
fering with a complication of diseas-
es. :

W. H. Miller was taken to the
Bellefonte hospital on Monday as a
medical patient.

- George Burwell has been secured to
teach the Glades school in place of
Miss Mary Slagle, resigned.

Miss Maude Glenn, of State Col-
lege, was a guest of Miss E. V. Dale,
on the Branch, on Thanksgivine day.

David Noll, for the past t..o years
farmer on the J. G. Miller farm, flit-
ted to Zion on Monday, his former
home.

Mrs. Leland Harpster, of the
Branch, spent Thursday with her old
neighbor, Mrs. Jacob Reish, at Rock
Springs.
Miss Ella Livingstone, teacher of

the grammar school at Reedsville,
spent her Thanksgiving vacation at
the St. Elmo. ‘

Mrs. Ruth Goss Little, who under-
went an operation at the Clearfield
hospital on Thanksgiving day, is re-
ported as getting along very nicely.

Our hat is off to George Burwell
for a nice hunk of delicious venison
taken from the first buck killed in this
section on the opening day of the sea-
son.

 

——

NEW ADVERTISEMENTS.
 

 

ARM FOR RENT.—110 acre farm- on
State Highway, 8 miles from Lock
Haven. Apply to

J. LINN HARRIS,
421 West Main St.

Lock Haven, Pa.68-45-tf

SALE OR RENT.—A large two-
story brick dwelling house on the

 

Fr
north side of east Linn street,

Bellefonte, Pa. Possession can be given
January 1, 1924. Information can be givéh
by the undersigned. :

ELLIS L. ORVIS
68-48-2t Bellefonte, Pa.

OR SALE.—The famous Hubler Inn
Topersy along the state highway,
n the village of Hublersburg, Cen-

tre county, Pa. This is a two story hotel
building, with a frontage of 39 feet, ex-
tending back 64 feet, with a commodious
barn; all situated on a lot of ground con-
taining about two acres. This is an ideal
site for a road-side inn. Apply to ORVIS
& ZERBY, Bellefonte, Pa. 68-48-2t

K EYSTONEPOWERCORPORATION.

 

—The Board of Directors of the
Keystone Power Corporation has

declared quarterly dividend No. 7 of one
and three-quarters (13%) per cent. upon
the preferred capital stock of the Compa-
ny, payable January 2, 1924, to stockhold-
ers of record at the close of business, De-
cember 20, 1923.

68-48-1t reasurer.

DMINISTRATOR'S NOTICE. — Let-
ters testamentary on the estate of
Louise Garman Harper, late of

Bellefonte, Centre county, deceased, hav-
ing been granted to the undersigned nll

i persons knowing themselves indebted to
said estate are hereby requested to make
immediate payment and those -having
claims will present them, properly au-
thenticated to

LULU M. HARPER,
W. HARRISON WALKER,

Bellefonte, Pa. Administrators.

C. C. MecBRIDE,
Treasurer. 

| 68-46-6t
msm

Concrete Mixers for Sale

One 1-bag Boss mixer on truck:,

with 6 h. p. gas engine and loading

skip.

One No. 14 E steam driven Foote
Paving Mixer, on caterpillar traction,

/ with loading skip and shute discharge.

STANDARD SUPPLY AND EQUIPMENT

68-48-1t CO. OF PA. ALTOONA, PA.

 

 


