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Bellefonte, Pa., August 20, 1915.

To CORRESPONDENTS.—No communications
published unless accompanied by the real name
of the writer.

 

 

THINGS ABOUT TOWN AND COUNTY.
 

——Soft cream mint wafers made every

day, 30 cents a 1b.—CANDYLAND.

———-Another son was born to Mr. and

Mrs. Blaine Mabus, on Saturdaynight.

——Another car load of prisoners was

taken to the penitentiary at Rockview on

Monday.

——E. B. Wood, of Unionville, was

brought to Bellefonte on Monday and

jailed for beating his wife.

——The Schenck family reunion at-

tracted quite a crowdto Schenck’s grove,

below Howard, yesterday.

——In the official program for Lock

Haven’s Old Home week Wednesday has

been designated as “Bellefonte day.”

——The few warm, dry days have given

the farmers an opportunity to get their

oats in the barn and mostof it has been

housed.

——A young son born to Mr. and Mrs.

Frank Curtin, of San Bernardino, Cal.,

on August 5th, has been christened

Edward Draper Curtin.

——Charles E. Gates is at present act-

ing agent for the Central Railroad of

Pennsylvania at Salona, owing to the

death of George W. Pletcher.

——Mrs. Joseph Ceader is ill at her

home on Spring street, suffering with'a

badly sprained foot. A misstep at Hecla

was the cause of the accident.

——The members of the Lemont M,

E. church will hold a festival on the

church lawn on Saturday evening, August

28th, to which everybody is cordially in-

vited. .

——Gregg Post last evening presented

to the Bellefonte Lodge of Elks the flag
that floated over the Governor’s mansion

in Harrisburg when it was occupied by

Governor Andrew G. Curtin.

——J. Mitchell Bennetts, of the Anti- |
Saloon League, will speak at Unionville

on Wednesday evening, August 25th.

The meeting will be held either in the

Presbyterian church or in the open air.

——Howard Smead returned home last

Saturday from the sanitorium at Mt.

Clemens, Mich.,, where he was for two:

weeks for treatment for rheumatism.

His condition is considerably improved.|

——W. H. Musser recently resigned as

justice of the peace in the North ward of

Bellefonte and on Tuesday Governor

Brumbaugh appointed his son, Horace;
M. Musser to serve out the unexpired

term.

——Miss Beulah Woods has resigned

her position as stenographer in the Pot-

ter-Hoy hardware store, and Miss Re-

becca Fleming has been selected as her

successor. The change will take place

September 1st.

——Watsontown residents are celebrat-

ing an Old Home week gathering this

week, and next week Lock Haven will

have a similar celebration. The com-

mittee of arrangements in the latter

place is aiming to make it one of the

biggest affairs ever held there.

——A charter was granted at Harris-

burg during the past week to the Titan

Metal company, Bellefonte, capital $100,-

000. The incorporators are C. H. Kerk,

Philadelphia; C. Y. Wagner, F. E.

Naginey, William P. Seig, John S. Walker,

John McCoy and A. Fauble, all of Belle-
fonte. :

——Harry Jodon, who last April frac-

tured his leg in a motorcycle accident

near Harrisburg, being off duty ever

since, went to Altoona on Monday to re-

sume work as a telephone lineman. His
leg is in pretty good shape but it will
probably be several weeks before he tries
pole climbing.

——After trying the prisoners two days
as helpers for the carpenters employed
in thebuilding operations at the new
penitentiary they were found to be inad-
equate for the work demanded and on
-Saturday word was sent around to the

«old force of laborers to return to work
«on Monday morning.

——The big Hazel--Schaeffer reunion
“will be held at Madisonburg on Thursday
“of next week, August 26th. This is one
of the biggest annual gatherings held in
Brush valley and is not confined to the

family clan, as everybody is invited.
There will be lots of music, plenty to eat
and a good attendance of politicians.

——Bellefonters who took the time to

go to the Scenic on Tuesday and see
“Cabiria” witnessed one of the most
spectacular of modern motion picture

productions. It was exceedingly elabor-

ate and pleased all who saw it. Manager

T. Clayton Brown takes special interest in

getting everything possible to please. the
patrons of the Scenic and this is the

great reason why he has large houses
every evening.

——On Friday afternoon the engine of

the Snow Shoe train jumped the track at
No. 2 switch, while on the trip down the

mountain and literally dug up about two

hundred feet of track. Fortunately at
that place the cars were being pushed

ahead of the engine so that none of them

were derailed and nobody hurt. Pas
sengers and mail were transferred at the

wreck and the Tyrone work crew re-
‘paired the damage.

—Automobilists from Altoona, Tyrone,
Philipsburg, Snow Shoe, ‘State College,

Bellefonte and Lock Haven held a picnic

and motorists’ convention at Hecla park

last Friday which proved an interesting

as well as delightfully pleasant gathering.

The two men specially interested in get-

ting up the picnic were Representative

Harry B. Scott, of Philipsburg, and Prof.

C. L. Goodling, of State College. Repre-

sentative Scott had the backing of Comr-

gressman Charles W. Rowland and thirty

car loads of Philipsburgers, while Prof,

Goodling had his “pet” bulldog which

will not ride in anything but a Haynes
car, and an all-star baseball team with

which to hold up the reputation of State

College.

The car attendance was good, given by

a man who claimed to have counted them

of cars. Considerable interest was mani-

fested in the ball game in the afternoon,

between teams from State College and

Philipsburg, the former winning by the

that they had not thought it necessary

to bring their best team along. During

the game Harry Townsend, of the Phil-

ipsburg aggregation, twisted his ankle

and had to be sent home.

Neither State Highway Commissioner
Cunningham nor Paul C. Wolf, secretary

of the Pennsylvania Motor Federation,

were present, but Commissioner Cunning-

ham sent his speech which was read at
the meeting held after the ball game by G.

W. Brusstar, registrar in the automobile

division of the Highway Department.

Quite a number of the automobile con-

tingent remained at the park for the

evening dance.

DoLL’s BAKERY TO BE CLOSED OUT.—

William Doll has decided to close out his

bakery in the Bush Arcade in the very

near future, having already quit baking

bread. He has been driven to this

through the competition of the city

békeries, a number of which ship bread
into Bellefonte. To be exact, every gro-

cery store in Bellefonte with one excep-

tion, gets bread every morning from a

city bakery in either Altoona, Williams-
port or Harrisburg, and the result is the

big bulk of Bellefonte’s bread supply

comes from outside the town instead of

going to the home bakeries. As an illus-

tration in Mr. Doll’s case, the time was

when he used three barrels of flour every

day in his baking, while lately his aver-

age has been less than three-fourths of a

barrel. © The ice cream business has also

been crippled by the wholesale makers
and dealers.

As soon as he can close out his store

Mr. Doll will movehisice plant from the
rear.of the Bush ‘Arcade ta .one of the
office buildingsout"at ithe" Nittany fur-

nace, which was purchased by his broth-

er, George Doll, and install it there. He

will then embark in the ice business and
also manufacture ice cream for the

wholesale trade. May he have success

in his new undertaking.

THouGHT HE Was A HoLp-uP MAN.—

Some time between nine and eleven

o'clock last Thursday night a telephone

pole broke off .and fell across the state

road about midway between Bellefonte

and Zion; or to be exact, it was the very

pole where the fatal aceident occurred

about eighteen montns ago. F. S. Knecht,

of the Palace garage, on a trip down the

road between eleven and twelve o’clock,

drove into the pole but fortunately was

not going fast enough to wreck his ma-
chine.

Being unable to get the pole out of the
road he went to a near-by farm house

and got an axe intending to chop the

pole in two. But just when he returned

to the road he saw another machine

coming. Mr. Knecht stood in the road

and signalled the driver to stop but he,

fearing the Bellefonte auto dealer was a

hold-up man, attempted to dash around

him, with the result that he, too, collid-
ed with the pole. No great damage was

done his machine but the occupants got

a good shaking up. The men in the car

then assisted Mr. Knecht in removing

the pole from the road and the next day

the break was fixed by the telephone

company.

A MiIracULOUS EscaPE.— Clyde Smith,

lineman for the American Union tele:

phone company, had a miraculous es-

cape from electrocution last Saturday

morning, and that he is alive today is
probably due to the “first-aid” treatment

of a fellow workman,

Mr. Smith and W. O. Knarr were down

at Milesburg testing wires, using a loop
for that purpose. Knarr was on thepole
and Smith on the ground. The test made

Knarr thew his end of the wire down and

instead of going overit fell on one of the
high tension wires of the State-Centre

Electric Co., carrying 2,100 volts, and
Smithgot thefull force, being knocked
unconscious to the ground. :

His fellow workman hurried to his

side and found him unconscious. He

at once resorted to the pumping of the

arms, and various respiratory methods

taught in “first aid” work and after
laboring almost ten minutes succeeded in
restoring him to consciousness. He

was then brought to a Bellefonte phy-

sician who found no permanent ill ef-
fects but whostated that the “first aid”
work probably saved his life.

 

——Joseph Undercoffer, assistant bag-

gage agent at the Pennsylvania railroad

depot, has been housed up the past ten days with quite a painful illness.

"MOTORISTS PicNiC' AT HECLA PARK. |

at 228, but the crowd did not appear!

commensurate in size with the number

score of 8 to 4, but big Dave Atherton

explained their defeat on the grounds :

——MTrs. C. E. Kline, of east Curtin

: street, is offering her home at private

sale. Sheis planning to leave Bellefonte
and locate in Philadelphia, where one of

her daughters has been for some months.

 

——A fair sized crowd was present at

the Yearick-Hoy reunion at Hecla park

on Tuesday and the program was car-

ried out almost to the letter. The music

was furnished by the Howard band, and

considering the fact that it was organized
less than a year ago, their playing was

excellent and much appreciated by all.

 

——There were four wagons at curb

market on Tuesday morning with large

quantities of potatoes, corn, cabbage and

apples, and a few plums, beans, beets,

i radishes, etc. There were few buyers,

however as there has ‘been such a
small curb market so far this season that
house-wives have not been very frequent

patrons.
 

——A force of state highway men are

now at work resurfacing and oiling the

state road down Nittany valley, and auto-

mobilists and travelers through that sec-

: tion should remember that the road will

 
| be roped off for sixty-four hours after

the oil is put on. This is done not so

muchto give the oil time to soak in as‘a
precaution against accidents, as the oil

| is applied quite heavily and untilit dries
| is very slippery.

——Edward J. Eckenroth hitched up

one of his young horses on Wednesday

evening and just as he got into the buggy

the animal frightened at something,

plunged across Ridge street and colliding

with the pavement threw Mr. Eckenroth

out. The buggy ran over him and he
was quite badly bruised while his right
leg is also hurt, but up until yesterday

noon his physician was unable to deter-
mine whether any of the bones were
fractured.

te

——1In last week’s WATCHMAN was pub-

lished a notice of the supposed marriage

of Ralph Judy, of Baileyville, and Miss

Annie Deter, of Graysville. The infor-

mation was received from what we con-

sidered a perfectly reliable source, how-

ever, a letter received from the young

lady this week states that the item was

incorrect, as she has not entered into a

matrimonial alliance with any one. The

WATCHMAN apologizes for the uninten-

tional error and makes this correction in

justice to the two. parties most intimate-

ly concerned.
 

——The crusade started by the Belle-

fonte authorities against the automobile

speed maniac and the driver who per-

sists in running through the town with

his cut-out open has not yet reached that
stage where motorists deem it the better

part of discretion to regard the law,as

laid down in the borough traffic ordi-
nance. The latter is broken ozens,of
times a day and so badly bent all the

time that there is little justification for
its existence. The Bellefonte police are

threatening greater vigilance in the fu-

ture but a few more arrests and the

consequent fines will do more to abate
the nuisance than anything else.

  

——There is a law providing a fine of

fifteen dollars for any property owner or

tenant who fails to cut Canada thistle

and other noxious weeds before they go

to seed and pollute the community. There

are many lots in Bellefonte, both vacant

and occupied, that have been allowed to

grow up with an abundant crop of all

kinds of weeds. These should be cut

now, as the seeding time of many of

them will soon be here. The Bellefonte

authorities are sending out notices to a

number of property owners this weekto

cut their weeds andit would be well for

all property owners to : clean up their

back lots. Do this before September
first, or you may be liable to a fine as

well as the expense of having the weeds
cut by the borough authorities.

 

——Buyers are now traveling through

Centre county purchasing horses for the

British and French armies. All horses

must size up to certain specifications. Of

course the first requisite is that they are

sound in body, limbs and wind. For the

cavalry they must be at least fourteen

hands high and weigh from eleven to

twelve hundred pounds. For the artillery
the weight must be not less than four-

teen hundred. While the age limit is

not such a big factor the horses must be

young enough to be vigorous and speedy.
The maximum price paid is $140 for
cavalry horses and $160 for artillery.

Two car loads have already been ship-

ped from Ceritre county to an assembling

yard on the sea coast and the buyers ex-

pect to ship another car load within a
few days.

——While up at Point McCoy on a
berry pickingexpedition, on Thursday of

last week John McNichols and Percy

Parsons, two Bellefonte boys, came across

a blacksnake of the racer variety and by

means of forked sticks managed to
capture it alive. In order to renderit

harmless they tied a string around its

neck and caging it in a pasteboard box
started for home. Of course, boy like,

they stopped frequently to examine their

captive and every time they did so would
hold it up by the string around its neck,

with the result that by the time they

reached home the snake was so nearly
choked to death that it couldn't even

wriggle. Butthat did not prevent the
boys from showing their prize and later
delivering it te Dr. Weston, at the Y. M.
C. A. as a fit subject for snakeology. The

snake was six feet in length and as thick
as a‘'man’s wrist. 

a

dis, the well known junk ‘dealer, has de-

pects toleave Bellefonte with his family

ber for his southern home.

about closed a deal for the sale of his

close up all his business here within a
month. In his Florida home he will de-

vote all his time to growing oranges,
watermelons and the various fruits na-

tive to that State. Mr. Mendis and fam-

ily have been residents of Bellefonte for

many years, and though of Italian nativi-

ty, they have been good citizens and will

be missed by many people in Bellefonte.

Mr. Mendis, hiowever, is not at aii definite

in the thought that he will never return
to Bellefonte, so that if he makes a com-

fortable fortune in a few years he may

decide to retire and come to Bellefonte
to live again.
 

~——Theladies of the Lutheran church

will hold a festival Saturday evening,

August 28th, on the grounds surrounding

the church. Ice cream, cake and lemon-

ade will be served.
 DE

NEWS PURELY PERSONAL.
 

—Miss Marie Walsh, who is visiting in Philips-
burg, is a guest of Mrs, Jack Hollenback.

—Miss Myra Sechler is spending a part of the
week in Altoona, having gone over Wednesday.

—Miss Sadie Boalich is in Bellefonte after visit-
ing for several weeks with friends in Mt. Carmel
and Shamokin.

—Mr. and Mrs. Harry Murtoff and daughter
Eleanore have been in Juniata this week visiting
Mr. and Mrs, H. T. Miller.

—Mr. and Mrs. H. J. Hartranft and son Harris
'| were at Milton on Tuesdayattending the annual
reunion of the Hartranft family.

—Mrs. Edward Woods and her two children,
Miss Mame and John Woods, have been spend-
ingthis week with friends in Tyrone.

~—Mr. and Mrs. Ritz McCafferty and Mr. and
Mzs. H. E. Sweetman were at Mill Hall over
Sunday as guests of Mrs. Nancy Johnson.

—Mrs. Irvin Underwoodand three children, of
Renovo, are spending the week in Bellefonte as
guests at the home of Mr. and Mrs. Isaac Under-
wood.

-==Mrs. Fred Kurtz came to Bellefonte yester-
day,to visit for an indefinite time with her broth-
er, T. H. Harter, at his home on Allegheny
street.

. —Miss White, who has been visiting with Dr.
and Mrs. Nissley for the past six weeks, left
Bellefonte Tuesday, to return to her home in
McKeesport.

~—Rev. and Mrs. Willis Hartsock, of Camp Hill,
Harrisburg,are spending a portion of the rev-
erend’s vacation at the home of his parents on
Buffalo Run.

=Carl W. Royer, of Niagara Falls, has been in
Bellefonte this week with his sister, Miss Pearl
Royer, being on his way to Atlantic City fora
shott vacation.

;=Mr. and Mrs. Shoontz, of Lewisburg, and
theirfive daughters, were in Bellefonte over Sun-
day,guests of Robert Sechler and his daughter,
MissMyra Sechler..

..—MTrs. Harris and Mrs. Watorioen. of Provi
dence, R. I, both sisters of Col. W. F. Reynolds,

homeon Linn street..

~—Mr. and Mrs. Ostertag, who have been visit-
ing with Mrs. Ostertag’s parents, Mr. and Mrs.
Gamble, for the past two weeks, returned to
their home in Harrisburg, Sunday.

—Mr. and Mrs. A. C. Mingle will go to Atlan-
tic City early in the week, where Mr. Mingle,
who has been in ill health all summer, will be
under treatment for several weeks.

 =Mrs. Daniel Keller joined her daughter, Miss

Lucy Keller, here yesterday. Mrs. Keller, had
stopped for a short visit in Boalsburg, on her
way to Bellefonte from Philadelphia.

—Raymond Martin, of Clearfield, who is visit-
ing in Bellefonte, has spent his time while here
with his grandmother, Mrs. Martin, of Bush’s
Addition, and with Mr. and Mrs. Clyde Smith.

—Miss Belle Confer, one of the very efficient
workers in Bellefonte’s most unique industry,
The Basket Shop, has gone to Howard to spend
her vacation period among relatives in that

vicinity. -

Mrs. Blackburn went to Philadelphia yester-

day, leaving her children for the present with her
mother, Mrs. J. L. Spangler. Mrs. Blackburn
and her family came here from Fishertown,
Tuesday.

—Mrs. C. K. Hicklen and her daughter, Miss
Mary Hicklen, with Mrs. James Williams, of
State College, left Bellefonte last week to spend

—Mrs. Harry Otto, of Johnstown, was in Belle-
fonte over Sunday, having come here for her
daughter, who has been spending the greater
part of the summer with her grandmother, Mrs.
Jerry Nolan.

—Mr. and Mrs. Jos. L. Montgomery returned
to Bellefonte Tuesday night from a three weeks
stay at Atlantic City, where Mr. Montgomery,
through the treatment at Galen Hall, recovered
from his recent indisposition.

—Mrs. Joseph Harris and her children have
been in Bellefonte this week with Mr. Harris’
mother, Mrs. Rachel Harris. Mr. and Mrs,
Harris left the east over a year ago and now
make their home in Oklahoma.

—Mrs. Charles Shafner and her daughter, Miss
Anne Shafner, came here from Philadelphia
Wednesday, and are now guests of Miss Mary S.
Thomas. Mrs. Shafner and her daughter will be
in Bellefonte for an indefinite time.

—Mrs. Lew Burnell and Mrs. Pennington,
who have been visiting with friends in Wash-
ington and Philadelphia, for some time arrived
inBellefonte Wednesday and will be the week-
end guests of Mrs. M. C. Levi, before returning
to their home in Lock Haven.

—Mrs. A. O. Furst and her grand daughter
Louise left Bellefonte Monday for Philadelphia,
where Mrs, Furst will join W. S. Furst, of Over-
brook, and his family for a motor trip. Louise,
whohasbeen visiting here’ for some time, was
returning to her home at Ridley Park.

—Dr. Curry, Dr. Monahan and Mr. Seaman
have been in Bellefonte since Saturday of last
week, having motored here from their home in
Cleveland. Upon leaving to return tomorrow
they will be accompanied by the Misses Anna,
Sue and Christine Curry, who will visit in Ohio
for a week or ten days before returning to Belle-
fonte.

—MTrs. R. B. Curry has returned from a short
stay in Pittsburgh, .and has arranged to leave
Bellefonte this month. Mrs. Curry is visiting
with her father, Charles Cook, having come here
the first of July. Miss Anna Cook, who returned
home last week; had been spending a month with
her aunt, Miss Carrie Rankin, at Graysville, 
A
‘I'and with relatives in Pittsburgh.

WiLL MovE TO FLORIDA.— Peter Men. |;

cided to shake the dust of Bellefonte ls

from his feetand move to Florida. He |
recently purchased a fine fruit farm near’

the city of Tampa for $22,500, and ex-:

some time during the month of Septem-

He has:

home on east High street and expects to

are Mr. and Mrs. Reynolds’ guests, at their |

two weeks at the Shore and with friends in Phil- |
‘adelphia.

given in Tyrone on Monday evening.

—Miss Mary Mallory, ofPittsburgh, is a vis-
itor among Bellefonte friends this week.

—Henry C. Quigley Esq. spent the fore part of
- the week on a business trip to Pittsburgh.

—Miss Sarah Kellermanis in Altoona visiting
| her sister, Mrs. Harry Auman, and family.

| —Miss Louise Kerstetter, of Curwensville, is
visiting her grandmother, Mrs. M. W. Furey.

—Mrs. Frank Slade has had as guests this
week Miss Ethel Berry and Miss Eddy, of Wil-

i liamsport.

—Mr. and Mrs. Frank Graham, of Milton,
motored to Bellefonte and return on Sunday
afternoon.

—Austin Bartley, of Altoona, spent Sunday
i with his parents, Mr. and Mrs. Henry F. Bartley,
of this place.

Bellefonte visiting her sister, Mrs. John Klinger,
on-east Lamb street.

—Edward Daley left on Monday to spend his
vacation with his sister, Mrs. Walter Fulton and
family, in Pittsburgh.

—Anna I. Massey is spending the latter part
of this month with her mother, Mrs. C. T.
Massey, at her home in Philadelphia.

—Mrs. Frank Ingram and son Ralph,of Greens-
burg, arrived in Bellefonte on Saturday to visit
the former’s son, George Ingram and wife. :

—Mr. and Mrs. Edward Klinger and son
Donald spent Sunday in Altoona with Mrs.
Klinger’s brother, Arthur Proudfoot and family.

—Dr. and Mrs. Ambrose M. Schmidt, with
their son William and John Harper, departed on
Saturday for a ten days sojourn at Niagara Falls.

—Mr. and Mrs. Howard Smith were summon.
ed to Shamokin on Sunday on account of the
seriousillness of Mr. Smith’s sister, Miss Sarah
Smith.

—Mr. and Mrs. Van Jodon are entertaining
Misses Pearl and Winifred Whippo, of Wilkins-

week’s visit.

—MTr. and Mrs. William Weiler, of Hanover,
were guests of Mr. and Mrs. Harry Clevenstine
from Sunday until yesterday, being here on: their
honeymoon trip.

—After spending a month: with his brother,
Jacob Levi and wife, in Lock Haven, Leopold
Levi returned to his home on south Spring street
Saturday afternoon.

—Joseph Katz was a memberof a motor party
from Lewistown to Bellefonte on Sunday, thus
enabling him to spend several hours with his
father, Aaron Katz.

—Elizabeth and Robert Gherrity, daughter and
son of Mr. and Mrs. P. H. Gherrity, are in Ty-
rone spending some time with their sister, Mrs.
James Davisand family:

—MissGertrude Musser, of Spring Mills, and
Miss Beatrice Thomas, of State College, were
week end guests of Mr. and Mrs. William J.
Musser, on east Lamb street.

—Frank Crissman, who is now employed on
the job of resurfacing the state highway from
Snow Shoe to Clarence, spent a short time in
Bellefonte on Monday morning.

—After spending two months in Bellefonte
Miss Catharine Brisbin left for Philadelphia on
Sunday evening where she will spend a week or
two before returning to Chicago.

—Russell Mallory accompanied Edwin A.
Murphy and son Malin on a-motor trip back to
Philadelphia on Tuesday, expecting to spend a

week or more in the Quakercity.

—Grant Kessling, of Snow Shoe, the man who
looksafter the trainmaster’s department of the
Pennsylvania railroad in that place, was in Belle-
fonte on a business mission last Friday. =

= MS; WilliamL. Steelésand daughter, Miss
Olie Steéle,wentout “to Pittsburgh”on. Monday
to visit Mr. and Mrs. Cecil Craig. - From there
Miss Olie will go into Ohio to visit relatives.

—William S. Rider, who holds down a good
position at Beaver Falls, arrived in Bellefonte

‘ Saturday to visit his parents, Mr. and Mrs,
Henry Rider, and his sister, Mrs. Van Jodon.

—On Saturday Joseph Torsell closed his shoe
repairing shop on west High street and the same
evening left for Lock Haven to join his wife.
They expect to go te housekeeping there in the
near future.

—William Carson, of near Spring Mills, was a
business visitor in Bellefonte last Saturday. Mr:
Carson is now one of Pennsvalley’s progressive
farmers and we expect in a few years to hear of
him retiring on awell earned competence.

—Misses Sarah Wetzel, Marguerite Lambert
and Stella Whittaker will go to Williamsport
tomorrow where they will visit friends and also
join a camping party on Trout run during the
two weeks they will be away from Bellefonte.

—Dr. George Kirk with his sisters, Misses
Mary, Nora and Loraine Kirk, of Kylertown, and
Mrs. Eames Heron, of West Lawrencetown,
Nova Scotia, composed an automobile party who
spent Tuesday at the home of Dr.and Mrs. M.A.
Kirk.

—After an absence of six2 wacks during which
she attended the funeral of her sister in
Harrisburg, and visited another sister-in-law,
Mrs. Pat McCaffrey, in Lock Haven, Miss Anna
McCaffrey returned home the latter part of last
week.

—Mrs. James K. Barnhart went down to Phila-
delphia on Saturday afternoon where she was
met by her sisters, the Misses Campbell, of
Punxsutawney, and after attending the millinery
openings all of them went over to Atlantic City
for a brief sojourn before returning home.

—MTr. and Mrs. Harry Ulmer Tibbens and sons,
Frederic and Louis, of Wheeling, W. Va., were
visitors in Bellefonte a part of this week. Mr.
Tibbens was born in this town and is agraduate
of theBellefonte High school in the class of '89,
theclass which formed the High school library.
He is the advertising manager for Stone &
Thomas, who conduct the largest department
store in West Virginia.

—Last Saturday morning Thomas M. Gates, of
Altoona, accompanied by Mrs. Mingle and Mrs:
Musser, of Tyrone, came to Bellefonte and the
same afternoon took his wife home from the

| Bellefonte hospital, where she had been for three
weeks recovering from a very serious operation.

Gates’ mother, Mrs. Wilson Gardner, who had
been in Bellefonte most ofthe .time during her
daughter’sillness. . ;

—Mr. and Mrs. G. Fred Musser: taking with
them as guests Mr. and Mrs. Jerome Harper and
Mrs. Edward Harper, left here Friday in Mr.
Musser’scar for Scranton, where Mr. and Mrs.
Musser will visit with Mr. and Mrs. Boyd A.
Musser, the remainder of the party spending
their time with Mr. and Mrs. Archibald Saxe.
Miss Louise Harper, who has been visiting in
Bellefontesince the first of July, left here the
same day to return to her home in Scranton. -

—James A. Gleason Esq., of DuBois, was in
Bellefonte on Wednesday on a business trip and
was kept pretty busy shaking hands with his
wany friends. Pennsylvania has produced some
mighty big men and Mr. Gleason stands among
the biggest when it comes to stature. In fact
there are few men in the State who show off so
conspicuously in a crowd, whether it be ina
small Pennsylvania town or one of the large
cities. Itcan also be said ofhim thatheis gifted
in talents.as well as size and is as often referred
to as “the silver tongued orator” as he is point-
ed out as “the tall sycamore of the Wabash”
from Clearfield county. And still more of it he is
a “good fellow well met" at all times. 

—John Woodsattended the assembly and dance !

—Mrs. Jennie Black, of Port Allegheny, is in |

burg, who came to Bellefonte Saturday for a two,
| State, and stopped in Centre county for a rest.

.Mrs. A. G. Morris.

They were accompanied to Altocna by Mrs.

—Mrs. Helen Huston,of Clearfield, spent 3at-
urday in Bellefonte, the guest of Mrs. Evelyn
Rogers,

—Miss Carrie Anderson left yesterday for a
| two week's visit among friends in Altoona and
Johnstown.

Mrs, Elizabeth Brown and son Roy. of Han-
over, were guests of Mr. and Mrs. T. Clayton
Brown last week.

—M. A. Landsy left on Wednesday ona ten
days business trip to Meadville and other towns
in the western part of the State.

—Mrs. Robb, who has spent the greater part of
the summer here with her daughter, Mrs. Mur-
toff, returned to her home at Pittsburgh Satur-
day.

—A little daughter of Mr. and Mrs. W. T.
Hunt, of Renovo,is visiting at the home of her
uncle and aunt,Mrs and Mrs. Robert Woodring,
of Howard Street.

—Dr. George Klump, with Mrs. Kiump and
their two children, were registered at the Bush
house the fore part of the week, having motored
here from Williamsport.

—Miss Madge Orris with her niece and neph-
ew, Isabelle and Gerald Davis, went to West-
port Saturday, to spend Sunday, and the fore
part of the week with Mrs. F. W. Campbell.
Mrs. Campbell is Miss Orris’ sister.

—Mrs. H. B. Mallory, one of the successful
professional women of Altoona, was in Belle-
Jonte for the week-end,visiting with her father,
Joel Johnson. On account of the press of work
Mrs. Mallory was obliged to return home Mon-
day.

—Mr. and Mrs. Julian Walker, of Wilmington,
.Del., and their three children, are in Bellefonte
for a visit of ten days or two weeks. Mr. and Mrs.
Walker and their family came here yesterday
with Mr. and Mrs. John Walker, who met them
with their car in Lewistown.

—Dr. Wilhelmina Key, doing research work for
the state institution at Polk, Pa., spent Sunday
‘and Monday at Hecla. Dr. Key was driving her
car from Philadelphia to the western part of the

spending the time with friends.

—Thomas K. Morris and Miss Nealons, of
Pittsburgh, will come here today, expecting to
spend the time while in Bellefonte with Mr. and

Mr. Morris will. return to
Pittsburgh Sunday, while Miss Nealons will re-
main until the first of September.

—MTrs. Eben Bower went down to Aaronsburg
yesterday where she will visit friends until to-
morrow when she will go to Millheim where she
will be joined by Mr. Bower and Register J.
Frank Smith and daughter, Miss Nellie, and the
quartette will spend the Sunday there.
—The Misses Hazel and Olive Denius, of Balti-

more, stopped in Bellefonte Wednesday to visit
for a short time with Clara Denius and her
daughter, Mrs. Mallalieu. The Misses Denius
were returning from the Exposition in California
and upon leaving here went directly to Balti-
more.

—G. A. Tate spent Tuesday in Bellefonte
with his niece, Mrs. Earl Tibbens. Mr. Tate,
whose home is in Duquesne, came to Centre
county last week with his daughter Mildred,ex-
pecting to visit during the remainder of August
i relatives at Pleasant Gap and Pine Grove

ills.

—Wallace Duncan, of Washington, with Miss
Mable Allison drove here from Spring Mills,
Tuesday for the day. Mr. Duncan and Miss
Madge Gilmour motored from Washington, Miss
Gilmour having stopped at Milton, while Mr.
Duncan came on to Centre county; accompanied
by Charles Gilmour, of Bellefonte. Mr. Duncan
will visit over the county forseveral weeks.
—Gus Rinehart, one of the energetic young

business men of Hazleton, accompanied.by Ray
Stauffer,drove to Bellefonte.Sunday. Mr. Rine-
hart left Monday fora trip through the western
part of the State, while Mr. Stauffer ‘remained
here with Mrs, Stauffer until Wednesday, when
they returned to Hazleton. Mrs. Stauffer had
been spending some time with her parents, Mr.
and Mrs. Martin Cooney.

 

FOR SALE.—Nine room house and bath,
electric light, hot water, heat, splendid
garden andfruit, on a 200 ft. lot. Inquire
of Mrs. C. E. KLINE, Curtin street, Belle-
fonte. 60-33-1t*

For SALE.—All kinds of household
furniture, in good condition, at private
sale. J. S. PownaLL, Milesburg,

60-32-4t*

   

Bellefonte Produce Markets.

Corrected weekly by R. S. Brouse, Grocer.
The prices quoted are thosepaid|forproduce.

Potatoes per bushel.
Onions................
Eggs, per dozen.
ard, per pound.

Butter per pound

 

 

  

  

Bellefonte Grain Markets.

Corrected weekly by C. Y. WAGNER,
Thefollowingare the quotations up to six o'clock

Thursday evening, when our paper goes to press.

 

    

 

Red Wheat.|...... 0.512dbeved $1.10
White Wheat... «1.05
Rye, per bushel............... 80
Corn,shelled, per bushel. 80

rn,ears, per bushel......... 80
Oats, old and new, per bushel... 45
Barley, perbushel.......................c.c.cuin..... 60

 

Philadelphia Markets.

The following are the closing prices of the
Philadelphia markets on Wednesday evening.
Wheat—Red Benak ivastsans tes thesaanshid 11361.1

Corn y x

 

   
4,

16.00@20.
14.00@18.50

.. 9.00@12.50

The Best Advertising Medium in Central
Pennsylvania.

A strictly Demociatic publication with indepen -
dence enough to have, and with ey 28d cour-
age toexpress, its. own views, printed in eight-
page form—six columns to page—and is read
everyweek bymore than ten thousand responsi-

t is issued every Friday morning, atble people.
the following rate: Ee

Paid strictly in advance.............. $1.50
Paid before expiration of year...... 1.75
Paid after expiration of vear........ 2.00

Papers will not be sent out of Contre county un-
less paid forin advance, nor will subscriptions be
discontinued until all a; ihare settled, ex-
cept at the option of the publi

ADVERTISINGCHARGES: .
A limited amount ofadvertising space will be

scld at the following rates
LEGAL AND TRANSIENT,

All legal angSransient advertising running for
four weeks or less,

BUSINESS OR DISPLAY ADVERTISEMENTS

Per inch, first insertion...................50 cts.
Each additional insertion per inch...25 cts.

The following discounts will be allowed on ad
vertisements continued for

Four weeks, and under three mos.10.per ct.
Three mos.and under six mos......15 per ct.
Six mos. and under12112 mos...

 
  25per ct.

Advertisers, andespeciallbraesME

taken of orders toLyad at less than above, no wildaynoncerates above, nor given to
unles

accompanied by theag


