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Summer Assistants Bring Fresh Perspective To 4-H
LOU ANN GOOD

Lancaster Farming Staff
mer assistants, who are busy insti-
gating vigor and enthusiasm into
4-H summer activities.

4-H. We never understood all the
work that is put intorunning a suc-
cessful program until we became
assistants.”

LANCASTER (Lancaster Co.)
—Four new faces continue topop
up at the Lancaster County Penn
State Extension office recently.

They are the faces of 4-H sum-

Although the assistants hadbeen
involvedas 4-H members, now, as
assistants. Marilyn Holloway said,
“We are seeing a different side of

Marilyn has been an active
4-H'er for 10 years. She has won
many outstanding awards for her

achievements. Recently she com-
pleted her freshman year at Hood
College in Frederick, Maryland,
where she is majoring in communi-
cations and has a full scholarship
for her academic achievements.

The daughter of Clifford and
Joyce Holloway ofPeach Bottom
isresponsible for assisting in rural
community 4-H clubs.

The person responsible for
assisting urban 4-H clubs is Katri-
na Boyer. She will be a senior this
fall at Millersville University
where she is majoring in special
education.

The daughter of George and
Roberta Maxwell of West Grove
formerly worked with the 4-H
program in Chester County. She is
really excited about establishing
gardening projects, foods and
nutrition clubs, and teaching cul-
tural crafts toLancaster City child-
ren and teen-agers.

JeffBollinger is well known in

4-H and FFA sheep showing cir-
cles. He has been a member of (he
4-H Woolies Club for seven years.
He recently completed his first
year majoring in animal science at
Penn State University. Jeffslives-
tock experience will be used to
assist Livestock Agent Chester
Hughes. Jeff has his sights set on
becoming a livestockagent after he
graduates from college. He is the
son ofRaymond and Sharon Bol-
linger of Ephrata.

Joel Metzler is the horticulture
assistant. It's his duty to oversee
and monitor many of the gardens
throughout the county. He checks
for bugs and diseases on ornamen-
tals and vegetables. He also
answers questions people have
about gardening when they call the
extension office. Joel is a biology
major at York College and lives
with his parents CLehman and
Alta Metzler in Airville, York
County.

Adventure Pals
Family Fun Fest

Summer assistants at theLancaster County Extension are, from left, Marilyn Hollo-
way, Joel Metzler, Katrina Boyer, and Jeff Bollinger.
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LANCASTER (Lancaster Co.)
Christian Children’s Associ-

ates, Inc., producers of “Adven-
ture Pals” television and radio
programs, will present a “Family
Fun Fest” Saturday, July 16,11:30
a.m. to 2:30 p.m. at Stacey’s
Restaurant (formerly the Home-
style Buffet), Regency Square
Plaza, 101 Rohrerstown Road,
Lancaster, Pennsylvania.

The program, conducted by
Adventure Pals’ Miss Jean, will

feature songs, puppets, clowns,
food and gifts.

Deadline for reservations is
July 11. There will be no refunds
after that date. Tickets for children
under 12 are $2.11 each. For
children over 12 and adults the
cost is $5.29. Children must be
accompaniedby at leastone adult.

For more information, write to
Christian Children’s Associates,
P.O. Box 446, Toms River, NJ
08754, or call (908) 240-3003.
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