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CARLISLE (Cumberland Co.)
Winners of the Pennsylvania

Master Com Growers Association
1991Five-Acre Com Clubcontest
will be honored at the 1992Pen-
nsylvaniaCom Conference March
3 here at the Embers Convention
Center.

Awards were made for both
three-year yield averages as well
as for highest yields during 1991.
One hundred and forty four com
growers participated in the prog-
ram this year.

In addition to awards, the prog-
ram provided each grower with
nutrient management and crop
budgeting information.

In the three-year average class
for shelled com harvested from a
large (more than 3 acres) sample,
first place was awarded to John
McDowell from Mercer with an
average yieldof 163.3bushels per
acre from 1989, 1990, and 1991

from Pioneer 3475. Second place
went to William Bissinger,
Bloomsburg, with an average of
161,7 from 1989 with Pioneer
3343,1990 with Pioneer 3241, and
from 1991 with Pioneer 3527.Lee
Hitz of Annville took third place
with an average yield of 158.3
bushels per acre in 1989 on Pion-
eer 3343 and in 1990-1991 with
Pioneer 3241.

In the three-year average class
for shelled com harvested from a
regular (less than three acres)
sample, first place was awarded to
Lloyd Zookfrom Oley with a yield
of 185.3 bushels per acre off of
1989 yields from Pioneer 3295,
1990from Pioneer 3180, and 1991
from Pioneer 3241. Second place
in this class went to Joe Matejik,
Mechanicsville, with 178.5
bushels per acre off 1989 yields
from Stanford HT 650A, in 1990
from Hytest 650A, and in 1991
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from Hytest 736. Paul Lechner of
Oley, third place, had an average
yield of 176.7 bushels per acre
from a 1989 yield from Pioneer
3295, a 1990 yield from Pioneer
3241, and 1991 yieldfrom Pioneer
3141.

In the ear com class, the three-
year average first place award
went toDavid SchantzofAlburtis,
who has averaged 186 bushels per
acre. Yields came in 1989, 1990,
and 1991 from Pioneer 3358. Sec-
ond place went to Sidney Lewis
from Wysox with an avenge of
181,8bushels per acre in 1989 and
1990 from yields obtained from
Doebler’s 75X, and in 1991 from
Doebler’s 66XP. Thirdplace went
to Dennis Eby from Gap, with a
yield of 178.4 bushels per acre
from 1989,1990, and 1991 plant-
ings of Pioneer 3241.
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seed...
“The W-L I planted two years
ago is giving me better yields
and higher protein than any
previous crop. I had a public
variety in this field last time and
I had to take it out in the third
year. This W-L alfalfa is sure to
go a full four.”

For the 19913-acreharvest size,
first place in the large harvest
shelled com class went to D.
Richard Snyder from Montours-
ville with a yield of 175.2 bushels
per acre offFunks 4624. In thereg-
ular harvest size class, Norman
Jodikinosof Clinton took the hon-
ors with a yield of 194.5 bushels
per acre on Pioneer 3527.

The first place award in the ear
com hand harvest class was won
by Harold and James Bishop from
Muncy with a yield of 184.9
bushels on Pioneer 3245. Mike
Lucas of Zion Groye took the top
honors in the machine harvest ear
com class with a yield of 128.7
bushels peracre on NorthropKing
7705.

1991 Dairy

The Pennsylvania Master Com
Growers Association has more
than 350 members statewide.

(ConflnuKi from Pag* A 26)
LINE F:

Add lines D and E and enter the
result on line F. This value is the
opportunity cost per hundred-
weight of reduced milk tnarket-
ings in 1991.

LINE G:
The breakeven marketing

adjustment is found by dividing
line A by line F. Enter the result
on line G. This amount determines
how much milk should be mark-
eted above 1990’s production
level to justifyan increase in milk
production. In the cull example,
the breakeven adjustment is 59
hundredweights. The dairy farm
shouldmarket at least 59 hundred-
weights more milk in 1991 than in
1990 to justify increased produc-
tion. If milk marketings will not
increase by at least 59 hundred-
weights, then it would be more
profitable to market at 1990’s
level
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Life
For more than 25years, W-L alfalfas have been bred, tested and produced to give high
yields, leafy, fine-stemmed forage with long stand persistence and multiple pest and
diseaseresistance For the best return on yoor investment, you cant afford less them W-L

Solutions. Distributed by:

Farmers
515 N. Franklin St.

Lancaster, PA

(717) 394-7127

A product ofW-L Research. Inc. 2000 Oak St.Bakersfield. CA 93301,(805)327-4491 • Telex
682460 At« condition of sale, please note Statement ofLimited Warranty and Liability onall
W-L orden and tags.


