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Brown
BELOIT, Wis. The national

Brown Swiss Cattle Breeders’
Association recently recognized
productionrecords for a number of
its members’ cows.

In Pennsylvania, three cows
owned by Gary Lee Mase, Leba-
non, recorded lactations worthy of
national recognition.

Mases’ Meadow Hill Performer
Chrissy produced 25,320 pounds
ofmilk in 305 days, freshening at 6
years, 9 months. The milk compo-
nents included 1,036 pounds of fat
and 865 pounds of protein.

Meadow Hill Prospect Lauren,
on a lactation of more than 306
days, recorded 23,540 pounds of
milk with 1,008 pounds of fat and
883 pounds of protein. She
freshened at 6 years, 11 months.

Another cow owned by Mase
was noted for both high fat and
protein production levels. Quiet
Valley JimDandy, freshening at 6
years, 3 months, produced 29,580
pounds of milk, 1,153 pounds of
fat and 1,084 pounds of protein
during a lactation ofmore than 306
days.

A cow owned by Richard Wen-
ger, of Manheim, was also recog-
nized for outstanding production.

Shady Creek Jackie JanR Twin,
was honored twice on a lactation
that began with a freshening at 6
years, 4 months. Before 305 days,
Twin produced 25,890 pounds of
milk, 1,019pounds of fat and 853
pounds of protein.
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After the lactation continued,
she recorded a production of
28,530 pounds of milk, 1,125
pounds of fat and 960 pounds of
protein.

A cow owned by William
Daubert, ofPine Grove, produced
another special record for compo-
nents. Wind Mill Distinction Elis-
sa, ona lactation ofmore than 306
days, that began with a freshening
at 5 years, 6 months, produced
24,860 pounds of milk, 1,028
pounds of fat and 910 pounds of
protein.

Dean and Brenda Daubert, of
McElhattan, related to William,
also had one of their cows receive
high component production dis-
tinction. Wind Mill Distinction
JoanaET, on a lactation thatbegan
at 6 years, 7 months, produced
25,190pounds of milk with 1,004
pounds of fat and 907 pounds of
protein.

In Ohio, recognition went to two
cows owned by the Earl Bursiek
family, of Gibsonburg.

Twin Gate Queenies Rosie and
Twin Gate Marthas Melody both
made high records during lacta-
tions ofmore than 306 days. Rosie
produced 26,510 pounds of milk
starting at 10 years, 7 months, with
1,053 pounds of fat and 874
pounds of protein. Melody pro-
duced 24,280 pounds of milk,
1,007 pounds of fat and 849
pounds of protein on a lactation
that began when she was 9 years.
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Swiss Association Recognizes Cows
A cow owned by Garbro & Bry-

Lyn Swiss, West Salem, Garbro
Telstar Lisa, was recognized for
producing 25,070 pounds of milk,
863 pounds of fat, and 901 pounds
of protein in less than 306 days.

Johann Lovely Lamp ET, own-
ed by Johann Acres, of St. Marys,
was recognized for a production at
4years, on a lactation less than 306
days, of 24,540 pounds of milk,
1,072 pounds fat and 826 pounds
of protein.

Laßainbow Farms, New Knox-
ville, also had a cow worthy ofrec-
ognition. La Rainbow Starfly, at 8
years, 4 months, produced 27,450
pounds milk, 1,166 pounds of fat
and 888 pounds of protein in more
than 306 days.

A cow owned by R-Hart Farm
Wapakoneta, Ohio, had acheived
honorroll status in that her produc-
tion record fell within the top five
all-time records within her age
division.

High Spruce Stretchy Eve, on a
lactation from a freshening at 8
years, 7 months, produced 31,780
pounds of milk, 1,668 pounds of
fat and 1,037 pounds of protein.
Her lactation exceeded 306 days.

Two cows owned by WarWick
Farms, in Ml Vernon, also were
recognized for high lactation
productions.

Warwick Farms Award 805, as
a 2-year-old produced 19,010
pounds ofmilkwith 651 pounds of
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fat and 577 pounds of protein dur-
ing a lactation of less than 306
days.

WarWick Farms Alpine Rosie,
at 6yom, produced 23,450 pounds
of milk, 1,014 pounds of fat and
791 pounds of protein.

A Brown Swiss cow owned by
William Watkins, ofBelmont, was
recognized. Fox Trail Tamara, at
9y4m, produced 24,750 pounds of
milk, 1,048 pounds of fat and 885
pounds ofprotein on a lactation of
more than 306 days.

Top Acres Elegant Fawn, own-
ed byRobert and Mark Witmer, of
Columbiana, at By6m, was recog-
nized fora lactation of less that 306
days with 27,130 pounds milk,
1,058 fat, and 894 pounds of
protein.

In Maryland, a cow owned by
Dwayne Bell, ofKnoxville, Le Fer
Ban Stylish Mary, produced
26,810 pounds of milk, 1,186
pounds fat and 887 pounds ofpro-
tein on a lactation in excess of 306
days. She freshened at 5 years.

In Virginia, a cow owned by
Gary McDonald, Stephens City,
was recognized twice for the same
lactation that she started as a
4-year-old.

Shen-Val Target Miss Happy
received honor roll recognition for
her lactation production under 305
days. Within that time she pro-
duced 26,590 pounds of milk, 969
pounds fat, and 940 pounds of
protein.

to receive recognition was Sand
Rock Jolly Ponder, owned by Oak
Spring Dairy, of Upperville. She
produced 27,450 pounds of milk,
1,029 pounds of fat and 873

pounds ofprotein on a lactation of
mote than 306 days she started at 7
years, 11 months of age.

In New York five cows were
recognized

Vine Valley Peter Belinda,
owned by Leon W. and Leon N.
Button, of Rushville, showed a
production of 24,140 pounds of
milk, 1,002 pounds fat and 869
pounds protein on a lactation of
more 306 days. She freshened at 7
years. 1 month.

Gretna Acres Johnny D Sue,
owned by Gretna Acres, Otego,
showed a production of 23,430
pounds of milk, 1,072 pounds of
fat and 866 pounds of protein on a
lactation of more than 306 days.
She freshened at 3 years, 7 months.

Ka Cy Nelda, owned by Ka-Cy
Farms, of Medina, produced
23,510 pounds of milk, 1,094
pounds fat and 847 pounds protein
on a lactation of more than 306
days. She freshened at 7 years, S
months.

Sunny Acres Tclstar Rinkles,
owned by Lester Tyler, ofMilford,
was recongized twice during the
same lactation that she started at 5
years, 7 months. She had produced
22,580 pounds of milk, 1,008
pounds of fat and 824 pounds of
protein before 305 days. She fin-
ished with 23,680 pounds milk,
1,057 pounds fat and 874 pounds
protein.

She also received further recog-
nition when her lactation extended
beyond 306 days to produce
26,940 pounds milk, 984 pounds
fat and 958 pounds protein.

Another Virginia Brown Swiss

Another ofTyler’s cows, Sunny
Acres Philip Fake, freshened at 4
years, 9 months, produced 27,830
pounds of milk, 1,218 pounds of
fat and 951 pounds of protein on a
lactation of more than 306 days.
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Look For More Information In Next Week’s Issue.
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