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The living room offers spacious space for guests to visit.

GuestsFind A HomeAwayFrom
Home AtMaryland Farm

EVA MARTIN
Maryland Correspondent

DOWNSVILLE, MD. Bed
and Breakfast anyone? There is a
spacious 13-room southern colo-
nial style “home away from
home” awaiting you at Lewrene
Farm. Lewis and Irene Lehman
live in a historical area ofbeautiful
Cumberland Valley farming coun-
try just four miles south of
Hagerstown, near 1-70 and 1-81.
Nearby points of interest -that
attract guests to this lovely home
are Antietam Baltelfield, Harpers
Ferry, Fort Frederick, C&O Can-
al, Gettysburg, Crystal Grottos
Caverns, Appalachian Trail, an-
tique shops, and outlet stores.
They are also within easy driving
distance to Baltimore and
Washington, D.C. for daytime
trips.

In 1969, the Lehmans began
hosting students through Experi-
ment International Living. Many
came from Spanish countries such
as Mexico, Bolivia, and Argenti-
na, staying for two to five weeks.
This was the beginning of what
was to later become a bed and
breakfast venture. When traveling
to Europe, Irene and Lewis
enjoyed staying in guest houses.
Meeting people in this way, also
added to the desire to have their
own bed and breakfast inn.

it possible to sleep up to seven-
teen. Irene has used many of her
collectibles for decorating and
furnishing each room and giving it
a name such as Rose Retreat or
Lilac Haven, indicating its color
theme. Homemade quilts cover
the beds. Quilted wallhangings
and antique pictures hang on the
walls. Homemade curtains, pil-
lows, and other items accent the
beautiful rooms. Treats and

A large 26’x30’ living room
with a fireplace for guests to
experience family togetherness
and two bedrooms with private
baths were added to the Lehmans
original home. Lewis designed the
addition, and his three sons,
Eldon, Donald and Ivan helped
with the building. Three original
bedrooms were converted, making

are being transferred to the area,
stay for several weeks. These
folks become “family members”.
They have hosted persons from
many occupations, and were sur-
prised to learn they had hosted an
employee of the FBI.

Irene serves a family-style
country breakfast at their large
dining table. Her guests enjoy a
special casserole she makes of

This Bed and Breakfast operation has sheltered guests
from around the world.

snacks are on the bedside tables. If
the guests are newlyweds or cele-
brating an anniversary, Irene adds
the personal touch ofcarnations or
roses and a bottle of strawberry
sparkler. '

eggs, bacon, cheese, milk, crack-
ers and butter. Irene also serves
fresh fruits in season. A favorite of
many is her homemade apple-
sauce flavored with cinnamon
hearts. To add variety, she also
makes watfles, pancakes and
homemade breads. Irene tries to
make sure everyone’s tastes arc
satisfied, even if it means serving
corn on the cob for breakfast.
Breakfast has become a fun time
for everyone to get acquainted
with those who have stayed the
previous night.

In 1986,' the Lehmans began
with the Bed and Breakfast Asso-
ciation, Mennomte Your Way and
the' Wycliffe Bible Translators
Association. Then in 1987 went to
national advertising. Many guests
arc now repeats or arc referred by
others. They enjoy the thank you
notes and correspondence from
those who have stayed in their
home. Irens says, “If you don’t

Some guests, who are in the
area for temporary employment or

Each bedroom is furnished uniquely for guests to enjoy. (Turn to Pag* B 18)
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See your nearest
I\EW HOLLAND

Dealer for Dependable
Equipment and

Dependable Service;

PENNSYLVANIA

Annvllle, PA
BHM Farm
Equipment, Inc
RDI, Rte 934
717-867-2211

Beavertown, PA
B&R Farm
Equipment, Inc.
RD 1, Box 217A
717-658-7024

Belleville, PA
Ivan J Zook
Farm Equipment
Belleville, Pa.
717-935-2948

Carlisle, PA
R&W Equipment Co.
35 East Willow Street
717-243-2686

Davldsburg, PA
George N. Gross, Inc.
R.D. 2, Dover. PA
717-292-1673

Elizabethtown, PA
Messick Farm
Equipment, Inc.
Rt. 283 - Rheem’s Exit
717-367-1319

Gettysburg. PA
Yingling Implements,
Inc.
3291 Taneytown Rd.
717-359-4848

Greencastle, PA
Meyers
Implement’s Inc
400 N Antrim Way
P.O. Box 97
717-597-2176

Halifax, PA
Sweigard Bros.
RD. 3. Box 13
717-896-3414

Hamburg, PA
Shartlesville
Farm Service
RD 1, Box 1392
215-488-1025

Honey Brook, PA
Dependable Motor Co
East Mam Street
215-273-3131
215-273-3737

Honey Grove, PA
Norman D Clark
& Son, Inc.
Honey Grave, PA
717-734-3682

Hughesville, PA
Farnsworth Farm
Supplies, Inc
103 Cemetery Street
717-584-2106

New Holland, PA
ABC. Groff, Inc
110 South Railroad
717-354-4191

Oley, PA
C.J. Wonsidler Bros
RD. 2
215-987-6257

Pitman, PA
Schreffler Equipment
Pitman, PA
717-648-1120

Quakertown, PA
CJ. Wonsidler Bros
R.D. 1
215-536-1935

Rlngtown, PA
Ringtown Farm
Equipment
Ringtown, PA
717-889-3184

Tamaqua, PA
Charles S Snyder,
RD 3
717-386-5945

West Grove, PA
S G Lewis & Son,
R D 2. Box 66
215-869-2214

MARYLAND

Churehville, MD
Walter G Coale, Inc
2849-53
Churehville Rd
301-838-6470

Frederick, MD
Ceresville
Ford New Holland, Inc.
Rt 26 East
301-662-4197
Outside MD,
800-331-9122

Hagerstown, MD
Antietam Ford Tractor
301-791-1200

NEW JERSEY
Bridgeton, N.J.
Leslie G Fogg, Inc
Canton &-Stow Creek

Landing Rd
609-451-2727
609-935-5145

Washington, NJ
Smith Tractor &

Equip, Inc
15 Hillcrest Ave
201-689-7900

Woodatown, NJ
Owen Supply Co.
Broad Street &

East Avenue
609-769-0308


