
B4o—Lancaster Farming, Saturday, August 4,1984

FERTILIZED

Cauliflower, cabbage,
brussel sprouts, broccoli,
cut dHI, statica and cut
flowers. Wholesale and
retail. 717-872-7182.

BROILER &

, TURKEY
MANURE
FOR SALE
Delivery anywhere

in 23 ton loads .

717-582-2352

LIME
Calko™ Lime

, plusPotash and 1
Sulfur.

Compareour
analysis!

77% calcium carbon-
ate 40% calcium oxide 1
75 ENP (Effective'
Neutralizing Power)
3% Potash (K2O)1
45% Sulfate USDAi
Tested & Proven Only
$4.60 per ton F.0.8. -

We Deliver 1 1
Agri-Dynamics

Box 318 f
Martin's Creek,

PA 18063
(215)588-8150

SERVICES OFFERED

J.C. Ehrlich Co.. Inc.
* Termite, Pest, Rodent and

Smoke Control. Lawn and
* Shrubbery Spraying. Free
1 estimates. 1278 Loop

1 Road. Lancaster, Pa.
‘ Phone 717-397-3722.

Potatoes For Sale.
Hackman Road, Brun-
nervHle. 717-626-6475 or
717-626-2658.
For Sale - Sweet Com
Silver Queen wholesale
thru August. Stephen Esh,
Westview Drive, Gor-
donville. one mile nor-
theast of Intercourse.
Lancaster County. 717-
768-8932.

PLANTS
FOR SALE

Cabbage
Cauliflower

Broccoli
Red Cabbage

Endive
Kale

Savoy Cabbage
Paul Breneman

717-859-1662

Wanted - Cut Christmas
Trees. Douglas Fir, Scotch
Pines, Blue Spruce. Top
Dollar Paid. 215-691-
6633.

Bradford’s Cattle Hoof
Trimming. 301-452-8574
or 301-838-5105 (ans.
ser.)
Unloved? Unhappy?
Speciafizing in all matters
of love. Often you find
yourself confused, unable
to cope with your
problems such as: love,
marriage, family affairs.
At times you feel you have
failed! You want to know
why. I can helpyou! Cal or
write;

SERVICES OFFERED

(919)977-6633
Roxanne Johnson

Box 1274
Sharpsburg, NC27878

S. SMUCKER
BUILDER

AGRICULTURAL - RESIDENTIAL
Specializing in Pole Bldg’s

R.D. 2 717-768-8606
Narvon, PA 17555 717-768-8614

CROP SPRAYING
ALL TYPES

Soybean - Corn - Hay
Wilt Travel For Large Acreage

Hodockor's Crop Spraying
ROSUtitz, Pa. 17543

717/569-4762

Liquid Manure
Hauling

Manor*Agitator
York, Harford &

Surrounding
Counties

717-382-4881

Custom*
bagging

'''GOSSETT
PREMIXES

CUSTOM
BAGGING

Professional Service ■ ‘
We stay with the

machine to save you
TIME ft MONEY

(Our aim is tokeep
your chopper IN thefield

chopping, not at the
endrow idling).
For prices and

I scheduling
can 717-665-7471

We have liquid
preservative avaa-
SMeft* hagbaling
Wo have dry
fnnecutanttor
ryelage. haylage, ft

These Items Arc
PricedRight

T MOSES B.
1 KING
CARPENTRY &

REMODELING
158 Strasburg Pike

Lancaster, PA 17602
PHAMI

(Driver) 786-1495

CATTLE HOOR
TRIMMING
Donald Schock

717-244-6007
Lancaster &

Surrounding
Counties

SERVICES OFFERED

Soybean roasting on your
farm. Dale L. Schnupp. RD
6 Lebanon, PA 17042.
717-865-6611

HOOF
TRIMMING

M.D. Herr
717-665-2718

Lancaster and
Surrounding

Counties Custom Forage Bagging
will travel. 301-452-5901.

Egg candlers and

Rrecessing plant help
iring immediately,

responsible persons, male
or female, full time
positions. Experience
helpful. Call Ko-Ka-Le-Ko
Egg Ranch. 215-267-2423
between 8 a.m. and 5 p.m.
RD 2 Denver, PA.

I DIVERSIFIED
I ROOFING CO.

Re-Roofing
Specialists

I Shingles, Painted Steel,
| Hot Build-Up Roofing.

; Siding ft Spouting
End yourpainting

( worries and install
barn siding.

Galen Smoker
: 215-593-2887

ATTENTION
FORD TRACTOR

OWNERS
Repairing and

servicingofFord
Tractors.

Experienced. Low
Overhead, Low

Rates. Will do other
makes as time

permits
Litter R. Patches

135 Spangler Rd.
Lebanon. Pa. 17042

273-3679

Herdsman for 200 cow
dairy. Parlor with
automatic take-offs.
Responsibilities include
miking, Al breeding, herd
health, record keeping,
maintaining dairy and
parlor. Housing provided.
Salary negotiable. Six day
work week. References
required. Frederick,
Maryland. 301-874-5229.
Herdsman-Farm Manager
- small registered Holstein
herd. Salary, housing,
fringe benefits above
average. Half way bet-
ween Watkins Glen and
Ithaca, NY. J.C. Dell, Box
A, Mecklenburg, NY
14863.607-387-5871.

SERVICES OFFERED

Livestock hauling. Cows,
heifers, beef, ana horses.
Gooseneck trailer for
easier loading, lower
hauling. Local and long
distance. Call Barry
Wenger, 65 Paradise
Lane. Ronks, PA. 17572.
717-687-7416.

Ag Bag custom filling.
Ernest Kocher, Jr.. R.D. 2,
Birdsboro, PA. 215-
689-5387.

1

Energetic Mormon High
School Graduate to be a
mother's helper and live in
a professional family's
country home. Must drive.
Room, Boerd and salary in
return for watching 2
young children, doing light
housework and occasional
cooking. Must provide
excellent personal
references. Reply to 3401
S. Green Meadow Lane,
Westminster, MO. 21157.
Help Wanted - Manager of
150 acre farm. Cattle,
crops and horses. Limited
housing available. Ex-
perience with machinery.
References required. Rep-
ly with salary desired to
Lancaster Farming, Box
366. L-33, Lititz, PA.
17543.
GOVERNMENT JOBS.
$16,559-$50,553/year.
Now Hiring. Your Area.
Call 805-687-6000 ExL R-
-4156.

Person to milk cows on
200 plus holstein herd.
Would consider man and
wife team. No field work
Housing available phis
other benefits. Farm
located in Lebanon Co.
Job available in August.
Interested persons write
stating experience and
other related information
toLancaster Farming, Box
366, K-23, Lititz. PA.
17543.
Farm Help Wanted • for
miking and field work. Ex-
perience necessary. Hous-
ing and other benefits.
Cal 215-256-6831.
'Dairy Farm in Unionvlle,
'PA. Needs someone ex-
perienced infeeding, mik-
ing care and maintenance
of hoisteins, and Held
work. Housing provided,
salary and health in-
surance. Call
215-347-2346.
Person single or married
to work on beet, tobacco
and crop (arm in Lan-
caster Copnty. Must be ex-
perienced operating
machinery and mutt have
references. 717-733-
4516.
Experienced General Help
Wanted ■ on Chester
County dairy farm. Home
provided. Must give
references. Please call
215-593-5279.
Married person to work on
a modern New York
poultry farm. Experience
necessary. Housing - elec-
tric and fuel furnished.
Remilar time off. Cal
215-479-3532 after 7:30
PM.
Young couple w/two
children needs house to
rent in Gordonvtlle area.
717-354-9114.
Help Wanted - Teenagec
lor fall harvesting. Jacob
S. Smucker, Jr., R.D. 2,
Box 215, Narvon, PA.
17555.

HELP WANTED

Farm Manager - Reliable,
expenencea person or
couple to assume
responsibility for 60 cow
Jersey farm. Excellent
salary, benefits, housing.
Reply to Box 412,
Spencer. NY. 14883.
Person to assist with
milking and calf care on
150 cow dairy, housing

provided. Call 717-278-
3924.

Poultry farm help needed
immediately for ful time
management of pullet
operation and general
farm work. Experience
desired. Must be reliable
and dependable. Call Ko-
Ka-Le-Ko Pullet Ranch,
RD 2 Denver. PA. 215-
267-3387 between 8 a.m.
and 5 p.m. 267-3387 after
7 p.m.
Wanted - Reliable couple
or single man to manage
and work small (150
acres) farm. Must know
farming and be meticulous
with animals and
equipment. Salary, house,
benefits. Write P.O. Box
176. Harieysville, PA.
19438.
Help Wanted - Assistant
herdsman. Duties include
calf care, some miking,
breeding and
miscellaneous tasks. Call
609-267-5246.
Self starting dairy worker
needed for large dairy in
Kent Co. on Maryland
eastern shore to do
feeding, outside work,
maintenance, etc. Must be
hard working, dependable
and able to handle
responsibility well.
Housing and insurance
available. Salary
depending on experience.
301-348-2121 between 8
AM or 4 PM.
Wanted - Experienced
person to milk 130
registered Holstems in
miking parlor, no field
work. Berks County. Send
resume and references to;
Lancaster Farming, P.O.
Box 366 D-153, Lititz, PA.
17543.
Herdsman for large dairy
farm in Southern Tier New
York (near Binghamton).
Excellent salary, housing
and fringe benefits, plus
bonuses. Must have ex-
perience and references.
Call Glen Mar Farms,
Harpursville. 607-693-
2997.
Wanted - Experienced
person to work on dairy
farm. Must have ex-
perience with field
choppers and hay
equipment 704-459-7632
after 6:30 PM.
Herdsperson - 250
registered herd. Del.
Excellent Salary. Ex-
perience in Al, herd
health, record keeping.
Send resume' ft
references to; Green
Acres Farm, Inc., RD 1,
Box 228, Lewes. DE.
19958.
Miliar wanted part time
for evening milling. 50
cow herd. Starting mid
August. Berks Co. 215
689-5387.
Experienced crop farmer
with ability to handle
machinery and personnel.
Benefits and good wages
for the right person. Send
resume' to Lancaster
Farming, Box 366, K-26,
Lititz, PA. 17543.
Experienced Milk Person -

Must be sober & reliable,
house available. Northern
Baltimore Co. 301-592-
2298.
Father-Son Team to work
with dairy herd in
Baltimore Co.*, Maryland
Call 301-592-7992 lor
details.
Tractor and combine
mechanic needed lor IH
dealership. Experience
necessary. Send resume
to: Hoober Equipment
Inc., P.O. Box 107,
Middletown. OE 19709.

Parts person needed for
growing parts department
of IH dealership.
Dealership or on farm
experience necessary.
Send resume to: Hoober
Equipment Inc., P.O. Box
107, Middletown. DE
19709.
Fulltime farm hand need-
ed for gardening, lawn
care and miking. Work six
days on a beautiful dairy
farm in the Washington,
NJ area. Prefer someone
local, salary negotiable.
Call between 9 & 5. 201-
658-3688. Ask for Marian
Hanright.

WANTED

Man & Wife Couple
w/additional help
to operate 80 cow

Dairy Shares,
partnership for

eventual ownership

Balto Co.
Reply to:

301-838-9388

DAIRY FARM
EXPERIENCE WANTED
stroiedamandtordairy farm

employ***' Good opportunity
and interaalintlocalloot

Employer* pay ua to find tho
people they need Roeant dairy

farm*«p*ri*nce, food
reference* and wllllnc to relocate

required Since 196 S Now
nationwide

Call or writ*today

UMcamrs. Ik.
515-394-3145

(Nancy or Sandy)
NowHampton, lowa 50659

WANTED
Man and wifeto
manage turkey

farm in York Co.
Living quarters
provided. Prior
farm experience

helpful.
Call

717-624-2191
ext 46

Dairy Farm Help Wanted
Milking positions with some field work
available on large dairy farm. Housing
and good salary with profit sharing plan
provided. Some experience preferred.
Send resume' to:

Lancaster Farming
Box 366D-148
Lititz, PA 17543

FLASH
STAUFFER SEEDS

Dealers needed for fast growing
seedcorn company

Call Collect
Dorothy Pool

301-848-5899

Canadian Manufacturer of Manure and
Feeding Equipment is seeking a
Manufacturer’s Representative to call on
dealers and customers in Western
Pennsylvania, Eastern Ohio and West
Virginia. We furnish leads and deliver via
company trucks. Excellent Commissions
based on performance.

Send Resume To;
P.O. Box 1276

Etkton. MD 21921

Dependable persons for
installation of hog andpoultry

equipment. Full timework.
Experiencehelpfulbut

not necessary.
Contact:

Farmer Boy Ag
Myerstown, PA

717-866-7563

AGRICULTURAL
EQUIPMENT DEALER

Looking for person with parts experience
to work in our expanding parts depart-
ment. Agricultural experience very
helpful.

* Excellent Company * Fringe Benefits
For more information or interview

Contact:
CHESTER H. NICARRY

KELLER BROTHERS TRACTOR
COMPANY

at 717-949-6901

1


