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Ag
CHARLESTON, SC - The

National Agricultural Chemicals
Association endorsed the
development and non-mandatory
use of good workplace practices

for the pesticide industry as an
alternative to government-
imposed regulation

cited incidences which are either
not representative of present-day
work practices or are isolated
cases not representative of the
industry as a whole,” said Richard
M Bowers, Chairman of NACA’s
Occupational Safety and Health
Committee

In testimony at federal Oc-
ninational Health
Administration hearings held here,
NACA argued that a basis has not
been developed which justifies a
broad-based standard for
regulating pesticide exposures
during manufacturing and for-
mulating operations
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In endorsing the use of good
workplace practices, Blowers
offered NACA recommendations

“Most of the data that has been
presented to OSHA in justification
of a generic pesticide standard

chemical group endorses OSHA option
which stressed employee
education in hazardous awareness,
training in methods for protecting
against hazards, emergency
response procedures and medical
surveillance programs.
’

He suggested that the principles
of these good workplace practices
could be disseminated to industry
employers and employees through
alternatives to mandatory
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regulation such as guidelines,
technical training bulletins and
hazard control or awareness
seminars

NACA is a non-profit,
Washington-based trade
organization whose 115 members
make or formulate virtually all the
crop protection chemicals used in
the Untied States and a large
percentage used abroad.
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Slaughtered under
government inspection

Call:
Frank Fillippo -

Residence ■ 215-666-0725
Elam Cinder - 717-367-3824

C.L. King - 717-786-7229
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■ Poured Solid Concrete Steel {7
Reinforced Walls.
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Manure Pit Walls

Hog House Walls'
Chicken House Wa

Concrete Decks
House Foundation
Cistern Walls
Barnyard Walls

Concrete Pit Tops

Silage Pit Walls
Retaining Walls

All sizes available
Round or rectangular

Take the questions out of your new construction
Call: Balmer Bros, for quality

engineered wails.
Invest in Quality - It will last a lifetime.

CONCRETE WORK, INC.
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Call NOW For New Springtime Building.


