
B3S—Lancaster Farming, Saturday, Novambcr 1,1980

Seven Angus-Holstem
cross steers and heifers
for sale, 400-600 lb Ph
215-932-9516

I am an order buyer and
trucker of feeder cattle,
have many satisfied
customers in your area, if
interested in ordering
cattle call collect 703-465-
5785 between 8-10 p m

6 registered Holstein
heifers, 4 just milking up
to 65 lb , 2 close sired by
high proven bulls out of
good producing dams,
Priced to sell, Also 3 fresh
grades, 215-932-9762
For Sale - 2 Red & White
heifers, due fresh soon, 1
registered by Stockier
Don Duallyn 412-397-
4313
For Sale - Springing grade
Holstein heifers 51200,
717-653-8703
For Sale - Service age
bulls and feeders, 200 lb
and up, David S Esh, 25
Spring Rd, Leola, PA
17540
For Sale - 2 Reg Ayrshire
heifer calves, started,
717-354-7868
For Sale - 25 feeder cattle,
800 lbs., wormed., and
vaccinated $.63, Ph 717-
444-3968
Wanted - Large Holstein
heifers due within 1
month, Call or write 717-
284-4759, Levi S Zook,
Rt 1 Box 133,
Quarryville, PA 17566
For Sale - Registered &

Grade Holstein heifers,
814-692-8576
100 springing Holstein
heifers, registered and
grade some very close,
will sell any amount, York
Co 717-229-2055

_

2' s,second calt heifers,
1200 lbs, price $BOO

each, not bred, problem
with- bull Rocksbury, NY
Call owner 201-567-3179
after 6pm
For Sale - Holstein
springers. 717-547 2387
Registered polled
Hereford cattle, bred
heifers, bred cows,
several with calves,
several young bulls, 814-
784-3227
Bred & Open strong well
bred purebred & grade
heifers, seen at the farm,
on Rt 298, Kennedyville,
MD Sycamore Farm,
McGuire Brothers Inc
301-348-5640
For Sale - Jersey bulls, 1
yr old, Samson Son & 3
yr old Tns Banner Son,
both have dams with
14,D00M Call 814-847-
2634
FOR SALE - 30 choice
beef heifers, 800 to 950
lbs Angus, Herfords,
white heads and two
partial Simmental Call
717-367-7769 Lane Co
For Sale - 11 Holstein
heifers, due now, big size,
bred by son of Harrisburg
Gay Ideal 717-263-9091
Wanted to Buy - 100
springing heifers 201-
567-3179 after6 PM
Wanted to Buy - 8 tr xO
head Registered Ho.atem
bred heifers Must be
fresh by Jan 1 Prefer to
have Al sires & Dams with
DHIA records Ph 717-
354-0509
Forty Hereford feeder
steers, 400-600 lb, few
Hereford Angus cross, 20
Hereford heifers, Toga
Co 717-662-3340.
Wanted - Registered
Holstein heifers, fresh,
prefer breeding age
heifers, Al sired with
record dams Lester
Snyder Rt 4, New
Carlisle, Ohio 45344 1-
513-882-6566
For Sale - 4 Black Angus
bulls and 1 Hereford
John S Stoltzfus, RD 1
Box 352, Kirkwood, PA
BartvilleRoad

ATTENTION
FARMERS
Wanted

Hurt, Disabled, DownCattle and/or Hogs

HOSTETTER'S LIVESTOCK
SERVICE

Onthe spot payment when possible
Pick-up area unlimited and prompt pick-up

Call Collect - (717) 949-2209or
(717)949-3205

All animals slaughtered under federal inspection

Registered Holstein bulls,
1 year old and younger
Out of dams with records
to 24,000 milk and 900
fat Stump Acres 717-792-
3216 York County
"Wisconsin and Canadian
Dairy Cows For Sale - Ist,
2nd, and 3rd calf Fresh
and close springers Cash,
or credit with down
payment. Specialize in
selecting cows for
customers Free delivery
Call collect Reuben
Greenberg. Inc ,
Columbus, New Jersey
08022 Phone 609-298
1021 ”

For Sale - Service age
Holstein bulls Dams
classified VG with records
to over 24,D00M &

I.OOOF John Stump,
Bernville, Pa Ph 215-
488-1965

Wanted - Entire dairy
herd, also, bred Holstein
heifers Will pay $25 more
per head than the going
price Don’t sell until you
call me Call collect -

Reuben Greenberg, Inc,
Columbus, NJ 609-298-
1021
Wanted Herd of dairy
cows or heifers,
301-358 0412
Buyers S Sellers of
Livestock - Be sure to
check the advertisements
for cattle in the Lancaster
Farming You'll get
results 1 717-394-3047 or
717-626-1154
For Sale Large Choice
Holstein heifers, bred and
open, over 350 to choose
from Harmony Dale
Farms, Phillipsburg, NJ
201 859-2516
For Sale - Dairy cows in
two herds Call 717 252-
4206

4 heavy pasture fed
Chianma Angus feeder
steers, 70 cents per
pound 717-872-2436
Wanted to Buy - Herd of
20-30 Holstein cows in
November 717-354-
9370 Lane. Co
One family Jersey cow
Alvin M Lapp, RD 1 Box
69, Gap, Pa 17527
For Sale- 20 springing
Holstein heifers, $l2OO
each, Andover, NY
607-478-8934
4 Holstein heifers, open
yearlings, Wayne Sutton,
RD3, Wyalusmg, PA
717-744-2165.
10 Angus Feeder cattle,
quality stock, average 500
lb each, Chester Co 215-
942-3025
Wanted - 300 lb veal
calves Write C Keech,
R D 2, Airville, Pa
17302

ANGUS BREEDING
STOCK

Registered, AHIR
Long Yearling Bulls
Bred Cows
Priced for early fall

sale
Delivery can be

arranged Free to
25 miles

BETE NOIRE ANGUS
FARM

Liverpool, PA
717-444-2190

Herd of 37 Holstems,
DHIA records, part
registered young cows
301-578-9868

HORSES ir MULES

Notice - Registered
American Saddlebred
Stud Service sorrel with
white markings, real
fancy $lO 00 down,
$4O 00 with live colt
Driving horses For. Sale
Isaac S Zook, South of
Intercourse

Wanted to Buy
Registered open Holstein
heifers Would buy 10 to
15head, prefer to have Al
sires & dams with DHIA
records Ph 717-354-
0509

Service age sires Sire-
Conductor Elevation, 3
generation VG, dams
record 338 d 18.460M759 f w/4 1 test,
717-656-6348

ANGUS CATTLE FOR SALE
Better Breeding

Bulls Brood Cows
Feeder Calves

Heifers 1 ora group
STIVERS ANGUS
Pittstown, NJ
201-735-8691

Special Hoof Settings
Care for chronical
foot problems
Specialist for 13
years

717-259-9983
Leo Lunger

"Performance Tested
Bulls”noviron hand

Year Angus Bulls
2 year old Vi blood Chian-

ma, will sire */« blood
calves

3A blood Chianma calves
TWIN OAK FARMS

Quarryville, Pa. 17566
Phone 717-786-2146

or 786-2201 For Sale Quality,
Purebred Suffolk and
Dorset Rams Reasonably
Priced Lauden Acres
(717)758-2549

LAIRDS
ANGUS FARM

Will be selling all their
1980 steer calves atthe

South Central Cattlemans
Sale Held at the

Thomasville Sales Barn
Westof York, PA
on NOVEMBER 7,

700PM

WALTER S. LAIRD
Dover, PA

717-292-3235
Registered proven Suffolk
ram, 2Vi yrs old-, Morgan
bred 215-598 7203

t LEASEACOW ♦

♦ No Downpayment JX You Get Calves X
♦ Increase herd ♦
X 50-100% I
* 36 month lease
♦ ♦
♦ Lease-ACow ♦
X 264HifhwoodAve. X
♦ Tenatly, NJ 07670 ♦
♦ 201-567-3179 XX 8 AM-10PM ♦
♦ 7 days %

HORSES Sj MUIES

For Sale -1 coon hunting
mule, 51” tall, $6OO, 301-
758-2813 4 30-6 00 PM
weekdays, anytime
weekends

For Sale - Two Afncan
pygmy goat does, IV4 yrs
old, Registerable 717-
432-5680American Saddlebred

Stud Service. Sorrel with
white marking $25 00
with colt Evenings & Sat
Aaron K Smuker, Strubel
Road, RD #l, Strasburg,
Pa
AQHA 5 yr old bay
gelding, shown suc-
cessfully by 12yr old boy
in Western Pleasure and
trail, 15 hands, $2OOO,
717-597-9633

YORKSHIRE AND LAND-
RACE boars and gilts ofall
ages Pseudorabies
negative tested boars for
sale at all timesProduction tested, cer-
tified meat tested, Show
winners with many car-
cass champicns Daily
drive in and drive out
service Reno H Thomas,
Beavertown, PA 17813
717 658 5821

For Sale Two Yorkshire
boarhopl - 717-768 383'?

Dry wood shavings for
sale - $9O per dump truck
load delivered, $250 per
truck trailer load
delivered $25 per pickup
load, pick up
717 656-28X1

JEN-AIR ACRES

REG. QUARTER
HORSES

AND PAINTS

I Horses For Sale
Stallion Service
R.D 2, Box 179

Berks Co
Bernville, Pa 19506

215-488-6914
DUROC & LANDRACE

Boars & Gilts
DUTCH VALLEY

FARM
R D 5, Manheim, Pa

17545
717-665-6220

Mark Nestleroth
717-665-2588
John Chapman

SHEtP It GOATS ‘

Sheep For Sale l Polled
Dorsets, crosses, rams,
bred ewes, yearlings
201-534-4644
For Sale - Registered
Hampshire ewe lambs,
good healthy Western
bred stock Chester Co
215 255-4839

For Sale - Small flock of 26
Suffolk sheep 1 ram, rest
ewes Starting to lamb
first of year 717-229-
2500
Bred ewes for Sale -

Commercial Suffolk flock
with production records
Prices $75 up depending
on age & records of ewe
Call 717-665-7386

Registered exposed
Suffolk ewes, lambs,
yearlings, mature, 8 head,
from family 4-H flock, 717-
243-1237
For Sale - Breeding ewes
and yearling ewe lamb,
approx 90-110 lbs
Cheviot purebreds and
other mixed breeds 35
head to pick from 2
Chevoit bucks, IVi yrs
old, both are twins, 1
Cornedale buck twin
717-263-9091
Nubian Registered
purebred dairy goats for
sale, outstanding
pedigrees for milk and
show, Guaranteed buck
service $25 Gettysburg,
717-334-7993
Wanted - Feeder lambs
weighing 40-60 lb Call
215-822-7344 before 7
a m after9pm

Goats - All ages, mature
Nubian bucks, Pygmy
buck kid, mated doves in
cages. Melvin OeGroft, Rt
97, Littlestown, Adams
Co 717-359-5165

For Sale - Hampshire &

Berkshire boars, delivery
available, Terry Bennecoff
& Son, 215-285-6582
If you have swine to sell or
buy - check our swine
column It is read weekly
by thousands 717-394
3047 or 717 626-1164
For Sale - 20 White choice
feeder pigs, 40 Jb
average wormed &

cast a ied 717 354 0293_

For Sale - Duroc boars &
gilts Sweigard Durocs,
R D 3, Box 639, Halifax,
Pa 717-896-3365
For Sale - Feeder Pigs We
aim to please
304-586-2823

Duroc Breeding Stock
LAWRENCE ARNOLD

1245 E Cumberland St
Lebanon, PA

Ph- 717-272-9827
Open Hampshire 4
Yorkshire g*lts Also ser-
vice age boars of both
breeds from certified
meat type breeding VVII
deliver Contact John
Strawbndge, Stewart-
stown, PA 17363
301-996-2022 Call bet-
ween 6-7 30 A M or after
BPM
SERVICE AGE BOARS
Straight Irish or other
foreign bloodlines No
U S breeding in our herd
Reno H Thomas, Brooks
End Farm, Beavertown,
Pa 17813 Phone
717-658 5821
Registered Hampshire,
Yorshire, Landrace Boars
and Bred gilts, Preston
Bankert, Rd3, Red Lion,
PA 717-244-1244

For Sale - Purebred Duroc
boars, open & bred gilts,
all age breeding stock,
certified herd #B2 Ph
717-733-2310 W F
Ruoss, 126 Irene Ave,
Ephrata, Pa 17522
For Sale Spotted boars
and gilts Satisfaction
guaranteed, free delivery
Flash - 1980 Maryland
State Champion Boar and
1980 Reserve Champion
Boar overall breeds 717-
624-2320
Feeder pigs, 45 lb $32
delivered, 309-266-6361
For Sale - Purebred
Yorkshire service age
boars, Thomas bloodline
Aaron Z Martin 215-445-
4825
For Sale - Chester White &
Spotted boars & gilts Can
deliver James Parlett,
Airvi lie, Pa 717-862-3610
Duroc, Yorkshire and
Spotted Boars For Sale
Spots-full litter mates to
Champion farrow at 1980
Keystone Also open gilts
and F-l gilts, bred gilts
For Sale on order.
Brucellosis herd #26, PRV
#lB, Calvin Lazarus &

Son, 4290 Bridge St.
Whitehall, PA 18052,
after Bpm 215-799-
3375
For Sale - Registered
Hampshire open Gilts.
Call 215-562-8622 after
6 00PM
For Sale - Purebred
spotted service age boars,
Clair Hartman, Gratz, PA
717-365-3234
Yorkshire boars, service
age, raised in grou p lotsof
5 Miller's Yorkshire
Farm, Craig and Richard
Miller, Rd 1, Spring
Grove, 717-225-1926.

YORKSHIRE
10Boars for

Immediate Service
LEON L ARNOLD

Rt. 7, Box 705
Lebanon, Pa. 17042

717-273-5880

HYBRID VIGOR
Choose From

Four-Hybrid Lines
BOARS & GILTS
Sales orLease

Contact

EAST COAST
HOG SERVICE

Lititz, PA
717-626-6566

m

YORKSHIRE
SERVICE BOARS

For Sale
ELWOOD HOUSER

R.D. 5, Box 70
Lebanon, Pa. 17042

717-272-5798 or
717-273-2921

YORKSHIRE &

LANDRACE
SERVICE
BOARS

Also Yorkshire/
L.andrace cross gifts.

CARL ZIMMERMAN
RD 2 Box 362
Myerstown, PA

17067
717-866-7093

WYAND DUROCS
I have top quality bred and open gilts from good

bloodline*, plus a good selection of boars. Quality
Durocs at low prices. Durocs since 1959. They are
my full time business, nota sideline.

Wyand Durocs
4 Miles South of Interstate 81

Ph: 304/625-1448Williamsport, Md.
21795

f

DUROCA
SPOTTED BOARS

Duroc, Spot.
Crossbred Gilts

(delivery available)
BOURBON

SPRINGS FARM
R 2, Newville, Pa 17241

Kenneth Ketterer
Phone 717-423-6250

ARTIFICIAL BREEDING

Semen for sale ■ 5 units
Glendell, 8 units Apollo
Virginian, 8 units Liftoff,
15 units Sleepy Hollow

Kennedy, 15 units
Pacemaker, 9 units
T-amlane Rockman
Senator 717-529-2609
For Sale - Semen, 10units
Round Oak Rag Apple
Elevation, 5 units Hill Top
Apollo Ivanhoe, 100 units
Le-Del Ideal Superior,
814-692-8576

ARTIFICIAL BREEDING

ZIMMERMANN’S
SEMEN EXCHANGE!

PAWNEE FARM ARLINDA
CHIEF

ROUND OAKRAG APPLE
ELEVATION

SWD VALIANT
ASTRONAUT
GLEN VALLEY STAR
PETE
CONDUCTOR
SWEET HAVEN TRADITION ..

LAWCREST MARVEX
CARLIN-M IVANHOE BELL ...

CREEK-BLUFF ELEV. LESTER
1.0. STATE CHIEF FORD
YUL-PRIDE ELEVATION ACE .

$280.00

$260.00
$175.00
$llO.OO
. $70.00
. $75.00
. $65.00
. $65.00
. $38.00
. $35.00
. $32.00
. $30.00
. $20.00

PHILIP HERSHEY
Area Northwestern Penna. and Southwestern N.Y.

814-848-9736
HARRY ZIMMERMANN

127W. Main St.. Leola, Pa. 17540
717-656-2636

Prices Subject To Change Without Notice

HOG EQUIPMENT
h SUPPLIES’

' HOG EQUIPMENT
_

6r SUPPLIES

Concrete hog slats made
in length from 4 ft to 12 1 hog catching crate,

Alvin M Lapp. RO 1 box
69, Gap, Pa 17527V T Petersheim

R.D 2,00x315
Mifflmtown, Pa 17059

FARMER BOY AG
We specialize in Complete Swine

Systems. Buildings, Farrowing, Nursery.
Fattening - Open Front or Controlled
Environment
★ Choretime - Air & Feed

Supplies
★ Farmer Boy Products
★ Smidley Feeders
★ L.B. White Room Heaters
★ Fristamat - Fully Automatic

Farm Ventilation andStabling

FARMER ROT AG
457 East Main St.

Myerstown, PA 17067
Ph: 717-866-5692


