
HARRISBURG - Cmdy
Ann Lupey, daughter of Mr.
and Mrs. Tehodore Lupey,
Lmglestown is the 1980
Dauphin County Dairy
Princess, Crowned May 9 in

the mall of the ColonialPark
Plaza, Cindy will begin a
year of promoting milk
along with the assistance of
Alternate Dairy Princess,
Tammy Renee Yost.

Tammy is the daughter of
Mr. and Mrs. Vernon Yost,
Hershey.

Cindy, a seventeen year
old student at Central
Dauphin East High School
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Retiring Dairy Princess Debra Cassel, left, crowns 1980 Dauphin County
Dairy Princess, Cindy Lupey with alternate princess, Tammy Yost, right.
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qualified as a contestant
because she owns dairy
animals even though she
does not live on a dairy farm.
Much of her experience with
the dairy industry has come
by way of helping the Miller
family show their award
winning Holstems. Cindy
owns a junior yearling and a
calf at present Presently
studymg in the business
curriculum at Central
Dauphin East, Cindy hopes
to become a veterinarian’s
assistant after completing
her formal schooling.

The new Dauphin County
Dairy Princess has been
very active m many school
and community
organizations including the
Dauphin County Dairy 4-H
Club, Blue Mountain Horse
Riders Club, Cheerleading
and the Manada Gap Full
Gospel Mission Youth
Group.

Uponbeing selected as the
new dairy princess, Cindy
said, “I’D try and do my best
to promote my product -

milk.”
Crowned by out-going
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WE HAVE CONTROLLED ENVIRONMENTAL
VEAL MODULAR BUILDINGS FOR 101 CALVES

FOR AS LOW AS $360 PER CALF

COMPLETE
SYSTEM

BUILDING

INCLUDES SELF-CONTAINED PIT, DELIVERED AND
ERECTED ON YOUR CONCRETE SLAB

VEAL - SWINE - CALF CASTLES
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Dairy Princess Debra
Cassel before a crowd of
Friday evening mall
shoppers, Cmdy and the
alternate princess Tammy
Yost had the opportunity to
meet the public and answer
questions about the dairy
industry

Tammy also owns dairy
animals while not actually
living on a dairy farm
herself She has spent a lot of
time smce she was very
young on her uncle’s farm
near Hershey Her seven
year old cow took the first
place Junior Pennsylvania
ribbon m Harrisburg last
year. She has shown m many
dairy shows while par-
ticipating m the Lower
Dauphin 4-H Dary Club and
the Lower Dauphin FFA
Chapter.

The May meeting of Berks
County Farm Women Board
was held recently. Clyde
Myers, county agent gave a
presentation on the 4-H
Community Center which
will begin construction in
1981.
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BUY AN AGSTAR
CASTLE

AND CASH IN ON
THE VEAL MARKET

The group was asked to
contribute to the fundraising
underway for the 4-H Center.

Ho-down profit from this
year was $460 which will be
given to the Berks Campus
of Penn State.

Berks Heim needs various
items such as afghans 54x72
mches, yam'and terry cloth

EyMHERR
EQUIPMENT, INC.

VEAL CASTLE
Aluminum Headgates Available for Veal

FARM A HOME SUPPLY
»». I KT*27l SOOTH,HWVUtl M>

FULL LINE
PARTS

DEPARTMENT

WE SELL,
SERVICE AND

INSTALLwiuowswcrf.r*
Phono: (71T) 464-3321

DIRECTIONS TO EM HERR
FARM A HOME SUPPLY
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1 MILE SOUTH OF WILLOW STREET

Cindy Ann Lupey new Dauphin Dairy Princess

Other activities which
Tammy has supported m the
past are the Dauphin County

Berks Co. Farm

Lancaster farming, Satnrday, May 17,19S0—CIS

4-H Council, the yearbook
staff and booster club at her
high school and activities of
theShell’s Lutheran Church.

Tammy aspires to attend
college in the Fall of 1981 to
study dairy science.

Master of Ceremonies for
the evening Mall program
was John Hams, Dauphin
County Extension Agent. Co-
ordinators for the contest
were Daisy Cassel and Pat
Miller Judges who spoke
with the contestants in
private interviewsas well as
evaluated them during the
public program were
dairyman Robert Pardoe
Jr, Milton; Sue Beshore,
New Cumberland and Susan
Kauffman, Peach Bottom.

The miniature golf display
provided by the Atlantic
Dairy Association attracted
many youngsters to the milk
production displays and the
magic cow was also on hand
to meet the consumers.

Women Board
booties. While the bingo held
at Berks Heim went well,
more help could be used in
November.

Hamburg State School
extended thanks for the
green thumb sale success.
And the group decided not to
participate m the Berks
Expo.

This year’s youth project
will be for grandchildren.
Each group must have 3
volunteers at the Berks
Heim picmc for one hour
each on June 8.


