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• MAILBOX MARKET

For Sale - 7 McCormick No 25-
V Universal tractor mower, 1
row Oliver No 5 corn picker
Dorchester Co MD 301-943-
3725.

For Sale - -Level Flow silo
distributor for 20' silo, IH 8'
disc harrow, Case 8' sprocket
cultipacker Lane. Co 717-
284-4647

For Sale - 6 Crossbred gilts due
in July. Also, three, three way
cross boars Cumberland Co
717-243-4378

Wanted - Gram truck with 14'
to 18' body w/hoist, single axle
or 10 wheeler Good cond
Lane Co 717-665-3865

Free To Good Home - 5 yrs
Female St Bernard, dry
mouth, very good to children,
would like to be untied, eats
very little Leb Co 717-865-
3046.

For Sale - Clothes closet, sofa
and chair clean, sink free
whitewash bowl. 717-285-
4636

For Sale - 3 Polled hereford
bulls, 550-600 lbs., 2 heifers
Call after 5 p m. So. Lane Co
717-548-2219

For Sale - John Deere corn
binder with motor and loader
John K. Baler, 1 mile East of
Quarryville R 3 on 372

For Sale - 2 new 2000 lb. coil
spring trailer axles, 61" track,
w/wide nms, $9O each 717-
244-8702

Wanted- Desire immediate
purchase of windmill (will
disassemble), cast iron
woodworking lathe, wood-
working tools and equipment,
York Co 717-755-8884 B J
Naylor

For Sale- Oliver 550 front end
loader, excellent condition,
$6500, Oliver 770 tractor, WF,
$lB5O, Ferguson 30 tractor
$2250, Oliver 4340 3 btm
plow, rubber tire, hyd $6OO,
PO Box 269, Neffs, PA 215-
767-9282 Lehigh Co

For Sale- Purebred Arabian
mare and filly, double San
Felipe Breeding filly by Super
Beau 92451, half QH, hair
Thoroughbred, mare would
make carriage horse, 717-687-
7681 days, 717-464-4918
eves

For Sale- Feed wheat approx
150 bu $3 50, straw and hay,
MH 44 tractor, runs but needs
work, $6OO or best offer,
Harford Co 301-452-8646

For Sale- 100 egg incubator
and accessories $25, Rebuilt
Homart deep well pump and
tank $75, Goulds shallow well
pump $25, Lehigh Co 215-
756-6103

For Sale- Forcar sawmill, 52 in
saw blade, iron work in good
shape, but needs wood $7OO,
Cali after 6 pm 717-235-
4582

For Sale- 18 can Peight milk
cooler, very good condition,
used 2 yrs , Wanted 55 lb
DeLaval milker pail, Samuel E
Seller, Rd 2, Loganton, PA

For Sale- Glendell Arhnda
Chief service age bull, dam
died with a good 2 yr record,
granddam is VG 85, 25,000 as
3yr old, next dam is by Apollo
215-932 9292

For Sale- (Choice) 1 9 yr old
mule or 10 yr Sorrel work
horse, Wanted side pig feeder,
4 or 6 hole Ben Click, Rd 2,
Delta, PA 17314

For Sale-1966 Chev truck, 12
ft flatbed, low miles, good
condition, Chester Co 215
932-9818

For Sale- 2 brood sows, 1 with
8 pigs, 1 ready to farrow, 1
boar hog Yorkshire and
Landrace Cross, 5200 each or
best offer, John S Kauffman,
Rd 1,Box 317, Bart vi He, Pa
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For Sale- Excellent 2K yr old
polled Hereford breeding bull
$lOOO, Adams Co 703-354-
0787after 7 30

For Sale- 7 Good used metal
storm windows with screen, 3-
36 3/8x55, 3 36>/zxss, 1
35x54Yz $4 each Harry
Sauder, Goodville, PA

For Sale- Rod and mam
beanrjgs for TD9 tractor,
Wanted- rear steel wheels for
Farmall H, state price and
condition, Franklin Co John
Stoltzfus, Rd 2, Box 431,
Spring Run, PA

For Sale- Big Dutchman egg
room cooler, $75, Lancaster
Co 717-733-8554

For Sale- 2 brand new pre-
hung Hollow core interior
doors, fruit wood stained, 2
sizes 20x80 & 32x80, $2O
each, 215-869 9397 after 5
p m

For Sale- Agway LPS tank for
50 or 100 cows, filled twice,
can deliver $l3O Lebanon Co
717-867-4944

Pullets- 325 Dekalb Sex Sal,
brown egg layers, 21 weeks,
will deliver, 215-944-9583

For Safe- 72 Ford 16’ dump, 72
Ford Louisville tractor, 72 Ford
T-tag cab and chassis, 5 gal
cans white enamel. Dauphin
Co 717-692-4444

For Sale- 1937 Plymouth 4
door sedan, tires, drive tram,
body in very good condition,
Columbia Co 717-752-7721

For Sale- 2 row transplanter
with row markers $lB5,
Thomas Hicswa Sr, Ham-
monton, NJ 609-561-7623

For Sale-1960 Int cattletruck
with 15 ft bed, 4 ft side
boards, good 10 ply tires, good
condition, will sell reasonable,
Lancaster Co 717-653 5800

For Sale- Int disc, cultipacker,
corn planter, loader, Woods
Bros picker for parts, Case 3
pt plow, tape player, delivery
available, Schuylkill Co 717
345-4109

For Sale- Oliver Super 99 GM
tractor with 3-71 Detroit
diesel, excellent condition,
$3750 or will trade for JD 720
for Farmall 450 gas, plus cash,
Westmoreland Co 412-423-
3355

For Sale- Oliver H hay crimper,
very good condition, $3OO,
717-566-8752, James Landis,
Rd 2, Box 52. Hummelstown,
PA

For Sale- Dairy goats, 1 Am
Togg milker, 2 grade Togg
yearlings, 1 Am Togg kid, 1
grade Togg kid, $75 150, 201-
453-2715 Warren Co

For Sale Reg Quarterhorse %

thoroughbred, 4 yr old
gelding, green broke, Good
hunter potential, $BOO , 215-
536-2284

For Sale- Reg Vz grade
LaMancha milking goat,
disbudded, very calm. Early
morning or eves Berks Co
215-944 7333

For Sale Tobacco ladders,
double 22 ft steel, like new,
Roy Longenecker, Rd 6, Box
560, Lititz, PA

For Sale- NH 271 baler,
working condition, engine and
steel wheels, David P Landis,
416 Musser School Rd ,

Gordonville, Pa

For Sale- Portable Magic Chef
dishwasher $l5O, small wood
burning stove, $75, Tn sport 3
wheeler, 8 hp $350, 350cc
Bultaco-Sherpa T, 74, $750
717-464-4981 or 684-9671

For Sale Mobile home with add
on room, used for office, Make
bid, asking $5OOO, good
condition, Jacob Mumma, 584
Mumma Rd , Lititz, 717 626
5152

I I
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For Sale- Oliver combine,
model 25, gram bead and 2
row corn head, $l5OO 717-
263-8934
For Sale- glass, many sizes,

enough for a greenhouse, 130
amp portable Lincoln welder
with gas motor and generator,
1 owner, Menno Stoltzfus, %

mile eastof Madisonburg, PA

For Sale- 14x7 Ontario disc
gram drill, $3OO, 717-637-
8062 Hanover, PA Adams Co

Free - Mixed Collie pups, 6
wks old Male Collie dog, 1 yr
old Leb Co 717-272-3876

For Sale - No 8 New Idea horse
drawn manure spreader, on
steel, very good condition,
$725 Will deliver PH 717-
374-9996

For Sale - Trio of African gray
geese, 2 hens and 1 gander of
trade for young ewe lamb or
young pig Berks Co 215-775-
3044

For Sale- MF 3 pt sickle
mower, good condition, Berks
Co $525, 215-777-1013
Wanted- 9-36 tractor tire, no
breaks and tandem axle trailer,
For Sale- 2 GR7B-14 JC Penny
tires, 2x14 IH trailer plow,
Lancaster Co 717-684-5352

For Sale- 2-28" rear tractor
wheels, power shift rims, 100
lb weights, $75 per wheel and
weights, Lancaster Co 717-
872-5712

For Sale- MH 44 diesel, JD B
serial 274069 with 4 new tires,
12 4x24 6 ply tractor tires,
Adams Co 717-528-4914
For Sale- 2 10,000 gal steel
tanks, 717-859-3118

Wanted- Motor for self
propelled JD 45 combine,
Lancaster Co 717-285-5413

For Sale- Amish buggy in good
shape with brakes, Amos L
Stoltzfus, Box 215, Strasburg,
PA

For Sale 2 potato plows, one
original appearance $B5, other
$65, Will deliver in Lancaster
or Chester Co 215 593-5271

For Sale- 2 Rubber tires and
wheels for Ml Corn picker 323,
John K Stoltzfus, Rd 2 Box
13F, Honey Brook, PA call
after 5 00

For Sale- NH 770 forage
harvester, good condition,
53800, 301-348 5383

For Sale No 9 Me Deenng
mower with 5’ &6' bars, $75,1
dump rake, 510, 1 4 bar Nl
side rake with 2 small wheels
550,717 656-9595

For Sale- 10x45 mobile home,
completely qutted, for storage
or livestock, Lancaster Co
717 665 3086

Wanted Used metal roofing,
any length, Titeon or Loc
Asphalt shingles (Double
coverage) 814 2674953

Wanted- Old Bible and books in
the 15th to 17th century, Jake
D Lengacher, Rd 1 Box 77,
Port Treverton, PA 17864

oaie Dumping
station/transfer system, 100ft
1” glass line Bender, 2 Surge
milers 50 lb units, 215-384
0947

For Sale Reg heifers, baby
goats, truck bed with boxes on
sides, Lancaster Co 7X7 733
6302

For Sale MF 82 Self propelled
combine, good running con-
dition, $2OOO, Lancastei Co
717 665-7284

Boy 16 wants job on dairy
farm, experienced, Lancaster
or Chester Co 215 273 2341

Approx 28 acres of prime
limestone land Rt 11 south
adjacent to Borough of
Chambersburg, Take all $BOOO
per acre, or will subdivide
717 264 4071

SUMMER'S HERE ... 1
I(• • ) SAVINGS HERE... I
[ SERVICE HERE... |

1 WE’VE GOT IT ALL TOGETHER FOR YOU!! I
I -j
1 NEW INTERNATIONAL 1979
1 MODELS 1440 & 1460
I AXIAL-FLOW COMBINES
f “

CALL

★ Woi

JUST ARRIVED: 584 DIESEL
4-WHEEL DRIVE

JD 38Chopper w/2-row
narrow corn head 8> grass
head

Int. 550 Forage Harvester,
1000RPM,2-rcw corn
head, new knives

Fox IF 546 Forage Harvester
w/2-row corn head & grass
head, extremely clean

Int. 56 Forage Blower
JD #6O Forage Mower
NH #23 Forage Mower
NH Flail Chopper, needs work
NH 469 Mower Conditioner,

9 ft.
Int. 46 Baler w/thrower, excel.
Int. 46Baler, excel.

USED TRACTORS
Farmall 1456D, outstanding
Farmall 806D, 3 pt. hitch, wide front
Farmall 966 D hydro, 1-owner
AC 190 gas, 1-owner
Int 444, low hours
Int. 574 D

Row Crop, excellent

Int. 240 w/Sauder loader
Farmall 300
Farmall C w/loader
Farmall H w/cultivators
Farmall 460

USED ULLAGE EQUIPMENT
Int. 9A Drag Type Disk, 28 Disk

H JDKBA Drag Type Disk, 28 Disk
X Miller 10ft OffsetDisk
2 2 Bottom Fast Hitch Plow

MF 3-14 Plow
Ferguson 10Tooth Chisel Plow
Int 12’Spring Tooth Harrow

USED COMBINES
Waiver of Finance Available till 9-1-79 |

Int 715 Diesel Combine, 75 MF 300 Combine w/grain I
model w/grain platform, platform, 2-row corn head wL
air cond. cab, pick upreel, |
straw chopper, ready to go. I

Int, 76 pull type Combine
1976 Int. 863 6-row corn

head

JD #4O Combine w/grain
platform & 2-row corn head

r Aim is to Serve You Better


