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After only one visit to Farm Show last year, John
Chapman came back this week to show a Dutch

By JOANNESPAHR
HARRISBURG - For only

having visited Farm Show
once before in his entire life,
JohnChapman, 34, Manheim

R5, did well for himself and
his partner on Monday
morning. That was the day
Chapman navigated Dutch
Valley Farms bred gilt to the
championship of the 'Duroc
breeding swine competition
at Farm Show.

Chapman, who recently
left behind a career as a
Navysystems analyst to join
forces with Mark Nestleroth
on the respected Manheim-
based Dutch Valley swine
operation, had visited Farm
Show only briefly for a sale
last year. After that short
contact, he came back this
week and won a title Dutch
Valley has been seeking for
quite some time, but had

been unable to attain until
this year.

The champion gilt
Chapman showed was a
January gilt out of Hex, a
$6OOO boar bought by Dutch
Valley from the National
Durcc test station in lowa.

The red gilt was then bred
to Indy Champ, a $6400 boar
which was champion at the
Indiana State Fair in 1976.
Dutch Valley owns Indy

WHAT'S NEW
NEW

FOUR-WHEEL-DRIVE
TRACTORS INTRODUCED

DES MOINES, lowa - To
meet farmer demand for
more powerful tractors,
Massey-Ferguson will in-
troduce a new generation of
four-wheel-drive tractors in
1978. The new “4000 Series”
consists of two models the
265 engine horsepower MF
4840 andthe 320 hp MF 4880.

The MF 4840 and MF 4880
tractors are powered by a
Cummins 903 cu. inch V-3
diesel engine, naturally
aspirated and turbocharged,
respectively.

*

*

/Both models offer a choice
of 12-speed manual tran-
smission or an Ift-speed unit
with three-speed, shift-on-
the-go capability in six gear
ranges. Both transmissions
feature constant mesh gears
for shifting ease. The
tractors have an all-new
four-plate, oil-cooled 14 in.
clutch with an integral
transmission brake.

A new, exclusive, elec-
tronically controlled three-
point-hitch will be available
as an option. This new
system gives positive
position control, full draft
control, or an - infinitely
variable intermix of both to
allowmore precise control of
implements under varying
field conditions. Massey-
Ferguson is the first
manufacturer to offer this
electronic sensing system on
farm tractors.

acting
capabilities

Heavy duty 4-inch
diameter axles with inboard
planetaries permit ad-
justable wheel tread
spacing. A long axle option
allows use of axle-mounted
dual wheels.

conversion

The large cab provides
high visibility, a deluxe fully
adjustable swivel seat,
convenient control console,
instrument panel and tilt
steering wheel, and full
complement of malfunction
warning lights. Air con-
ditioning, heater, turn

signals, and four-way
flashers are standard
equipment.

Other optional equipment
includes an independent
1,000 pm PTO and a wide
swingingroller drawbar.

Routine servicing has been
simplified by providing a
hinged right-hand hood
panel, hinged rear hood
sides, and a convenient bank
lubrication system for hard-
to-reach fittings. Main-
tenance-free batteries
eliminatebattery servicing.

A three-spool auxiliary
hydraulic valve is standard
with a four-spool optional.
Both valves feature pressure
release detents, float
position, individual spool
flow controls, and single

First time showman
scores for Dutch Valley

MarchGilt
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Valley Farm Duroc to the grand championship of
that breed competition.

Champ in conjunction with
William Sweigard & Son,
Halifax, Pa.

According to enthusiastic
swine judge Paul Parrish,
Montpelier, Ohio, the
champion gilt had good
growth, was lean, and was
well muscled with a good
underline. She also was free
moving:

Although he did Monday’s
showing, Chapman says
Nestleroih is responsible for
most of the breeding done on
the farm. When it comes to
showing, the two partners
trade off, with Chapman
doing the local shows and
Nestieroth doing others in
the West.

And, even though it wasn’t
that long ago that Chapman
remembers working as a
systems analyst, he. now
says that he’s hooked on
showing.
“I love it,” he says with a

good natured smile, “it’s a
lotoffun.”

The reserve champion of
the showwent toKenneth D.
Fetterolf, Centre HallRl, for
his February gilt.

Lawrence Arnold,
Myerstown, showed the first
placeMarch gilt.

Complete results from the
Duroc show follow:

JanuaryGilt
1. Dutch Valley Farm,

Manheim R5; 2. Darlene
McConaughey, Smicksburg;
3. Kenneth Fetterolf, Centre
Hall Rl; 4. Lazarus
Brothers, Germansville Rl;
and, 5. Clyde W. Mc-
Conaughey, Smicksburg.

February Gilt
1. Kenneth D. Fetterolf, 2.

Kenneth D. Fetterolf, 3.
Calvin H. Lazarus, and Sons,
Whitehall; 4. Calvin H.
Lazarus and Sons; 5. Clyde
W. McConaughey andSon.

1. Lawrence Arnold,
Myerstown; 2. Clyde W.
McConaughey & Son, 3.
Lazarus Brothers, 4. Calvin
H. Lazarus & Sons, and 5.
Barbara McConnell, Volant.
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ADAMS CO. '

O.C. RICE. INC.
Bigterville, PA
717-677-8135

YINGUNG'S IMPLEMENT
ROl Gettysburg, PA

717-359-4848
BERKS CO.

N.H. PUCKER & SONS INC.
Maxatawny

215-683-7252
STANLEY A. KLOPP INC,

Bernvilte, PA
215^488-1500

miller equipment
Bechtelsville. PA

215-845-2911
SHARTLESVILLE
FARM SERVICE

ROI, Hamburg, PA
215-488-1025

H. Daniel Wenger, Prop.
ZIMMERMAN'S
FARM SERVICE

Bethel, PA
717-933-4114

BRADFORD CO.
CARL L. PIERCE

RD2,
-ColumbiaCross Roads, PA

717-297-3513
.WYNNE’SGARAGE

Canton, PA
717-673-8456
BUCKS CO.

CJ.WONSIDLER BROS.
Trumbauersville Road
QuakertQwn, PA 18951

215-536-1935

PAULHISTANDCO.. INC.
397 North Main Street

Doylestown, PA
215-348-9041
CECIL CO.

AG INDUSTRIAL
EQUIPMENT CO.
Rising Sun, Md.
301-658-5568
CHESTER CO.

CHAS. J. McCOMSEY
SSONS

HickoryHill, PA
215-932-2615

STOLTZFUS FARMSERVICE
Cochranville, PA
215-593-5280

M.S. YEARSLEY & SONS
West Chester, PA

215-696-2990

COLUMBIA CO.
ORANGEVILLE

FARM EQUIPMENT
Orangeville, PA
717-683-5311

WILLIAM F. WELLIVER
Jerseytown, PA
717-437-2430

CUMBERLAND CO.
ERNEST SHOVER

FARM EQUIPMENT
19West South St.

Carlisle, PA
717-249-2239

DAUPHIN CO.
SWEIGARD BROS.
RD3, Halifax, PA

717-896-3414

JESA!mN.«L
CHAMBERSBURG

FARM SERVICE. INC.
975 S. MainSt,

Chambersburg, PA
717-264-3533

MEYERS
IMPLEMENTS, INC.

Greencastle, PA
717-597-2176

LEBANON CO.
A.C. HEISEY

FARM EQUIP!., INC.
RDI, Jonestown,PA

717-865-4526
UMBERGERS MILL

RD4, Lebanon [Fontana], PA
717-867-5161

LOOK FOR

LEHIGH CO.

SCHUYLKILL CO.

717-837-3201

WYOMING CO.
ACE-JURISTA. INC.

Tunkhannock, PA
717-836-2610

YORK CO

CARROLL CO..MD.
WERTZ GARAGE, INC.

4132 E. Main St.
Linboro, MD

301-374-2672

LANCASTER CO.
ROY H. BUCK, INC.

Ephrata. RD2
717-859-2441

A.B.C. GROFF, INC.
New Holland,■RA
717-354-4191

A. L. HERR&BRO.
Quarryville, PA
717-786-3521

LANDIS.BROS. INC.
Lancaster, PA
717-393-3906

LONGENECKER
FARM SUPPLY

Rheems, PA
717-367-3590

N.G. HERSHEY & SON
Manheim,PA
717-665-2271

C.J. WONSIDLER BROS
Jet. Rt. 309 and 100

Pleasant Corners, PA
215-767-7611

LYCOMING CO.
RICE FARM SUPPLY. INC.

Jersey Shore, PA
717-398-1391

MONTGOMERY CO.
WENTZ FARM SUPPLIES

Route 29
Palm, PA

215-679-7164

NORTHAMPTON CO.
iEORGE V. SEIPLE & SON

Easton, PA
215-258-7146

NORTHUMBERLANDCO.
ACKLEY’S LIMESTONE

°RODUCTS, INC.
Herndon, PAn 7-758-3915

L.L. ECKROTH
FARM EQUIP., INC.
New Ringgold, PA

717-943-2367
STANLEY’S FARM SERVICE

RD, Klingerstown, PA
717-648-2088

SNYDER CO.
ROYER’S FARM SERVICE

RDI, Winfield
New Berlin-Middleburg Hwy.

TIOGA CO.
CANYON IMPLEMENT. INC.

Mansfield, PA
717-724-2731

WAYNE CO.
MARSHALL MACHINERY

Honesdale, PA
717-729-7117

AIRVILLE FARM SERVICE
Airville, PA

717-862-3358
ANDERSON BROTHERS

NewPark, PA
717-382-4272

GEORGE N. GROSS, INC.
RD2, Dover, PA
717-292-1673

WALTER G. COALE. INC
Churchville, MD 21028

301-734-7722


