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What's new
Round bale mover

Hesston Corporation has
announced another new
product for handling large
round bales. The Hesston
Model 5100 bale mover' is a
two-wheeled trailer that
picks up and moves bales
one at a time.

When the trailer is backed
against the bale, two lift
arms, each fitted with a pair
of “star/ wheels, engage the
endsof the bale. A hydraulic
cylinder then lifts the bale.
In transport position, weight
of the bsde is centered over
the trailer axle, permitting
smallhorsepower tractors to
haul bales weighing up to
1500 pounds.
To unload, you simply

lower the lift arms and drive
straight ahead. The mover
returns the bale to its
original storage position,
eliminating secondary
spoilage spots where hay
contacts the ground.

A hydraulic power pack,
operated by any 12-volt
electrical system is
available, so the Hesston
5100 Mover can be used
behind a pickup truck or
other vehicle with a trailer
hitch. Maximum hitch
weight is only 150 lbs. The
5100 Mover can'handld bales
up to 6 feet in diameter and
5% feet. long.

BIRDREPELLER
Newly redesigned Av-

Alarms are now available
for repelling birds and
certain other animals.
Although mostly used in
agricultural pest control
(grapes, sweet com, fruit,
nuts, feedlots, fish farms,
etc.), equipment is also
applicable for wildlife
protection (oil spills and
toxic ponds) and certain
industries. Redesign has
simplified operation and
further added to reliability.
One model is self-contained
with its own loudspeaker for
coverage of up to 10 acres
and more. The larger model
will power four speakers in
switched pairs for coverage
of up to 40 acres and more.

Av-Alarm operation is
fully automatic from a 12
volt storage battery. A
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photocell turns it off at night
(or day for night pests).
During typical operation, a
sound is produced for 8-12
seconds followed by a one to
two minute silent period.
There are four different
sounds There are four dif-
ferent sounds which cycle
four different sounds which
cycle automatically from

’ one period to the next. Such
changes increase repelling
effectiveness.

Av-Alarm sounds are very
loud so as to get distance.
The sounds are well within
the human range. Although
probably too noisy for most
urban use, special speaker
placements and
arrangements can often
reduce noise levels to
tolerable levels in cases
where farm lands are being
encroached upon by
residences.

A 16,000 word booklet,
“Repelling Birds and Other
Pests”, isavailablefrom Av-
Alarm at no cost or
obligation. Write: Av-Alarm
Corporation, Box 2488, 2734
Industrial Parkway, Santa
Maria, California 93454.

GRAIN STORAGE
BUILDING

“Upfast, up strong, and up
to any storage job” is how
Quonset describes its all
new, all-steel, horizontal
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- Model 1054
40 to 80 H.P.

USED DIESEL ENGINES
1- 4 cyl. Perkins i . 371 Detroit
1 - 3 cyl. Deutz 1.471 Detroit
1 - 3 cyl. V.M.

New Holland,R 3
LEIO'S DIESEL SERVICE

PH: (717) 354-8024

grain, storage building just
introduced to the
agricultural market.
Available in whatever size
fits thefanner’s needs, from
an 80 foot by 80 foot by 20foot
for on-farm storage to an 80
foot by* 20 foot with an ap-
prozimate 450,000 bushel
capacity. When the farmer’s
grain is sold, the Quonset
structure can be used for
tractors, field equipment,
supplies or whatever needs
storing, a bonus benefit not
possible with vertical
storage units. Tagged at a
“price-per-capacity” far
lower than most vertical
storagestructures, the Grain
Storage Building in-
corporates all the standard
advantages of Quonset’s
contrction including use of
super-strong 80,000 psi steel
panels which solves sagging,

warping, and ter-
mite infestation problems.
Complete with a full line of
accessories, the grain
storage building is available
in galvanized sheeting or in
the five Quonset colors.

Information on the
Quonset Grain Storage
Building can be obtained
free of charge by writing
Quonset, P. O. Box 40529,
Houston, Texas 77040.

DAIRY PROGRAM
A new computerization of

Wayne’s Dairy Program
that will make maximizer
calculations available to
every Wayne salesperson

Model 1053

H.P.^
Model 1056
80 to 120 H.P.

Complete Sales & Service
For All VM & Detroit Diesel Engines

through local terminals has
been announced. - The
maximizer includes the
proper balance of protein,
energy, fiber, calcium,
phosphorous and
magnesium. These im-
portant factors are all
properly balanced for
maximun milk production
and profit.

Recognizing that each
feeding situation Is unique,
the program considers the
variety of farm roughage
available, the livestock
involved, facilities, en-
vironment and work force.

The unique new computer
program is called Maxine.

EMERGENCY LANTERN

Revere Chemical now
offers Saf-t-lite, a new, lo-
cost rechargeable
emergency light that
automatically lights when
electric power fails.

Revere’s Saf-t-lite plugs
into any wall outlet, and its
recharge indicator bulb
casts a soft light that can be
used as a night light in
homes, offices, computer
installations or factories.
When electrical power fails,
Saf-t-lite automatically
switches to full brightness,
and the lantern remains at
full brightness for nearly an
hour before it needs
recharging. For further
information write

Revere
Chemical Corporation

30875Carter Street
Solon, Ohio 44139

Attn: Roberts. Wilson

Know Where the Activities Will Be?
Read the Farm Women Calendar.

• Flat:, repaired or replaced promptly • Tube valves
replaced 1 • Tires liquid-filled' • Tire sales ft service

for every truck, tractor, and auto on your farm l

PHILIP LEBZELTER & SON CO.

(Independent Goodyear Dealer)
1062 Manheim Pike, Lancaster, PA 17604

NEW IDEA 95 BU.
GROUND DRIVEN SPREADERS

206 New Idea Spreader Available
For Shipment Soon. Limited Supply. Order Yours Today.

SPECIAL PRICE

LANDIS BROS., INC.
1305Manheim Pike, Lancaster, PA 1760*

PH: 717-393-3906


