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had been temporarily lost
because of processing plants
shut down due to the energy
crunch. This was ac-
complished, saidShelhamer,
by contacting processors
whose primary fuel was oil
rather than natural gas.

“In several eases,”
Shelhamer noted, “farmers
were given the opportunity
to move their product to
short-term alternate buyers.
Cooperationat all points was
excellent.”

Shelhamer said that milk
designated for school use
would still be well within
coded dates if the schools
reopened “relatively soon.”
Should those markets be lost
to fanners, he observed, oil-
using processors would
probably still accept the
milk for manufacturing
purposes.

A survey of food stores,
statewide, revealed that
supplies are in “fine con-
dition and reasonable sup-
ply,” Shelhamer said. He
indicated that in some areas
of the state, hay supplies
were down to a seven day
figure but that the shortage
was mainly confined to the
northwest region where a
wet Spring curtailed the hay
harvest last year.

He said hay was “in
generally good” supply in
most of the remainder of
Pennsylvania. Shelhamer
urged all farmers to keep
accuraterecords of losses of
product, materials, and
livestock as “a good step to
take in these cir-
cumstances.”

There has been no in-
dication, as yet, o! possible
federal indemnitiesat a later
date, but Shelhamer urged
record-keeping as a “solid
precautionary measure.”

Shelhamer also mentioned
that a “sizeable portion of
the peach crop, especially
the Jersey variety,” would
be adversely affected by the
freeze and that a shortage
could be expected by con-
sumers. “Fifteen degrees
Fahrenheit is the danger
zone for the Jersey variety,”
he said, “and of course we
have gone far beyond that
point.”

He stated that egg supplies
in Pennsylvania would be
hurt as “they always are by
substained periods of cold”
and that frostbite to animals
could minimize supplies of
milk, although he foresaw no
drastic shortage at this time.

Another area of possible
loss cited by the Columbia
County fanner concerned
apiaries where drifting
snows could cause con-
siderable losses. In addition
to the obvious cutback in
supplies of honey,
Shelhamer said a more
serious potential problem
■■■■

existed: “Fewer bees mean
less pollination in the seed-
propagating process and
this, in turn, may add up to
crop loss in vital areas like
hay and fruit.”

Shelhamersaid his Bureau
of Weights and Measures
had been calibrating oil
trucks but would postpone
such action for now so that
fleets could be utilized to full
effectiveness by dealers. He
asked any farmer who had
problems withfuel to contact
the Department of
Agriculture which would
turn such requests over to
the Governor’s Energy
Resource people im-
mediately. He emphasized
that fuel problems could
include such matters as
frozen water supply pipes.
“In summation,

cLet us never forget
that thecultivation of

the earth is
the most important

labor’ofman.
DANiei. WEBSTER

TIRES—BATTERIES—SHOCKS
FRONT END ALIGNMENT

FOR BETTER MILKING, O
use a dentine!W i VACUUM
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• Eliminates need for multiple controllers
• Sensitive to 01 inch of mercury change
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• Total warranty for one lull year
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Shelhamer said, “we’re
talking long range about
shortages m many crop
areas come harvest time,
about the need for alter-
native energy sources for
food processors as already
urged by the Public Utilities
Commission (PUC) and
about some kind of help for
those farmers hardest hit.

“On the short range scene
we’re talking about getting
roads open to farms, getting
fuel deliveries regularized,
finding secondary markets
where fuel shortages have
closed primary buyers,
assuring the consumer of a
healthful food supply at
retail and keeping all lines of
communication and effort
open with an eye to sowing
problems as, and in some
cases even before, they
occur.”
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The Bou-Matic line of

automatic detachers now
includes three different
models, with varying
degrees of sophistication, to
serve the needs of a wide
variety of dairy operations.

The most advanced of the
line, the “Champion EP,”
features solid state elec-
tronics, automatic or
manual operation, pre-set
time delays, air operated
retract mechanism, positive
vacuum shut-off, automatic
positioning 4-link arm
assembly, indicator lights,
heavy duty retract chain,
snap-swivel claw and hose
connections and electronic
flow sensing. An available
option allows the detacher to
operate entrance and exit
gates and feed bowl covers.

The mid-line “Junior
Champ” detacher is
basically the same as the

“Champion EP” detacher
without the electronic'
automation features.

Hie “little Champ” is a
basic, inexpensive unit that
provides basic detacher
functions, such as milking
mode establishment, milk
flow sensing, positive
vacuum shut-off, time delay
and removal of the milking
unit from the cow.
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• LIFT • LOAD • LEVEL
• GRADE • TILL • DRAG
• BACKFILL • SCRAPE
• MOW • CLEAR SNOW
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For a carpet-smooth, pride of the neighborhood lawn
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• 600 Lb. Lift Capacity
• 6.2 Cu. Ft. Bucket Capacity
• Single Lever Bucket Control
• Case Exclusive Hydraulic Drive
• Hydraulic Attachment Lift Standard
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CASE 108»
tfs all tractor! f

Ask your dealer about
our complete line of
attachments for
four-season versatility

BINKLEY & HURST BROS.
A 133Rothsville Station Road

Lilitz, PA.
Phone 717-626-4705


