
Penna. Poultry Princess Kathy
Bicksler, from Fredericksburg. Pa. is
proudly displaying Best Dozen White
Egg. To her left Jim Hess, Plain &

Fancy. Egg Ranch plant manager
(second shift), to her right marketing
manager Paul Hess Jr., both
displaying Best 5 Dozen White Eggs
won at the 1975 Penna. State Farm
Show.
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Lawrence Arnold, Lebanon, walks his Swine entry

around the ring during the Duroc competition at the
Farm Show.
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Pennsylvania Farm
Lancaster Farming, Saturday. Jan. 11.197515

Show
Not a newcomer to the Farm Show,

J. E. Lanius (front), York RD3,
exhibits his Poland gilt during the
breeding swine competition. Other
exhibitors include Roland Piper,
Benton, RD3, (Middle) and Ed
Brummer (back) Port Royal.
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Les Houck, Kinzers, was one of
several local people who manned a
Farm Show booth selling tickets to
the Pennsylvania Winternational
Tractor Pull.

Debbie Miller, the Lingiestown,
Dauphin County, lass who’s currently
serving as Pennsylvania Dairy
Princess, was an active participant in
this year’s Holstein competition at
the Farm Show. One of her father’s
cows went on to win the champion
Holstein prize.


