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S6A RELEASES
NEW RULES

Due to the continued incidents of
rowdyism exhibited at Highacres’
social functions, the Student Gov-
ernment Association and the Stu-
dent Affairs Office havej together,
reached a decision concerning the
rules and regulations governing
large social functions on campus.

The following five items are the
new laws instituted by the S.G.A.
effective as of the Bth of February,
1968. They are to be adhered to at

all dances and enforced by the So-
cial Committee of the S.G.A. and
by uniformed guards.

I. No person shall be admitted
unless he or she has an identifica-
tion card with a picture on it from (Highacres Cagers seen in action
another college or university. above.)

2, Any qualified patron will be
allowed to bring a guest, male or
female, but, only Hazleton Campus
males will be allowed to bring one
male companion, and only if they
sign for this person and be responsi-
ble for his actions.

The Highacre’s basketball team is
shooting for a winning season this
year in intercampus-league play. So
far, the team is boasting an out-
standing record of seven wins and
three losses and is looking forward
to a fine finish. Coach George Bob-
by says he has hopes that this team
will be playing as the eastern rep-
resentative of the Commonwealth
Campuses in the invitation tourn-
ament to be held at University Park
on March I and 2. This is a show-
down between the two teams select-
ed as eastern and western represent-
atives of the Commonwealth Camp-
uses.

3. All persons attending a dance
will have to be dressed accordingly.
This means jackets and ties or other
appropriate dress for males, and no
slacks or shorts for females.

A. There will be three uniformed
guards on duty. Two in the SUB and
one in the parking lot. Consistent fine playing by Irv Car-

ter, “Blade” Q’Donnel I, Bob Stoffa,
Jim Van Horn, and George Kubica
has produced this season’s worthy

5. No one will be allowed to sit in
his car in the parking lot at any time

CAGERS HAVE
OUTSTANDING YEAR’S

RECORD
record. Highacre’s versatile back-
up men, Dave Searfoss, Joe Ligen-
za, Len Shebosky, Rick Kantor, John
Barletta, and Tom Sterba have also
aided in making the team’s season
successful. Coach Bobby feels the
squad has great initiative and is
working hard with its rugged sched-
ule plus two to three practices per
week. “I am very pleased with the
team’s overall attitude and con-
duct,” he reported, “but my biggest
disappointment has been the lack of
enthusiasm by the fans.” Mr. Bobby
believes that more appreciation and
support should be demonstrated by
the students although he realizes
that it is an impossibility for some
of our working students to make it
tn the games. The Collegian sin-
cerely hopes to have your support
at the next game.

CONGRATULATIONS
TO MR. ESHER

Mr. Frederick N. Esher, a member
of the faculty at Highacres, has been
notified of his promotion from assis-
tant professor to associate professor
of Engineering.

Mr. Esher received his Baccalaur-
eate degree at Stevens Institute of
Technology and his Masters at Co-
lumbia University.
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