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THE MADWOMAN
IS COMING!

On June 7 and 8, 1971 the
curtain will rise in the Classroom
Building Auditorium on the
second student theatrical
production of the year, Jean
Giraudoux’ “The Madwoman of
Chaillot”. This farcical madcap,
to be produced by the
Humanities 4998 Class, will be
directed by Mr. Budney with
assistance from student director,
Ned Irish. Leading the cast will
be the able Mrs. Thelma Barnett,
cast as Countess Aurelia, the
Madwoman. She is joined by
three fellow madwomen played
by Doe Perkowska, Samantha
Bower and Ann Ferrino. Notable
male roles are Thomas Ogden
(President), John Livi
(Ragpicker) and Ed Hoffman
(Prospector) and Michael
Zimmerman (Pierre). A
supporting cast includes Jerry
Till, Flossie Jancsar, Richard
Schroth, Suzanne Jordan, Lynn
Mastrone, Mike Blank, Sandy
Simpson, Ron Haag, Joe
Luciani, Gary Wetterhall, Dave

MADNESS
POWER

Keller, Ned Irish and Millie
Royer. '

The play, produced on
Broadway and revived as the
musical “Dear World”, centers
about the plot of infamous
businessmen to drill for oil in
Paris. Their scheme is foiled by
the aging Countess Aurelia,
whose adventures will surely
captivate the audience. The play
has most recently appeared in
movie form with Katherine
Hepburn in the starring role.

Jean Giraudoux was famous
for his style as the “Theatre of
Language”. His plays’ meanings
are transmitted not by the
action, but by words. Also the
author of such critically
acclaimed plays as “Ondine”,
“The Enchanted”, and
“Siegfried”, Giraudoux died in
1944.

A highly recommended
attraction of your spring term,
“The Madwoman of Chaillot” is
not to be missed! Be there on
June 7 or 8!
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Student On Tuesday, May 11, Capitol
Campus will hold its election for
SGA members and officers. Each
student is permitted to vote for
one senator from his curriculum
and as many other senators as
are allowed by the number of
senators-at-large that will
represent his class.

Students must present their
I.D. cards as proof of eligibility
to vote.

Involvement
In response to the results of

the Student Power Referendum,
the Committee for Student
Involvement has formulated a
proposal consisting of three
recommendations. 1. That a
Community Council (at Capitol
Campus) be established. The
Council would be comprised of
an equal number of
representatives from the faculty,
students and administration,
with each member’s vote
carrying the same weight. The
function of the Council would
be to vote on those decisions
which affect, directly or
indirectly the student body. 2.
That Housing and Food Service
would be under the jurisdiction
of Capitol Campus not
University Park. 3. That students
be included as decision makers
not advisors on the committee
selecting the Provost of Capitol
Campus.

Copies of this proposal are
being submitted to members of
the SGA, faculty and
administration of Capitol, the
Board of Trustees at University
Park, and President Oswald.
Copies for the students are
available at the Round Table,
the library and the SGA office.

It is hoped that students,
administration and faculty
objectively and conscientiously
read these recommendations. It
is the responsibility of the
Student body and their elected
representatives to implement
these proposals if they are to
become a reality.

The following is a list of the
offices and the candidates for
each office:

President/Vice-President:
Oscar Douglas, Social
Science/Patricia Williams,
Elementary Education; Stephen
Wesley, Business/Gary Gold,
Business; Terry Wimmcr, Social
Science/Caddy Labar,
Engineering.

Treasurer: Daniel Ekberg,
Bu siness; Russ Matthews,
Business.

Reporting Secretary: Victoria
Ward, Elementary Education.

Social Science Senator:
Harvey Brown, So. Sc.; Scott
Davis, So. Sc.; Len Thompson,
So. Sc.

Dear President Oswald
I am writing to express my

concern about the recently
proposed post of Provost at the
Capitol Campus. There are two
aspects which 1 believe
necessitate my comment.

First, I am concerned that
students at Capitol are
effectively involved in the search
process for candidates for the
position. In view of your April
sth statement on principles
regarding student participation
in the academic affairs of the
University and in light of your
long standing policy of
encouraging student
participation in matters which
affect them, and in speaking to
our Director, Mr. Coleman
Herpel, I am of the opinion that
you will insist that students shall
be effectively involved. Actual
performance will demonstrate
the accuracy of my opinion.

Second, I believe much of
my, and other interested
students, concern about student
involvement in the matter could
have been avoided if the intent
of your action had been
announced to the Capitol
Campus community at the same
time as it was announced to the
faculty. The closed

HELP WZAP
WZAP was scheduled to go

on the air on April 19 but the
console went haywire on the
previous Saturday. 1 am now
looking for someone who can
take the console back to Low
Power Broadcast Company in
Fraser, Pa., so it can be repaired
and the station can go on the air.
This is what is holding up the
station from broadcasting. If
you are going by Fraser, Pa.
please let me know so that you
can take the console down with
you and help this problem
perplexed station. Contact me,
John Musto, at 944-4232
anytime. Please help YOUR
Radio Station.

P.S. LPB will not fix the
console if it is sent by mail.

announcement and the rapid
search process created in many
of us the infamous, and too
frequently accurate, “railroad
job” image.

After speaking with Mr.
Herpel and Dr. Duane Smith, my
concerns were eased as I learned
of the nature of your specific
charge to the search team, viz.,
to include student input. I
believe that the matter will work
out in an acceptable manner, but
I feel compelled to send you
these comments.

John A. Musto
Station Manager

Tutors Needed
Can you give two hours of

your time for those in need?
The Tutoring Program for

students in Middletown is held
every Monday evening from
6:30 to 8:30 p.m. at the
Community Youth Center,
adjacent to Saint Michael’s
Episcopal Church, Middletown.

Thank you for your
attention.

Peacefully,
For more information

contact Richard Bush 944-5723.
Lee Levan, President

The Capitol Campus SGA

S. G. A. ELECTIONS -

May 11 !

Business Senator: Mike
Ferrazzano, Business; Jerry
Sea len. Business.

It is important that I indicate
to the readers that while I was
writing this article, all the names
of the candidates were not yet
submitted. The final deadline tor
candidate entries will have been
Tuesday, May 4, several days
after the newspaper goes to
print. PLEASE NOTE: The
candidates not named here, if
any, will be posted throughout
the halls.

It is equally important that I
urge you to vote lor the
candidates of your choice on
election day. Read the policy
statements from each
presidential candidate printed on
page three of this paper. And
follow the campaign. It is
through being informed about
each candidate and voting for
your choices that you influence
and help to develop an cltcctivc
student government.

Tote!
“THE POST OF PROVOST”

Dear Mr. Levan
Thank you for your

thoughtful letter of April 18. I
want to assure you that there
will be an appropriate manner
for student input to the search
committee for the new provost.

Sincerely,
John W. Oswald

’’CARNIVAL”
ATTENTION!!!

There will be a general
meeting of all groups that arc
participating in the carnival on
Wednesday, May 12th, at one
o’clock in the faculty-student
gallery, W-107.

The following organizations
are requested to have a
representative at the meeting:
XGl’s, Cheerleaders, Senior Ball
Committee, Business Club,
Resident Student Council, Ski
Club, 8.5.U., Sorority, Faculty
Wives, S.G.A., and Head Shop.

It is imperative that each of
the aforementioned groups have
a representative at the meeting
to iron out possible last minute
problems.

Len Thompson
Carnival Chairman

TONY PETRUCCI
CANDIDATE

FOR
HARRISBURG
CITY COUNCIL

FRIDAY MAY 7, 11:00
IN THE AUDITORIUM
INFORMAL TALK ANO

Q AND A PERIOD

Wednesday, May 5, 1971


