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STATH CELEBRITIES.
Wayne MacVeagh, Attorney Gen

eral or tne united states.
THE CARF.EK AND CHARACTER OP A

REPRESENTATIVE PENNSYLVANIAN
' AND A POLITICAL REFORMER MEN
TAL AND PERSONAL TRAITS OF MR,
MACVEAGH.

Philadelphia Frena.
Standing at tbe front table in the

Supreme Court-roo- almost anv ilnv
wf the term, you will see the subject of
mis BKetcn.. tie is unciersizeu in every
way, except that his head is somewhat
larger than tbe average man's. His
body does not do htm justice. It is
small, apparently frail, hiirh striinc
and nervous. As he raises his hand to
make a gesture and the cuff pulls back,
you notice that the wrist isdolicate and
that the tendons are large and promi-
nent. It is a fine, small organism, the
basilar nature not making large drains
upon tne system, tne strengtu and nu
trition going to reinforce the moral and
intellectual wan. He is of a species
ucn as every one Knows some speci-

men of men of force of character and
strength of brain, whose nerves and
will carry them further and enable
them to do better work than the mus
eles of most men. The impression that
the face gives you tells the story of the
character, i but of the Attorney Gen
eral is strong and intellectual. There
is no weakness there, and there is nev
er a mask ou it. It is what could be
called a large-feature- d face. The nose
fa prominent and aquiline, the eyes are
deep set and frank. The chin and
mouth are strong; the common expres
sion1 la thougnuui. ordinarily you
would take the man for a student. Oc
casionally, when he is aroused you
would realize that he is full of courage
ana oi vigorous, umuiy lighting now
trsr

Bfs Ancestry.
There are a hundred ways in which

he shows his Scotch-Iris- h extraction
in his voice, in bis quick speech which
sometimes, flows like a torrent, in a
certain caustic wit, and in a healthy
batred of shams and hypocrites.
Wayne MacVeagh is a young man yet.
He looks even younger than he is. for
he was bo. a forty-eigh- t years ago, and
Is one or Chester ixmuty's contribu-
tions to tbe notable men of Pennsyl-
vania, having been born at Phoanix-vill- e

in 1833. The stock from which
he sprang has given the State and
country some of its ablest men. Penn-
sylvania cherishes, as it ought, the
strong race which has always been a
full reservoir of power, and bus made
her so prominent in both the world of
politics and the world of business. Mr.
MacVeagh inherits most of the good
qualities of his people, and bus added
to them a larger and wider culture than
most of the race have attained to. He
has flourished among strong men, and
is the intellectual peerof most of them.
But this small man who addresses the
Supreme Court, and who is listened to
so respectfully by the lawyers, is not
popular among the oliticians with
whom he comes daily in contact, now
that he has entered into public life.
There has been little in this life to talk
about for the public. Years ago there
was something of romance lu it; when
Simon Cameron received his defeat at
tbe bands of the young lawyei and saw
him marry his favorite daughter, de-
spite the opposition of her powerful
father. He was just as determined
then, to- accomplish what he desired,
despite Mr. Cameron, us he is now to
overthrow the Cameron methods in
politics.

Ills Training
Mr. MacVeagh was 21 years old when

He graduated from Yale in the class of
63. It was a good' class, and Mac-

Veagh. was notuu worthy of it. He was
a scholar of an independent habit of
mind, and he was a thorough investi-
gator;. He had the industry and the
power of analysis and synthesis which
make men-goo- and successful search-
ers after truth, and which are invalua-
ble to those who have large dealings
with other men, whose business it is to
find out the complexion of other peo-
ple's minds and to make war upon the
vicious classes, whether iu society or
parities. Mr. MacVeagh stood well in
his class.' A man with so high a mind
as bis, and with-hi- disposition to do
bis work thoroughly and as well as it
can be done, must have graduated
among the first men. When he left
college he studied law in the office of
Joseph J. Lewis, a famous lawyer of
Chester County in his day, and he was
admitted to the bur in 1856. The
country now knows Mr. MacVeagh
Has been a successful lawyer. He has
always been a student of his profession,
and that means, of course, that he is a
lawyer of solid acquirements. As the
profession itself would say, be is a
learned, lawyer and among the ablest
of your city of able lawyers. Philadcl- -
nhlans know what that means, and
how blgb a rank a lawyer has when he
is aoreutt or Doth the leadiug rinlmlel
pbla lawyers of the present aud with
those of tradition. When the late
President was once talking with his
Attorney General concerning a man he
wanted to appoint to a vacant Attorney
ueneraisniu ne sain: "ue is a man
like you MacVeagh; a man who loves
the books." That describes precisely
and better thau it could be in many
column the Kind or lawyer Mr. Mac
Veagh is. During all the days of bis
maturity ne has been a scholarly inves
tigator.. He has beeu an industrious
student who has worked in many fields
of learning and lu many directions.
In Bostou be would be called a culti
vated man. I believe that phrase is
sneered at in other parts or the couu
try, but it is a good one, all the same,
and it indicates what I want to say.
There is a good deal of meaning in the
figure of speech wnicn linens a man's
mind to a neiu oi miiu wuicu una ueen
diligently tilled by the husbandman
and Mr. Mac Veagh has beeu a curefu
and industrious husbandman iu his
owd mental vineyard. He is ready
now, not only, to receive the rewards
of "his labors, but to wear the crown
worthily. He has prepared himself to
serve the publio in an otilciul capacity
by serving it well as a lawyer and as a
good citizen; what he has come to he
baa grown fax. He has reached the
Cabluet through a complete develop-
ment No adventitious circumstances
have made Wayne MucVeagh u prom-
inent public man. He made himself
by taking wise advantage of all tbe op-

portunities offered blru, aud be has
grown in Influence by tbs Blow and
sura prooeos of doing, diligently aud
veil all that baa been, entrusted to him.

His Ability as a Lawyer;
lawven. however, do not Interest

lie public very muon until they enter

into public lire. Mr. MacVeagh has
never belonged to the class of his pro-
fession who are constantly before the
Courts in what may be called 'star
cases." His private practice in West
Chester was large, but ever since his
marriage with Miss Cameron, which
was his Second marriage, he has been
a railroad lawyer. It is generally re-
ported in the newspapers, from day to
day, that Mr. MacVeagh will retire
from the Cabinet to resume his place
as counsel for the Pennsylvania Kail-roa- d

Company. He is not counsel for
that Company, and, I believe, never
has been, except incidentally. His
brother-in-la- w, the present Senator
Cameron, had at one time control of
the stock of the Northern Central Rail-
road Company, and Mr. MacVeagh
was its counsel. When the Pennsyl-
vania Company finally bought the con-
trolling interest In the roan, Mr. Mac-
Veagh continued to be its counsel.
His ability as a lawyer has made him
the counsel for the road and for the
Camerons. That family does not em-
ploy legal talent on the basis of rela-
tionship; they do business entirely on
business principles, and while they
would, other things being equal, prefer
a relative or connection, the other
things must be clearly equal. Mr. Mac-
Veagh Is probably one of the best rail-
road lawyers iu the country. If he
were not, he would certainly not re-
sume his place. The fact that a law
yer has been Attorney General of the
United States isnotof itself a sufficient
recommendation to the great corpora-
tion by which Mr. MacVeagh is em
ployed at what I assume Is a handsome
salary. There must be something
stronger than mat in his tavor.

In Public Life.
Mr. MacVeagh 's public life has been

a short and. brilliant one. I do not
mean to intimate by that that it is by
anv means ended. Judging from the
time during which most other men of
Mr. Macv eagh's power remain in pub-
lic life, this new career bas only just
opened for him. I cannot help think
ing that Mr. Mac V each has a future
before him, and the 1'rem may have
the satisfaction of supporting him as
the reform candidate for Governor
next vear. Whether he shall attain
that distinction or not, it would be un
wise to assume that Mr. MacVeagh will
go out of politics when he goes out of
the Cabinet. That is not in the nature
of things. He began public life by at
tending to the duties of citizenship.
He was always what may really be
called a good citizen. None of the du-
ties of politics were beneath his con-
scientious attention. He asked no re
wards; he ran for no office; he never
begged for nominations or votes; but
he attended faithfully to whatever
came to his nana. iur. aiacveugn
never neglected a public duty, and I
don't know that he ever asked for a
Dublic honor or reward. He served
contentedly enough, If one may judge
anything from appearances, iu the
ranksof citizens, wnen tne war oroKe
out he was willing toserve his country
and his State as a soldier. It was his
first appearance out of the ranks, and
it is noteworthy that this appearance
meant sacrifice und not large opportun-
ity for urlorv. He served as Major of a
cavalry troop that had the disagreeable
and dangerous duty assigned it or
guarding the southern borderof Penn-
sylvania. He was in a part of the
country liable to be raided and which
was raided by the con leaeraies. i nere
were no ureal buttles in which to win
military fame; there were any quanti-
ty of hazardous enterprises, and the
surroundings of a border and guerilla
warfare are always dangerous. jir.
MacVeaeh returned to private life so
modestlv and ouietlv. and has always
(reserved so much silence on the sub-ec- t

of his army experience, that pro-tub- ly

very few people outside the circle
of his immediate acquaintance kiiuw
that during the War of the Rebellion
he won honorably the title of Major.
It is certain tnat no one calls him
"Mnior" in Washington, or by any
military title. Ill fact. Mr. Muc eagu
seems to resent the mention of the fact
that anvthlnir he may have done en
titles him to any special honor or re-

ward. He brushes aside, apparently
with some impatience, suggestions that
he Is to be credited with anything he
has done in a public way. However
much a man like Mr. MacVeagh may
restrain himself, sooner or later he is
bound to come to the surface in public
affairs. He was born with a love lor
the things that concern the people.
From its organization he was devotedly
attached to the Republican party, and
lit was devoted to it because he believ
ed its advancement to power would be
for the best interests oi the country.
If there is a Republicau in the country
who joined the organization because he
believed in its principles, it is Mr. Mac-

Veaeh. I think be never hud any po
litical ambition to satisfy by espousing
the cause of the party he has served so
long aud on which he has made no de
mands. 1 do not mean to say mat ue
lias not had, or that he now lias not,
any political ambition. He would be
a strange man, and, I am inclined to
say, not a good citizen, who, naving
the interest in public questions that
Mr. MacVeagh has, would still refuse
to give bis strength and talents to the

service. Mr. MucVeugh
Cublic an honorable umbition.an am-

bition to stand well not only with those
among whom he lives, but with the
larger constituency which judges of
men by the esteem in which they are
held at home. He probably, like all
men of power, would gladly exercise
the ability to administer public affairs
which he possesses iu a very marked
degree; but he will attain bis ambition
by the simple art of doing what he is
asked to do thoroughly well, and by
always espousing the cause of honest
government, ine cause oi me peupio
aaainst the machinations of the con
trollers and manipulators ot the ma
chine. This simplicity ot purpose and
method constitutes the power oy wnicu
Mr. MacVeagh has riseu to a promi
nent place among tbe public men of
the country.

As a Politician.
He is a good politician in the sense

that be is wise enough to have perfect
confidence in tbe honesty ami right
intentions of the people. He has the
courage which comes from fuith in the
future. He knows that time is on the
side of those who fight for honesty and
the people, and those who contend for
place and power craftily and dishonest-
ly must be overwhelmed iu the end.
In that way be is a good politician.
Perhaos if he warped bis moral nature
sufficiently he aiight be a good politic-
ian in the lowest sense of that much- -

abused word. There is a large amouut
of craft in tbe race from which lis
springs, and the politics of Pennsyl-
vania have not always been beneficial-
ly affected by it. The reader will un-
doubtedly be able to recall the names
of descendants of the Scotch-Iris- h race
in Pennsylvania whose influence lu
party politics bas not been always for
the best. Mr. MacVeagh's cunning,
however, bas beeu turned in another
direction, and it bus been of great ser-
vice tobiin in the contests be has been
called upon to wage from time to tin.
against the wrong-doer- s of his own
party. Everyone at all familiar with
ins campaign or '03 reoouecuj now

skillfully Mi-- . MacVeagh performed
bis duties as Chnirman of the Republi-
can State Committee of Pennsylvania.
It was his first entrance into official
life, for the control of tbe machinery
of a great party and the leadership of
the organization in an Important cam-
paign gives a man a public office more
important than most of those that are
recognized by the statutes, and whose
incumbents are paid from the public
Treasury. The fame that he achieved
by the management of the Pennsyl-
vania campaign sent him as Minister
to Turkey, a post that be occupied only
two years. Such a place as the Turk-
ish mission is could not have suited
very well a man of Mr. MacVeagh 'b
active mental haoits. He was not
made to idle life away on the shores of
the Bosphorus when active duties were
pressing in other directions.

Why lie Resigned the Ministry to

There were other and more potent
causes, too, which induced him to
leave the public service. Those who
know Mr. MacVeagh best know thatne will never remain in office under an
Administration in which he has not
perrect confidence. Fublicofflce means
to him a public duty. He is not there
to be honored or because he has served
bis party well: he is there to do his
duty to the public thftt employs him.
I have had many times excellent rea
son to doubt the honesty and the pa- -
iriiiiiaiii ui pruiexsionai reiormers. I
have never had reason to doubt Mr.
MacVeagh, and I think he is truly a
reformer. He could not have accepted
ollice uuder General Grant. It was
the methods of the machine under the
Administration he had done so much
to elect that drove Mr MacVeagh first
into hostility to the machine, and lu
1872 into apen hostility. But Mr Mac-Vcaa- it

skipped his open revolt when
the Liberal movement died. He never
went over to the Democracy. All'his
political affections are centered in the
organization which came Into being in
the year when he reached bis majori-
ty, and for which he has worked faith-
fully and diligently for these many
yeurs. His desire is that the Republi-
can party shall retain its present prom-
inence iu Federal and State affairs; his
honest belief is that it. cannot continue
to do so if the machine remains in
power. Like the Press, he is fighting
crooked methods and bad men lusid
tbe organization, because be wants no
only to preserve tbe organization but
to increase its power and influence.

A Notable Incident of His Career.
Mr. MacVcagh's principal appear-

ance in politics, before he was made
Attorney General, was as one of the
Commissioners to Louisiana, whose
work was to arrange the treaty by
which the Nichols Government came
Into power in the State. The country
knows that story by heart, and I shall
not repeat it here. His
sioners found him of very great assist
ance In the performance of the task
which hud beeu assigned them. His
astuteness, his clear perception of whut
was needed, his thorough knowledge
or men, tne unhesitating mauner in
which he approached all who could
shed light on the situation in Louis
iana, and the bolduess with which he
conducted the investigation, contribu
ted more tuau an tbe labors of the oth
ers to the successful conclusion of the
mission of the Commission.

As a Cabinet Member.
Themanneriii whichMr. MacVeaeh

went into President Garfield's Cabinet
is characteristic of bis political career,
ne did not represent auy powertui po
litical influence; he was ttie choice of
the President against the choice of the
machine influences of his State. As
the President himself declared, lie was
bis own man in the Uabluct. it was
bis own capacity, his own character.
his own services to the cause of good
government rather than to the cause of
a political party, that made Air. Muc- -

Veagh's political advancement possi
ble. There are few men in public life
who have won their way to the front
by so persistent and consistent a per
forniance of public duties. Time was
on his side, aud the future has made
good all its promises to the inau whose
care tor what was to come was snowu
in hU devotion to the demands of the
present. With those who came in
contact with him Mr. MacVeagh is a
popular muH. He is frank sometimes
to brusqueuess. You cannot look him
in the eye and not believe every word
he tells you. He is one of the public
men who can look you squarely in the
eye. If he does not want to give you
information he tells you so lraukly
He is, above all things, a sincere mau.
He acts on his sincere beliefs, and he
never hesitates to do what he thinks
the necessities of the occusion demand
He is, iu other words, bold but not
rash. He is not one of those who rush
in where wise men fear to tread. He
is cautious aud Wheu the
occasion comes he is ready to meet it.
aud friendships and even family ties
are never permitted to stand in the
way of the performance of his public
duties, bociaiiy, Mr. Macveugh is a
delightful man. He is thoroughly
gen nine and unaffected. He meets
men in the same spirit in which they
come to him. He gives bis confidence
cautiously, but when he does give it he
gives it completely.and honestly. He
deceives no one, as is too commonly
the habit of politicians, by pretending
to impart confidences wheu they are
merely concealing the truth.

Ills Home and Its Surroundings.
There ure few men in public life who

seem so completely domestic as Mr,
MacVeagh. He is always at home ut
ter office hours. Pb'.ladelphians know
how he lives in their city. Here be
has leased the large house built and
owned by General Wil
liams. The house is in a beautiful part
of the city and iu one of its best neigh-
borhoods. It was built to gratify the
social ambitions of Mrs. Williams, one
of the most brilliant women of the
Grant regime. It is a great double
house, with an Immense parlor or su
loon, and doubtless, were Mr. Mac
Veugh to remain in tbe Cabinet, it
would be tbe scene of some brilliant
entertainments during the coming
winter. Mr. MacVeagh has several
children, two young men having al-

most, if not quite, reached their major-
ity. One of them is studying law at
Columbia College Law School in the
City of New York.

HENRY U. KELSON.

Set Back 42 Tears.

"I was troubled for many years with
Kidney Complaint, Gravel, dc., my
blood became thin; I was dull and
inactive; could hardly crawl about;
was an old worn out man all over;
could get nothing to help me, until I
got Hop Bitters, and now I am a boy
again, my blood and kidneys art all
right, and 1 am us active as-- a man of
30, although I am 72, and I have no
douot it will do as well for others of
my age. It Is worth a trial. (Father.)
Sundji Mtrcury.

- Sheriff's Sales.
BY VIRTUE OF SUNDRY writs

or nen facias, alias fieri facias, vendi-
tioni exponas, levari facias, and testa
turn fieri facias Issued out of the Court
flf flnmmrhr. T .f Viir HnimfM - J
to me directed, I THOMAS SULLLva, High Sheriff of said county, do
hereby give notice that I will expose
to publlosaleor outcry at the

office, in Rldgway. at one
o'clock P. M.,on
MONDAY, NOVEMBER 21ST, 1881.

the following described real estate, to-w- itt

All the right, title, interest, claim or
demand whatsoever of defendant in, to
or out of all that certain piece, parcelor lot of land situate, lying and being
In the township of Fox, county of Elk
and State of Pennsylvania, bounded
and descaibed as follows: Beginning
at a post on the Milesburg and Smeth-por- t

turnpike, four hundred and ten
and one-ha- lf (410J) feet from a post at
iue southwest corner of a dwelling
house known as the C. R. Earley
house; thence along said turnpike
south eighty-nin- e degrees (89) east
seventy-fiv- e (75) feet to a post; thence
north one degree (l8) west two hund-
red (200) feet to place of beginning,
contaning thirty-liv- e hundredths acres
of laud, and being lot No. 8 on the
pian or jots in the town of Earley,
as laid out by the said C. R. Earley,
upon which there is erected one two-stor-y

frame house about 24x32 feet,
with shed attached.

Seized and taken In execution as the
property of J. E. Homing, William
Horning, Catharine Miller and Jane
Iddings, heirs of John Horning, de-
ceased, and Elizabeth Earley and C.
R. Earley, her husband, and Esther
Ernigu aud George Emlgh, her hus-
band, the sad Elizabeth Earley aud
Esther Emlgh being heirs-atrla- w of
John Horning, deceased, at the suit of
S. 8. Lucoreand Rufus Lucore, her
husband.

ALSO All the right, title, Interest,
claim or demand whatsoever of de-
fendant in, to or out of the undivided
one-ha- lf of all that certain tract of
land situate in Spring Creek town-
ship, Elk county, Pennsylvania,
known the Jas. Crow warrant, boun-
ded as follows, t: On the east,
south and west by lands formerly be-
longing to Rbines A Dilworth, and on
tbe north by lands known as the Wil
son warrant, containing one hundred
liuu; acres, more or less, and being the
same land conveyed to the said Philip
Ittel by deed from John Chamherlain
and Peter Chamberlain, guardians,
dated 19th November, 1870, recorded
at Ridgway In deed book "T," 447, &o.

eteizeo and taken in execution as the
property-o- f Philip Ittel at the suit of
W. C. Healy. .

ALSO. All the rlffht. title, interest
claim or demand whatsoever of de
fendant in. to or out of all that certain
lot of land situate In the township of
Benzinger, county of Elk and State of
Pennsylvania, bounded aud described
as follows: Beginning at the south-
east corner of lot of Michael O'Douell
and north line of Washington street;
thence north along east lino of said
O'Donell one hundred and forty (140)
feet to an alley; thence east along
south line of said alley fifty (50) feet to
a post; thence south along lands of J.
B. Sterley and parallel with west line
of the above described lotone hundred
and forty (140) feet to a post ou Wash-
ington street; thence west along north
line of said street fifty (50) feet to the
place of beginning, containing seven
thousand (7,000) square feet of land,
more or lew, upon which there is
erected one frame house about 20x24
feet, two (2) stories high, and well of
water.

Seized and taken in execution as the
property of Thomas Rochford at the
suit of Joseph Wilhelm.

ALSO. All the right, title, interest,
claim or demand whatsoever of de-
fendant in, to or out of all that certain
tract of laud situat in Ridgway town-
ship, Elk county, Pennsylvania,
bounded as follows; Beginning at a
beech, situate on the west side of the
Smethport and Milesburg turnpike
road and on the south line of warrant
No. 4380; thence west one hundred
and thirty-fou- r (134) rods to a cucum-
ber tree; thence north one hundred
and fifty-si- x (156) rods to a post;
thence east seventy (70) rods to a post;
thence south sixty one (61) rods to a
post; thence southeasterly along the
line of said turnpike to the place of
begin nlng. containing eigh ty-sl- x acres,
more or less, upon which there is
erected one two-stor-y frame bouse
about 30x32 feet, and young growing
orchard and well of water.

Seized and taken In execution as the
property of Maurice Sherman at the
suit of J, S. Hyde.

ALSO. All the right, title, Interest,
claim or demand whatsoever of de-
fendant in, to or nut of all that certain
lot of land situate in the township of
Horton, county of Elk and State of
Pennsylvania, bounded and described
as follows: On the south by lands of
the Noble Coal and Oil Company; on
the east by lands of the Noble Coal
and Oil Company; on the north by
lands or Wm. Bromley; on the west
by lands of unknown persons, contain-
ing seventy-fiv- e (75) acres, more or less.
known as the William Phalen home
stead.

Seized and taken in execution as the
property of Eliza Phalen at tbe suit of
Catharine Phaleu.

ALSO. All the right, title, Interest.
claim or demand whatsoever of de
fendant In, to or out of that certain
tract or parcel of land situate in Fox
township, Elk county, Pennsylvania,
beginning at the north west corner of
wairaut 4900; thence south eighty (80)
rods; thence east eighty (80) rods;
thence north (80) rods; thence
west eighty (80) rods to the place of be
ginning, containing lorty (4U) acres,
more or less, being part of warrant
4900.

ALSO. All that certain parcel or
tract of land situate, lying and being
in Fox township, Elk couuty. Penn-
sylvania, bounded and described as
follows: On tbe north by warrant
4900; on the south by warrant 4901: on
the east by lands unkuown, and on
the west by supposed vacant lands,
containing ninety (90) acres aud one
hundred (100) perches, with allowance
of six (6) per cent, for roads, Ac, iu
Uistrlct JNo. 4. as ifran ted to John
Tudor by warrant dated 30th Janurry,
A. D. 1866, upon which Is erected one
two-stor-y frame house 22x32 feet, and
an old log barn. -

beized and taken In execution as the
property of Peter Hollobauirh at the
suit of John Tudor and bis wife, Eliz-
abeth Tudor, now for use of tbe Over-
seers of Poor of the District of .Fox.

TERMS OF SALE.
Tbe following must be strictly com

plied with when tbe property is struck
uu:

1. All bids must be naid in full ex
cept where tbe plaintiff or other lieu
creditor becomes tbe purchaser, in
which case the costs on tbe writs must
be paid, as well as all Ileus prior to
thai of the purchaser, and a duly cer--

titled list of Hens shall be furnished.
including mortgage searches on tbe
property soia, together with such Hen
creditor's receipt" for the amount of
tne proceeds or tne sale, or such por-
tion thereof as he shall appear to be
enutiea to. . . . .a a 11 1 ii.aii mien hoi Beuiea immediately
will be continued until six o'clock P.

at wnicn time all property not
semen ior win again be put up, arid
soiu u tuc cAieuse ana risK or theperson to whom it was first struck off,
and who, in case of deficiency at such

e, shall make good the same, and
in no Instance will the deed he nr.
sented in court for confirmation unless
the bid Is actually settled for with the
onerin asoove stated.

THOMAS SULLIVAN.SherlfT.
Sheriff's Offlce.Rldgway.Pa., 1

October 81. 1881. f
See Purdon's Digest, Ninth Edition,

pag 4u; tsmitn s orms, 884.

JTA T,T7S
VEGETABLE SICILIAN

HAIR
REXTEWER.

Every year increases the popularity
of this valuable Hair Preparation;
wnicn is due to merit alone, we can
assure our old patrons that it is kept
fully up to its high standard ; end it
is the only reliable and perfected prep
aration lor restoring Gray ob i aded
Hair to its youthful color, making it
soft, lustrous, and silken. The scalp,
by its use, becomes white and clean.
It removes all eruptions and dandruff,
and, by its tonio properties, prevents
the hair from failing out, as it stimu
lates and nourishes tbe bair-gland- s.

By its use, the hair grows thicker and
stronger. In baldness, it restores the
capillary glands to their normal vigor,
and will create a new growth, except
in extnnne old age. It is the most
economical Hair Duessino ever used,
as it requires fewer applications, and
gives the hair a splendid, glossy ap-
pearance. A. A. Hayes, MJ), State
Assayer of Massachusetts, says, "The
constituents are pure, and carefully
elected for excellent quality; and!

consider it the Best Preparation
for its intended purposes."
Moid by ail DruggiiU, and Dealert (a Utdicint.

Pries One Dollar.

Buckingham's Dye
FOB THE WHISKERS.

As our Renewer in many cases re-

quires too long a time, and too much
are, to restore gray or faded Whisk-

ers, we have prepared this dye, in one
preparation', which will quickly and
effectually accomplish this result. It
is easily applied, and produces a color
which will neither rub nor wash off.
Sold by all Druggists. Price Fifty
Cents.

Manufactured by R. P. HALi A CO

Elk County Court Proclamation.
WHEREAS, the Hon. Wm. D.

Brown. President Judge for theThirty-sevent- h

Judicial District of Pennsyl-
vania, and Julius Jones, aud George
Ed. Weis, Esquires, Associate Justices
in Elk county, have issued their pre-
cepts, to me directed, for the time of
holding of the Orphans' Court, Court
of Common Pleas, General Quarter
Sessions and Oyer and Terminer, at
Ridgway, for the county of El k on
the THIRD MONDAY IN NOV.
1881, being the 21st day of the month,
to continue one week.

Notice Is therefore given to the Cor-
oner, Justice of the Peace and Con-
stables in and for the county of Elk,
to appear in their own proper persons,
with their records, inquisitions, and
remembrances, to do those things
which of their offices and in their be-
half appertain to be done, and all wit-
nesses and other persons prosecuting
in behalf of the Common wealth against
any person or persons, are requested to
be then and there attending, and not
to depart at their peril. Jurors are
requested to be punctual in their at-
tendance at tbe appointed time, agree-
able to notice.

Given under my hand and seal, at
the Sheriff's office, in Ridgway, the
8d day of Nov. in the year of our
Lord one thousand eight hundred and
eightv-on- e.

THOMAS SULLIVAN. Sheriff.

Estate Notice.
Estate of Catherine Wilson, late of
Fox towuship, Elk county, Pa.,
deceased. Notice is hereby given
that letters testamentary have been
granted to the undersigned upon the
above named estate. All persons in-
debted to said estate are requested to
make immediate payment, and those
having legal claims against the same
to present them without delay, in
proper order, for settlement.

P. W. HAYS, Administrator.
oc27-6- t

Register's Notice.
Notice is hereby given that the fol-

lowing accounts will be presented at
the next Orphans' Court for confirm
ation:

i. final account or Lhas. Weis. ex
ecutor of the estate of Francis Renner,
late of St. Mary's borough, Elk
county, Pa., deceased.

2. Final account of Ignatius Garner,
administrator of tbe estate of Matbias
Benzinger, late of Baltimore, Md
deceased.

Fred. ScHceNiNO, Register.

Marble and slate mantles fur-
nished and set by

W. S. Service. Agt.

Note paper and envelopes at the
Advocate office.

you want a set or springs o
any sort or size go to C. Bowers.

The New York Store next door
to the post-offic- e, is the place where
new goods are being received every
day. Clothing in endless variety,
cheay as tbe cheapest. Boots, shoes,
hats and caps, In varied assortment
Dress goods, and fancy goods, a grand
new display. Dont forget tbe place.

Probably tbe largest cattle in
America are now on exhibition at the
Frauklin county talr, raised and fat-
tened by George Ayrhult, of Pough-keepsi- e,

N. Y., heaviest weighing
4,000 and its mate 8,600 pounds.

For all urinary and female com-LaJo- ts

take ManalLn.
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THE ELK CO. ADVOCATE

DEVOTED TO THE INTEREST
OF THE PEOPLE OF

ELK COUNTY.

Having an extended circulation It Is

the best advertising medium.

THE OLDEST PAPER IN THE
COUNTY.

ESTABLISHED in 1850.

TERMS, - $2 A YEAR.

:o:- -

JOB DEPARTMENT.

We print
Note-head- s,

Bill-head- s,

Letter-head- s.

Envelopes,

Cards,
Tags.

Cheaper than the cheapest,
and on shoiiest notice.

Orders by mail promply
attended to.

Address,
Henry 'A. Parsons, Jr.

Ridtway JPa.

List of Jarora.

The follow! og Is the list of Juror
drawn for the November term of court
commencing Monday November theSl,. .

GRAND JURORS.

Benezette Jacob English, Geo. T.
Roth rock.

Benzinger Michael Schubert, Drlus
Hanes, George Fritz, August Fletter
man.

Fox John George, John Halts.
Highland John Ellaeon, John Er

leson, Jr.
Horton Henry Reedy, Stephen

Fox, James T. Yale. - t ; '.

Jay Charles Kellogg, ; v
Jones John Klin k.
Millstone G. C. T. Huff.
Ridgway Thomas M'Mahon, Ml

chael Luby, Miner Wilcox, M. E. Lea-
ser.

St. Mary's John Fochtman, An-
thony Auman, Henry Luhr, Anthony
Jesbergcr.

TRAVERSE JURORS',

Benezette D. E. Hewitt, John A.
Murray.

Benzinger John B. Geltner, John
Eckert, Jr., Florence Leber, George
Nissell, Conrad Friedel. .

Fox Michael M'Mackin, Orman
Allen, Andrew Schriver, Jos.Schrlver,
Marcus Anslnger, Michael Brehm, .

David Pontius.
Horton Isaac Graham, O. A. Sib-

ley,
Jay John Wheeler. "' ' "

Ridgway James H. Ross, John C.
Egler, Milton Sleight, George Bllssel,
Maurice Sherman, Page R. Prindle,
John Winterbottom, E E. Wlllard,
John Young, Sr., W. A. Derby, E. C.
Barrett.

St. Mary's Joseph Kraft, Jr., Peter
Wegemer, John Einmett, Chas. Gar-
ner, Charles Lubr, Charles Weis, Jos.
Lechner.

Spring Creek David HofT.

List of Cause.
Set down for trial at the November

Term of the Court of Common Pleas
of Elk County, commencing on Mon-
day, November 21st:

1. Frank Pol I man vs. Morg ester A
Jackson. No. 75, September Term,
1879. :

2. The township of Fox vs. John
M'Mackin etal. No. 88, May Term,
1880.

8. Oliven Dodge vs. L. Fegley 4e
Co. No.2, November Term, 1880.

4. Daniel Euwer et al. vs. C. R.
Earley et al. No. 45, January Term
1881.

6. Ellis Lewis vs. C. R. Sexton.
No. 8, May Term. 1881.

6. W. H. Osterhout vs. Thos. Sul-

livan, sheriff, Jcc, et al. No. 28, May
Term, 1881.

7. Joseph Wilhelm vs. Jas. H.
English. No. 72, May Term, 1881.

8. The Benedictine Society vs. C.
R. Earley et al. No. 91, May Term,
1881.

9. Oliven Dodge vs. Jacob Smith et
al. No. 100, May Term, 1881.

10. W. H. Schram vs. W. 8.
Service. No. 22, September Term,
1881.

ELK CO. ADVOCATE RATES.
YEARLY ADVERTI8INO.

One Column Oik Year .....J).00
One-lin- ir Column One Yeur..... .,. 4i. 00
One-fourt- h Column One Year... .i&jm
One-eigh- th Column One Year. ............15.00

TK A N8IKNT ADVERTISING.
One Square One Wee .1.00
One Square Two VetkH..... ....l.50One Squiiro Three Weeks...- - ........2.00

Each additional Insertion 50 cents a aquare
each week.

LOCAL ADVERTISING.
Ten centx a line first iiiHcrtiom Ave cent m

line for eiich additional Insertion.
HENEY A. PABSOKS.JE., Proprietor.

GET THE BEST !

IW ALL OTHERS! 1

Every Style & Price:
Guaranteed TJnequal 1

FOB.

OPERATION.
ECONOfCTYT

DURABILITY and
WORKMANSHIP.

Improvements ani Conveniences fboal is
so others

Altjays Reliable.
POPULAR EVERYWHERE..

For Sals In Ever City and Toos
la the-- United StaUa.

STOVE
SIGN

No. 42 Main St.
v

A FULL, LINE BUILD- -
HARDWLRE,

STOVES AND

GOODS At POPULAR
ittlCES.

W. S. Service, Agt


